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THE MAGUS, 
CONTAINING 

MAGNETISM, 
AND 

CABALISTICAL MAGIC. 
TO WHICH IS ADDED 

A TREATISE 

ON 

PROPHECY, PROPHETIC DREAMS AND INSPIRATION. 

BOOK II. PART I. 

MAGNETISM. 

IN our following Treatise of Magnetism we have collected and arranged in order some 
valuable and secret things out of the writings of that most learned chemist and 
philosopher Paracelsus, who was the ornament of Germany and the age he lived in. 
Likewise we have extracted the very marrow of the science of Magnetism out of the 
copious and elaborate works of that most celebrated philosopher (by fire) Van Helmont, 
who, together with Paracelsus, industriously promulgated all kinds of magnetic and 
sympathetic cures, which, through the drowsiness, ignorance, unbelief, and obstinacy of 
the present age, have been so much and so totally neglected and condemned; yet, 
however impudent in their assertions, and bigotted to their own false opinions, some of 
our modern philosophers may be, yet we have seen two or three individuals, who, by dint 
of perseverance, have proved the truth and possibility of Magnetism, by repeated and 
public experiments. Indeed the ingenious invention of the Magnetic Tractors prove at 
once that science should never be impeded by public slander or misrepresentation of facts 
that have proved to be of general utility. And we do not doubt but that we shall be able to 
shew, by the theory and practice delivered in the sequel, that many excellent cures may 
be performed by a due consideration and attentive observance of the principles upon 
which sympathy, antipathy, magnetic attraction, &c. are founded; and which will be fully 
illustrated in the following compendium: 

We shall hasten to explain the first principles of Magnetism, by examining the magnetic 
or attractive power. 

 



CHAP. I. 

 THE MAGNETIC, OR ATTRACTIVE POWER OR FACULTY. 

AS concerning an action locally at a distance, wines do suggest a demonstration unto us: 
for, every kind of wine, although it be bred out of co-bordering provinces, and likewise 
more timely blossoming elsewhere, yet it is troubled while our country vine flowereth; 
neither doth such a disturbance cease as long as the flower shall not fall off from our 
vine; which thing surely happens, either from a common motive-cause of the vine and 
wine, or from a particular disposition of the vine, the which indeed troubles the wine, and 
doth shake it up and down with a confused tempest: or likewise, because the wine itself 
doth thus trouble itself of its own free accord, by reason of the flowers of the vine: of 
both the which latter, if there be a fore-touched conformity, consent, co-grieving, or 
congratulation; at least, that cannot but be done by an action at a distance: to wit, if the 
wine be troubled in a cellar under ground, whereunto no vine perhaps is near for some 
miles, neither is there any discourse of the air under the earth, with the flower of the 
absent vine; but, if they will accuse a common cause for such an effect, they must either 
run back to the stars, which cannot be controuled by our pleasures and liberties of 
boldness; or, I say, we return to a confession of an action at a distance: to wit, that some 
one and the same, and as yet unknown spirit, the mover, doth govern the absent wine, and 
the vine which is at a far distance, and makes them to talk and suffer together. But, as to 
what concerns the power of the stars, I am unwilling, as neither dare I, according to my 
own liberty, to extend the forces, powers, or bounds of the stars beyond or besides the 
authority of the sacred text, which faith (it being pronounced from a divine testimony) 
that the stars shall be unto us for signs, seasons, days, and years: by which rule, a power 
is never attributed to the stars, that wine bred in a foreign soil, and brought unto us from 
far, doth disturb, move, or render itself confused: for, the vine had at some time received 
a power of encreasing and multiplying itself before the stars were born: and vegetables 
were before the stars, and the imagined influx of these: wherefore also, they cannot be 
things conjoined in essence, one whereof could consist without the other. Yea, the vine in 
some places flowereth more timely; and, in rainy, or the more cold years, our vine 
flowereth more slowly, whose flower and stages of flourishing the wine doth, 
notwithstanding, imitate; and so neither doth it respect the stars, that it should disturb 
itself at their beck. 

In the next place, neither doth the wine hearken unto the flourishing or blossoming of any 
kind of capers, but of the wine alone: and therefore we must not flee unto an universal 
cause, the general or universal ruling air of worldly successive change; to wit, we may 
rather run back unto impossibilities and absurdities, than unto the most near commerces 
of resemblance and unity, although hitherto unpassable by the schools. 

Moreover, that thing doth as yet far more manifestly appear in ale or beer: when, in times 
past, our ancestors had seen that of barley, after whatsoever manner it was boiled, 
nothing but an empty ptisana or barley-broth, or also a pulp, was cooked; they meditated, 
that the barley first ought to bud (which then they called malt) and next, they nakedly 
boiled their ales, imitating wines: wherein, first of all, some remarkable things do meet in 
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one; to wit, there is stirred up in barley, a vegetable bud, the which when the barley is 
dried, doth afterwards die, and loseth the hope of growing, and so much the more by its 
changing into meal, and afterwards by an after-boiling, it despairs of a growing virtue; 
yet these things nothing hindering, it retains the winey and intoxicating spirit of aqua 
vitæ, the which notwithstanding it doth not yet actually possess: but at length, in number 
of days, it attaineth it by virtue of a ferment: to wit, in the one only bosom of one grain 
one only spirit is made famous with diverse powers, and one power is gelded, another 
being left: which thing indeed, doth as yet more wonderfully shine forth; when as the ale 
or beer of malt disturbs itself while the barley flowereth, no otherwise than as wine is 
elsewhere wont to do: and so a power at a far absent distance is from hence plain to be 
seen: for truly there are cities from whom pleasant meadows do expel the growing of 
barley for many miles, and by so much the more powerfully do ales prove their 
agreement with the absent flowering barley; in as much as the gelding of their power hath 
withdrawn the hopes of budding and increasing: and at length the aqua vitae being 
detained and shut up within the ale, hogshead, and prison of the cellar, cannot with the 
safety of the ale or beer wandering for some leagues unto the flowering ear of barley, that 
thereby, as a stormy retainer, it may trouble the remaining ale with much confusion. 
Certainly there is a far more quiet passage for a magnetical or attractive agreement 
among some agents at a far distance from each other, than there is to dream an aqua vitæ 
wandering out of the ale of a cellar, unto the flowering barley, and from thence to return 
unto the former receptacles of its pen-case, and ale: But the sign imprinted by the appetite 
of a woman great with child, on her young, doth fitly, and alike clearly confirm a 
magnetism or attractive faculty and its operation at a distance: to wit, let there be a 
woman great with child, which desires another cherry, let her but touch her forehead or 
any other place with her finger; without doubt, the young is signed in its forehead with 
the image of the cherry, which afterwards doth every year wax green, white, yellow, and 
at length looks red, according to the tenor of the trees: and it much more wonderfully 
expresses the same successive alteration of maturities in Spain than in Germany: and so 
hereby an action at a distance is not only confirmed, but also a conformity or agreement 
of the essences of the cherry tree, in its wooden and fleshly trunk; a consanguinity or near 
affinity of a being impressed upon the part by on instantaneous imagination, and by a 
successive course of the years of its kernel: surely the more learned ought not to impute 
those things unto evil spirits, which, through their own weakness, they are ignorant of; 
for these things do on all sides occur in nature, the which, through our slenderness, we 
are not able to unfold; for to refer whatsoever gifts of God are in nature (because our dull 
capacity does not comprehend the same rightly) to the devil, shews both ignorance and 
rashness, especially when, as all demonstration of causes from a former thing or cause is 
banished from us, and especially from Aristotle, who was ignorant of all nature, and 
deprived of the good gifts which descends from the Father of Lights; unto whom be all 
honour and glory. 

Note. We may, by the aforesaid chapter, see the wonderful working power of the 
attractive or universal spirit, which can by no other means be so clearly demonstrated as 
by the sympathies in natural things, which are inherent throughout all nature; and, upon 
this principle of sympathy and antipathy, we say is founded that spiritual power which 
tends to things and objects remote one from the other, i. e. a magnetic attraction, which 



does actually exist, as we shall clearly prove by experiment, where we fully shew the 
action and passion that is between natural spirits, by which means wonderful effects are 
produced which have ignorantly been attributed to divers superstitions, as Sorcery, 
Inchantment, Nigromancy, or the Black Art, &c. 

 

Footnotes 

4:1 Van HELMONT. 
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CHAP. II. 

OF SYMPATHETIC MEDICINES. 

IN the year 1639, a little book came forth, whose title was, 'The Sympathetical Powder of 
Edricius Mohynus, of Eburo,' whereby wounds are cured without application of the 
medicine unto the part afflicted, and without superstition; it being sifted by the sieve of 
the reasons of Galen and Aristotle; wherein it is Aristotetically, sufficiently, proved, 
whatsoever the title of it promises; but it hath neglected the directive faculty, or virtue, 
which may bring the virtues of the sympathetical powder, received in the bloody towel or 
napkin, unto the distant wound. 

Truly, from a wound, the venal blood, or corrupt pus, or sanies, from an ulcer, being 
received in the towel, do receive, indeed, a balsam from a sanative or healing being; I 
say, from the power of the vitriol, a medicinal power connected and limited in the 
aforesaid mean; but the virtues of the balsam received are directed unto the wounded 
object, not indeed by an influential virtue of the stars, and much less do they fly forth of 
their own accord unto the object at a distance: therefore the ideas of him that applieth the 
sympathetical remedy are connected in the mean, and are made directresses of the balsam 
unto the object of his desire: even as we have above also minded by injections concerning 
ideas of the desire. Mohyns supposed that the power of sympathy depends upon the stars, 
because it is an imitator of influences: but I draw it out of a much nearer subject: to wit, 
out of directing ideas, begotten by their mother Charity, or a desire of goodwill: for, from 
hence does that sympathetic powder operate more successfully, being applied by the hand 
of one than another: therefore I have always observed the best process where the remedy 
is instituted by a desire of charity; but, that it doth succeed, with small success, if the 
operator be a careless or drunken person; and, from hence, I have more esteemed the stars 
of the mind, in sympathetical remedies, than the stars of heaven: but that images, being 
conceived, are brought unto an object at a distance, a pregnant woman is an example of, 
because she is she who presently transfers all the ideas of her conception on her young, 
which dependeth no otherwise on the mother than from a communion of universal 
nourishment. Truly, seeing such a direction of desire is plainly natural, it is no wonder 
that the evil spirit doth require the ideas of the desires of his imps to be annexed unto a 
mean offered by him. Indeed, the ideas of the desire are after the manner of the influences 
of heaven cast into a proper object how locally remote soever; that is, they are directed by 
the desire, especially pointing out an object for itself, even as the sight of the basilisk, or 
touch of the torpedo, is reflected on their willed object; for I have already shewn in its 
place, that the devil doth not attribute so much as any thing in the directions of things 
injected; but that he hath need of a free, directing, and operative power or faculty. But I 
will not disgrace sympathetical remedies because the devil operates something about 
things injected into the body: for what have sympathetical remedies in common? 
Although Satan doth co-operate in injections by wicked natural means required from his 
bond slaves; for every thing shall be judged guilty, or good, from its ends and intents: and 
it is sufficient that sympathetical remedies do agree with things injected in natural means, 
or medicines. 



CHAP. III. 

OF THE MAGNETIC OR SYMPATHETIC UNGUENT, THE POWDER OF SYMPATHY, ARMARY 
UNGUENT, CURING OF WOUNDS, ECSTASIES, WITCHCRAFT, MUMMIES, &C. 

WE shall now show some remarkable operations that are effected by magnetism, and 
founded upon natural sympathy and antipathy, likewise how by these means some 
extraordinary cures may be performed. 

The goodness of the Creator every where extended, created every thing for the use of 
ungrateful man; neither did he admit any of the theologists, or divines, as assistants in 
council, how many or how great virtues he should infuse into things natural. But there are 
those who venture to measure the wonderful works of God by their own sharpened and 
refined wit, whereby they deny God to have given such virtue to things; as though man (a 
worm) was able, by his narrow and limited capacity, to comprehend Omniscience; he 
therefore measures the minds of all men by his own, who think that cannot be done, 
which they cannot understand. They therefore can only develope the mysteries of nature, 
who being versed in the art of Cabala, Fire, and Magic, examined the properties of things, 
and draw, from darkness into light, the lurking powers of Man, Animals, Vegetables, 
Minerals, and Stones, and, separating the crudities, dregs, poisons, heterogenities, that are 
the thorns implanted in virgin nature from the curse. For an observer of nature sees daily 
she doth distil, sublime, calcine, ferment, dissolve, coagulate, fix, &c. therefore we who 
are the ministers of nature do separate, &c. finding out the causes and effects of every 
phenomena she produces. 

Now, as magnetism is ordained for the use of man, and for the curing of the various 
disorders incident to human nature, we shall first touch upon the grand subject of 
magnetism, known to possess wonderful properties, and which are not only evident to 
every eye, but shew us sufficient grounds for our admitting the possibility and reality of 
magnetism in general. 

The loadstone possesses an eminent medicinal faculty, against many violent and 
implacable disorders. Helmont says, that the back of the loadstone, as it repulses iron, so 
also it removes gout, swellings, rheum, &c. that is of the nature or quality of iron. The 
iron attracting faculty, if it be joined to the mummy of a woman, and the back of the 
loadstone be put within her thigh, and the belly of the loadstone on her loins, it safely 
prevents a miscarriage, already threatened; but the belly of the loadstone applied within 
the thigh and the back to her loins, it doth wonderfully facilitate her delivery. 

Likewise the wearing the loadstone cases and prevents the cramp, and such like disorders 
and pains. 

Uldericus Balk, a dominican friar, published a book at Frankfort in the year 1611, 
concerning the lamp of life; in which we shall find (taken from Paracelsus) the true 
magnetical cure of many diseases, viz. the dropsy, gout, jaundice, &c. For if thou shalt 
enclose the warm blood of the sick in the shell and white of an egg, which is exposed to a 
nourishing warmth, and this blood, being mixed with a piece of flesh, thou shalt give to a 
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hungry dog, the disorder departs from thee into the dog; no otherwise than the leprosy of 
Naaman passed over into Gehazi through the execration of the prophet. 

If women, weaning their infants, shall milk out their milk upon hot burning coals, the 
breast soon dries. 

If any one happens to commit nuisance at thy door, and thou wilt prevent that beastly 
trick in future, take the poker red-hot, and put it into the excrement, and, by magnetism, 
his posteriors shall become much scorched and inflamed. 

Make a small table of the lightest, whitest, and basest kind of lead; and at one end put a 
piece of amber, and, three spans from it, lay a piece of green vitriol; this vitriol will soon 
lose its colour and acid: both which effects are found in the preparation of amber. The 
root of the Caroline thistle being plucked up when full of juice and virtue, and tempered 
with the mummy of a man, will exhaust the powers and natural strength out of a man, on 
whose shadow thou shalt stand, into thyself. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



CHAP. IV. 

OF THE ARMARY UNGUENT, OR WEAPON SALVE, &c. 

THE principal ingredient in this confection, is the moss of a dead man's skull, which Van 
Helmont calls the excrescencies or superfluities of the stars. Now the moss growing on 
the skull of a dead man, seeing it has received its seed from the heavens, but its increase 
from the mummial marrow of the skull of man, or tower of the microcosm, has obtained 
excellent astral and magnetic powers beyond the common condition of vegetables, 
although herbs, as they are herbs, want not their own magnetism. 

Now, the magnetism of this unguent draws out that strange disposition from the wound 
(which otherwise, by a disunion of the parts that held together, and by which, I say, 
strange disposition and foreign quality is produced) from whence it slips, not being 
overburdened or oppressed by any accident, suddenly grow together; and this is effected 
by the armary unguent, or weapon salve. From this it appears that the unguent, or weapon 
salve, its property is to heal suddenly and perfectly without pain, costs, peril, or loss of 
strength; hence it is manifest that the magnetical virtue is from God. 

It is now seasonable to discover the immediate cause of magnetism in the unguent. 

First of all, by the consent of mystical divines, we divide man into the external and 
internal man, assigning to both the powers of a certain mind, or intelligence: for so there 
doth a will belong to flesh and blood, which may not be either the will of man or the will 
of God; and the heavenly Father also reveals some things unto the more inward man, and 
some things flesh and blood reveals, that is, the outward and sensitive, or animal man. 
For, how could the service of idols, envy, &c. be rightly numbered among the works of 
the flesh, seeing they consist only in the imagination, if the flesh had not also its own 
imagination and elective will? 

Furthermore, that there are miraculous ecstasies belonging to the more inward man, is 
beyond dispute. That there are also ecstasies in the animal man, by reason of an intense, 
or heightend imagination, is, without doubt. Martin del Ris, an elder of the society of 
Jesus, in his Magical Disquisitions or Enquiries, makes mention of a certain young man 
in the city Insulis that was transported with so violent a desire of seeing his mother, that 
through the same intense desire, as if being rapt up by an ecstasy, he saw her perfectly, 
although many miles absent from thence; and, returning again to himself, being mindful 
of all that he had seen, gave many true signs of his true presence with his mother. 

Now that desire arose from the more outward man, viz. from blood and sense, or flesh, is 
certain; for, otherwise, the soul being once dislodged, or loosened from the bonds of the 
body, cannot, except by miracle, be reunited to it; there is therefore in the blood a certain 
ecstatical or transporting power, which, if at any time shall be excited or stirred up by an 
ardent desire and most strong imagination, it is able to conduct the spirit of the more 
outward man even to some absent and far distant object, but then that power lies hid in 
the more outward man, as it were, in potentia, or by way of possibility; neither is it 
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brought into act, unless it be roused up by the imagination, inflamed and agitated by a 
most fervent and violent desire. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



CHAP. V. 

OF THE IMAGINATIVE POWER AND THE MAGNETISM OF THE NATURAL SPIRITS, 
MUMMIAL ATTRACTION, SYMPATHIES OF ASTRAL SPIRITS, WITH THEIR BODIES, UPON 
WHICH THE WHOLE ART OF NECROMANCY IS FOUNDED. 

MOREOVER, when as the blood is after some sort corrupted, then indeed all the powers 
thereof which, without a foregoing excitation of the imagination, were before in 
possibility, are of their own accord, drawn forth into action; for, through corruption of the 
grain, the seminal virtue, otherwise drowsy, and barren, breaks forth into act; because, 
that seeing the essences of things, and their vital spirits, know not how to putrify by the 
dissolution of the inferior harmony, they sprung up as surviving afresh. For, from thence 
it is that every occult property, the compact of their bodies being by foregoing digestion, 
(which we call putrifaction) now dissolved, comes forth free to hand, dispatched, and 
manifest for action. 

Therefore when a wound, through the entrance of air, hath admitted of an adverse quality, 
from whence the blood forthwith swells with heat or rage in its lips, and otherwise 
becomes mattery, it happens, that the blood in the wound just made, by reason of the said 
foreign quality, doth now enter into the beginning of some kind of corruption (which 
blood being also then received on the weapon or splinter thereof, is besmeared with the 
magnetic unguent) the which entrance of corruption, mediating the ecstatical power 
lurking potentially in the blood, is brought forth into action; which power, because it is an 
exiled returner unto its own body, by reason of the hidden ecstasy; hence that blood bears 
an individual respect unto the blood of its whole body. Then indeed the magnetic or 
attractive faculty is busied in operating in the unguent, and through the mediation of the 
ecstatical power (for so I call it for want of an etymology) sucks out the hurtful quality 
from the lips of the wound, and at length, through the mummial, balsamical, and 
attractive virtue, attained in the unguent, the magnetism is perfected. 

So thou hast now the positive reason of the natural magnetism in the unguent, drawn 
from natural magic, whereunto the light of truth assents; saying, "where the treasure is 
there is the heart also." 

For if the treasure be in heaven, then the heart, that is, the spirit of the internal man, is in 
God, who is the paradise, who alone is eternal life. 

But if the treasure be fixed or laid up in frail and mortal things, then also the heart and 
spirit of the external man is in fading things; neither is there any cause of bringing in a 
mystical sense, by taking not the spirit, but the cogitation and naked desire, for the heart; 
for that would contain a frivolous thing, that wheresoever a man should place his treasure 
in his thought or cogitation, there his cogitation would be. 

Also truth itself doth not interpret the present text mystically, and also by an example 
adjoined, shews a local and real presence of the eagles with the dead carcass, so also that 
the spirit of the inward man is locally in the kingdom of God in us, which is God himself; 
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and that the heart or spirit of the animal or outward sensitive man is locally about its 
treasure. 

What wonder is it, that the astral spirits of carnal or animal men should, as yet, after their 
funerals, shew themselves as in a bravery, wandering about their buried treasure, 
whereunto the whole of Necromancy (or art of divination by the calling of spirits) of the 
antients hath enslaved itself? 

I say, therefore, that the internal man is an animal or living creature, making use of the 
reason and will of blood: but, in the mean time, not barely an animal, but moreover the 
image of God. 

Logicians therefore may see how defectively they define a man from the power of 
rational discourse. But of these things more elsewhere. 

I will therefore adjoin the magnetism of eagles to carcasses; for neither are flying fowls 
endowed with such an acute smelling, that they can, with a mutual consent, go from Italy 
into Africa unto carcasses. 

For neither is an odour so largely and widely spread; for the ample latitude of the 
interposed sea hinders it, and also a certain elementary property of consuming it nor is 
there any ground that thou shouldest think these birds do perceive the dead carcasses at 
so far a distance, with their sight, especially if those birds shall lie southwards behind a 
mountain. 

But what need is there to enforce the magnetism of fowls by many arguments, since God 
himself, who is the becoming and end of philosophy, doth expressly determine the same 
process to be of the heart and treasure, with these birds and the carcass, and so 
interchangeably between these and them? 

For if the eagles were led to their food, the carcasses, with the same appetite whereby 
four-footed beasts are brought on to their pastures, certainly he had said, in one word, that 
living creatures flock to their food even as the heart of man to his treasure; which would 
contain a falsehood: for neither doth the heart of man proceed unto its treasure, that he 
may be filled therewith as living creatures do to their meat; and therefore the comparison 
of the heart of man and of the eagle lies not in the end for which they tend or incline to a 
desire, but in the manner of tendency; namely that they are allured and carried on by 
magnetism, really and locally. 

Therefore the spirit and will of the blood fetched out of the wound, having intruded itself 
into the ointment by the weapon being anointed therewith, do tend towards their treasure, 
that is, the rest of the blood as yet enjoying the life of the more inward man: but he saith 
by a peculiar testimony, that the eagle is drawn to the carcass, because she is called 
thereunto by an implanted and mummial spirit of the carcass, but not by the odour of the 
putrifying body: for indeed that animal, in assimilating, appropriates to himself only this 



mummial spirit: for from thence it is said of the eagle, in a peculiar manner, "my youth 
shall be renewed as the eagle's." 

For truly the renewing of her youth proceeds from an essential extraction of the mummial 
spirit being well refined by a certain singular digestion proper to that fowl, and not from a 
bare eating of the flesh of the carcass; otherwise dogs also and pies would be renewed, 
which is false. 

Thou wilt say, that it is a reason far-fetched in behalf of magnetism; but what wilt thou 
then infer hereupon? If that which thou confesseth to be far remote for thy capacity of 
understanding, that shall also with thee be accounted to be fetched from far. Truly the 
book of Genesis avoucheth, that in the blood of all living creatures doth their soul exist. 

For there are in the blood certain vital powers 1, the which, as if they were soulified or 
enlivened, do demand revenge from Heaven, yea, and judicial punishment from earthly 
judges on the murderer; which powers, seeing they cannot be denied to inhabit naturally 
in the blood, I see not why they can reject the magnetism of the blood, as accounting it 
among the ridiculous works of Satan. 

This I will say more, to wit, that those who walk in their sleep, do, by no other guide than 
the spirit of the blood, that is, of the outward man, walk up and down, perform business, 
climb walls, and manage things that are otherwise impossible to those that are awake. I 
say, by a magical virtue, natural to the more outward man; that Saint Ambrose, although 
he was for distant in his body, yet was visibly present at the funeral solemnities of Saint 
Martin; yet was he spiritually present at those solemnities, in the visible spirit of the 
external man, and no otherwise: for inasmuch as in that ecstasy which is of the more 
internal man, many of the saints have seen many and absent things. This is done without 
time and place, through the superior powers of the soul being collected in unity, and by 
an intellectual vision, but not by a visible presence; otherwise the soul is not separated 
from the body, but in good earnest, or for altogether; neither is it re-connected thereunto, 
which re-connexion, notwithstanding, is otherwise natural or familiar to the spirit of the 
more outward man. 

It is not sufficient in so great a paradox, to have once, or by one single reason, touched at 
the matter; it is to be further propagated, and we must explain how a magnetical attraction 
happens also between inanimate things, by a certain perceivance or feeling; not indeed 
animal or sensitive, but natural. 

Which thing, that it may be the more seriously done, it behoves us first to shew what 
Satan can, of his own power, contribute to, and after what manner he can co-operate in 
the merely wicked and impious actions of witches: for, from thence it will appear unto 
what cause every effect may be attributed. 

In the next place, what that spiritual power may be which tends to a far remote object; or 
what may be the action, passion, and skirmishing between. natural spirits, or what may be 
the superiority of man as to other inferior creatures; and, by consequence, why indeed our 
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unguent, being compounded of human mummies, do thoroughly cure horses also. We 
will explain the matter in the following chapter. 

 

Footnotes 

16:1 This singular property of the blood, which Helmont calls Vital Powers, is no less 
wonderful than true, having been myself a witness of this experiment while in South 
Wales. It was tried upon a body that was maliciously murdered, through occasion of a 
quarrel over-night at an alehouse. The fellow who was suspected of the murder appeared 
the next day in public seemingly unconcerned. The Coroner's jury sat upon the body 
within twenty-four hours after this notable murder was committed; when the suspected 
was suddenly taken into custody, and conveyed away to the same public-house where the 
inquisition was taken. After some debate, one Dr. Jones desired the suspected to be 
brought into the room; which done, he desired the villain to lay his left hand under the 
wound, which was a deep gash on the neck, and another on the breast; the villain plainly 
confessed his guilt by his trepidation; but as soon as he lightly laid his finger on the body, 
the blood immediately ran, about six or seven drops, to the admiration of all present. If 
any one doubts the truth of this narrative, however learned and profound he may think 
himself, let him call personally upon me, and I will give him such reference, and that 
truly respectable and fair, as shall convince him of the fact. FRANCIS BARRETT. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. VI. 

OF WITCHCRAFT. 

LET a witch therefore be granted, who can strongly torment an absent man by an image 
of wax, by imprecation or cursing, by enchantment, or also by a foregoing touch alone, 
(for here we speak nothing of Sorceries, because they are those which kill only by poison, 
inasmuch as every common apothecary can imitate those things) that this act is 
diabolical, no man doubts: however, it is profitable to discern how much Satan and how 
much the witch can contribute hereunto. 

The First Supposition. 

First of all, thou shalt take notice, that Satan is the sworn and irreconcileable enemy of 
man, and to be so accounted by all, unless any one had rather have him to be his friend; 
and therefore he most readily procures whatsoever mischief he is able to cause or wish 
unto us, and that without doubt and neglect. 

The Second Supposition. 

And then although he be an enemy to witches themselves, forasmuch as he is also a most 
malicious enemy to all mankind in general; yet, in regard they are his bond-slaves, and 
those of his kingdom, he never, unless against his will betrays them, or discovers them to 
judges, &c. 

From the former supposition I conclude, that if Satan were able of himself to kill a man 
who is guilty of deadly sin, he would never delay it; but he doth not kill him, therefore he 
cannot. 

Notwithstanding, the witch doth oftentimes kill; hence also she can kill the same man, no 
otherwise than as a privy murderer at the liberty of his own will slays any one with a 
sword. 

There is therefore a certain power of the witch in this action, which belongs not to Satan, 
and consequently Satan is not the principal efficient and executor of that murder; for 
otherwise if he were the executioner thereof, he would in nowise stand in need of the 
witch as his assistant; but he alone had soon taken the greatest part of men out of the way. 

Surely most miserable were the conditions of mortals who should be subject to such a 
tyrant, and stand liable to his commands; we have too faithful a God, than that he should 
subject the work of his own hands to the arbitrary dominion of Satan. 

Therefore in this act, there is a certain power plainly proper and natural to the witch 
which belongs not to Satan. 
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Moreover, of what nature, extent, and quality that power may be, we must more exactly 
sift out. 

In the first place, it is manifest that it is no corporeal strength of the male sex; for neither 
doth there concur any strong touching of the extreme parts of the body, and witches are 
for the most part feeble, impotent, and malicious old women, therefore there must needs 
be some other power, far superior to a corporeal attempt, yet natural to man. 

This power therefore was to be seated in that part wherein we most nearly resemble the 
image of God; and although all things do also, after some sort, represent that venerable 
image, yet because man doth most elegantly, properly, and nearly do that, therefore the 
image of God in man doth far outshine, bear rifle over, and command the images of God 
in all other creatures; for, peradventure, by this prerogative, all things are put under his 
feet. 

Wherefore if God act, per nutum, or by a beck, namely by his word, so ought man to act 
some things only by his beck or will, if he ought to be called his true image: for neither is 
that new, is that troublesome, is that proper to God alone: for Satan, the most vile abject 
of creatures, doth also locally move bodies per nutum, or by his beck alone, seeing he 
hath not extremities or corporeal organs, whereby to touch, move, or also to snatch a new 
body to himself 

That privilege therefore ought no less to belong to the inward man, as he is a spirit, if he 
ought to represent the image of God, and that indeed not all idle one; if we call this 
faculty magical, and thou being badly instructed, art terrified at this word, thou mayest, 
for me, call it a spiritual strength or efficacy: for, truly, we are nothing solicitous about 
names. I always, as immediately as I can, cast an eye upon the thing itself. 

That magical power, therefore, is in the inward man, whether thou, by this etymology, or 
true word, understandest the soul or the vital spirit thereof, it is now indifferent to us; 
since there is a certain proportion of the internal man towards the external in all things, 
glowing or growing after its own manner, which is an appropriated disposition, and 
proportioned property. 

Wherefore the power or faculty must needs be dispersed throughout the whole man; in 
the soul, indeed, more vigorous, but in the flesh and blood far more remiss. 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. VII. 

OF THE VITAL SPIRIT, &c. 

THE vital spirit in the flesh and blood performs the office of the soul; that is, it is the 
same spirit in the outward man, which, in the seed, forms the whole figure, that 
magnificent structure and perfect delineation of man, and which hath known the ends of 
things to be done, because it contains them; and the which as president accompanies the 
new framed young, even unto the period of its life; and the which, although it depart 
therewith, some smacks or small quantity, at least, thereof remains in a carcass slain by, 
violence, being as it were most exactly co-fermented with the same. But, from a dead 
carcass that was extinct of its own accord, and from nature failing, as well the implanted 
as inflowing spirit passed forth at once. 

For which reason, physicians divide this spirit into the implanted or mummial, and 
inflowing or acquired spirit, which departs; to wit, with the former life and this influxing 
spirit they afterwards subdivide into the natural, vital, and animal spirit; but, we likewise, 
do here comprehend them all at once in one single word. 

The soul therefore being wholly a spirit could never move or stir up the vital spirit, (being 
indeed corporeal), much less flesh and bones, unless a certain natural power, yet magical 
and spiritual, did descend from the soul into the spirit and body. 

After what sort, I pray, could the corporeal spirit obey the commands of the soul, unless 
there should be a command from her for moving of the spirit, and afterwards the body? 

But against this magical motive faculty thou will forthwith object, that that power is 
limited within her composed body, and her own natural inn: therefore although we call 
this soul a magicianness, yet it shall be only a wresting and abuse of the name; for truly 
the true and superstitious magic draws not its foundation from the soul; seeing this same 
soul is not able to move, alter, or exite any thing out of its own body. 

I answer, that this power, and that natural magic of the soul which she exerciseth not of 
herself, by virtue of the image of God, doth now lie hid as obscure in man, and as it were 
lie asleep since the fall or corruption of Adam, and stands in need or stirring up; all which 
particulars we shall anon in their proper place prove; which same power, how drowsy and 
as it were drunk soever, it otherwise remains daily in us, yet it is sufficient to perform its 
offices in its own body. 
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CHAP. VIII. 

OF THE MAGICAL POWER, &c. 

THEREFORE the knowledge and power magical, and that faculty in man which acteth 
only per nutum, sleeps since the knowledge of the apple was eaten; and as long as this 
knowledge (which is of the flesh and blood, gross and material belonging to the external 
man and darkness) flourishes, the more noble magical power is lying dormant. 

But because in sleep this outward or sensual knowledge is sometimes dormant, hence it is 
that our dreams are sometimes prophetical, and God himself is therefore nearer unto man 
in dreams, through that effect, viz. when the more inward magic of the soul being 
uninterrupted by the flesh, diffuses itself on every side into the understanding; even as 
when it sinks itself into the inferior powers thereof it safely leads those who walk in their 
sleep by moving or conducting them, whither those that were awake could not surmount 
or climb. 

Therefore we establish this point, viz. that there is inherent in the soul a certain magical 
virtue given her by God, naturally proper and belonging to her, in asmuch as we are his 
image and engravement; and in this respect she acts also in a peculiar manner, i. e. 
spiritually on an object at a distance, and that more powerfully than by any corporeal 
assistance; for seeing the soul is the principal part of the body, therefore all action 
belonging to her is spiritual, magical, and of the greatest validity. 

Which power man is able, by the Art of the Cabala, to excite in himself at his own 
pleasure, and these, as we have before said, are called Adepts; who are governed by the 
Spirit of God. 

Thus we have endeavoured to shew that man predominates over all other creatures that 
are corporeal, and that by his magical faculty he is able to subdue the magical virtues of 
all other things; which predominance of man, or the soul's natural magic, some have 
ignorantly attributed solely to verses, charms, signs, characters, &c. by which hierarchy 
or holy dominion inherent in man, those effects, whatever they may be, are wrought, 
which some (who but too corporeally philosophize) have attributed to the dominion of 
Satan. 

High and sacred is the force of the microcosmical spirit, which, as is evident in pregnant 
women, stamps upon the young the image and properties of a thing desired, as we have 
before instanced in a cherry, which, without the trunk of a tree, brings forth a true cherry, 
that is flesh and blood, enobled with the properties and power of the more inward or real 
cherry, by the conception of the imagination alone; from whence are two necessary 
consequences. 

First, that all the spirits, and as it were the essences of all things, lie hid in us, and are 
born and brought forth only by the working, power, and phantasy of the microcosm. 



The second is, that the soul, in conceiving, generates a certain idea of the thing 
conceived; the which, as it before lay hid unknown, like fire in a flint, so by the stirring 
up of the phantasy there is produced a certain real idea, which is not a naked quality, but 
something like a substance, hanging in suspense between a body and a spirit, that is the 
soul. 

That middle being is so spiritual, that it is not plainly exempted from a corporeal 
condition, since the actions of the soul are limited on the body, and the inferior orders of 
faculties de ending upon it, nor yet so corporeal that it may be inclosed by dimensions, 
the which we have also related to be only proper to a seminal being. This ideal entity, 
therefore, when it falls out of the invisible and intellectual world of the microcosm, it 
puts on a body, and then it is first inclosed by the limitation of place and numbers. 

The object of the understanding is in itself a naked and pure essence, not an accident, by 
the consent of practical, that is, mystical divines; therefore this Proteus or transferable 
essence, the understanding doth, as it were, put on and clothe itself, with this conceived 
essence. 

But because every body, whether external or internal, hath its making in its own proper 
image, the understanding knows or discerns not, the will loves and wills not, the memory 
recollects not, but by images or likenesses: the understanding therefore puts on this same 
image of its object; and because the soul is the pure simple form of the body, which turns 
itself about to every member, therefore the acting understanding cannot have two images 
at once, but first one and then the other. He, who is wholly the life, created all things and 
hath said, nothing is to be expected as dead out of his hand. Likewise nothing can come 
to our view wherein himself is not clearly apparent or present; for it is said, "the spirit of 
the Lord hath filled the whole globe of the earth:" and, again, "that he containeth or 
comprehendeth all things," therefore there is nothing in being, no creature but what 
possesses a certain degree of divine fire and life, yet lying dormant or unexcited, till 
stirred up by the art, power, and operation of man. 
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CHAP. IX. 

OF THE EXCITING OR STIRRING UP THE MAGICAL VIRTUE. 

EVERY magical virtue therefore stands in need of an excitement, by which a certain 
spiritual vapour is stirred up, by reason whereof the phantasy which profoundly sleeps is 
awakened, and there begins an action of the corporeal spirit, as a medium, which is that 
of Magnetism, and is excited by a fore-going touch. 

There is a magical virtue, being as it were abstracted from the body, which is wrought by 
the stirring up of the power of the soul, from whence there are made most potent 
procreations, and most famous impressions, and strong effects, so that nature is on every 
side a magicianness, and acts by her own phantasy; and by how much the more spiritual 
her phantasy is, so much the more powerful it is, therefore the denomination of magic is 
truly proportionable or concordant. 

Now the highest sort of magic is that which is stirred up from an intellectual conception, 
and indeed that of the inward man is only to be excited by the Holy Spirit, and by his gift 
the Cabala; but that of the external man is stirred up by a strong imagination, by a daily 
and heightened speculation, and, in witches, by the devil. 

But the magical virtue of the exhaled spirituous vapour, or subtil spirits sent from the 
body, which before lay in potentia, or by way of possibility only, is either excited by a 
more strong imagination, the magician making use of the blood as a medium, and 
establishing his kindled entity thereon, or by the ascending phantasy of the weapon salve, 
the exciteress of the property lying in the blood; else by a foregoing appointment or 
disposition of the blood unto corruption, viz. whereby the elements are disposed unto a 
separation, and the essences (which cannot putrify) and the essential phantasies, which 
lay hid in the properties come forth into action. 

The phantasy therefore, of any subject whatsoever has obtained a strong appetite to the 
spirit of another thing, for the moving of some certain thing in place, for the attracting, 
repelling, or expulsion thereof; and there and not elsewhere we acknowledge magnetism 
as the natural magical endowment of that thing firmly planted in it by God. 

There is therefore a certain formal property separated from sympathetical and abstruse 
qualities; because the motive phantasy of these qualities do not directly fly unto a local 
motion, but only to an alternative motion of the object. Now it is sufficient that (if a man 
happens to receive many wounds in his body) blood be had only from one of these 
wounds, and from this one the rest are cured also, because that blood keeps a concordant 
harmony with the spirit of the whole, and draws forth from the same the offensive quality 
communicated, not only to the lips of the wound, but to the whole man, for from one 
wound only the whole man is liable to grow feverish. 

Therefore the outchased blood being received on the weapon is introduced into the 
magnetic unguent. 



For then the phantasy of the blood, being otherwise as yet drowsy and slow to action, 
being stirred up by the virtue of the magnetic unguent, and there finding the balsamic 
virtue of it, desires the quality induced into it, to be bestowed on itself throughout, and 
from thence by a spiritual magnetism to draw out all the strange tincture of the wound, 
which, seeing it cannot fitly enough effect by itself, it implores the aid of the moss, blood, 
fat, and mummy, which are conjoined together into such a balsam, which not but by its 
own phantasy becomes also medicinal, magnetical, and is also a tractor of all the strange 
qualities out of the body, whose fresh blood, abounding with spirit, is carried unto it, 
whether it shall be that of a man or any other living creature. The phantasy therefore is a 
returner, or reducible and ecstatical, from part of the blood that is fresh and newly 
brought unto the unguent; but the magnetic attraction began in the blood is perfected by 
the medicinal virtue of the unguent; not that the unguent draws the infirmity of the wound 
unto itself, but it alters the blood newly brought unto it, in its spirit, and makes it 
medicinal, and stirs up the power thereof: from thence it contracts a certain medicinal 
virtue, which returns unto its whole body to correct the spirit of the blood throughout the 
whole man. Now, to manifest a great mystery, viz. to shew that in man there is placed a 
great efficacy whereby he may be able only by his beck, (as we before mentioned) nod or 
phantasy, to act out of himself, and to imprint a virtue, a certain influence which 
afterwards perseveres, or constantly subsists by itself, and acts upon objects at a very 
great distance; by which only mystery, those things which we have spoken (relative to 
ideal entity conveyed in a spiritual fewel, and departing far from home to execute its 
offices, concerning the magnetism of all things begotten in the imagination of man, as in 
that which is proper to every thing, and also concerning the magical superiority of men 
over all other bodies,) will plainly and conspicuously appear. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



CHAP. X. 

OF THE MAGICAL VIRTUE OF THE SOUL, AND THE MEDIUMS BY WHICH IT ACTS. 

SOMETHING more we will add, before we dismiss the present subject, which is that if a 
nail, dart, knife, or sword, or any other iron instrument be thrust into the heart of a horse, 
it will bind and withhold the spirit of a witch, and conjoin it with the mummial spirit of 
the horse, whereby they may be burnt in the fire together, and by that the witch is 
tormented, as by a sting or burning, by which means she may be known so that she who 
is offensive to God, and destructive to mortal men, may be taken away from society 
according to the law of God "thou shalt not suffer a witch to live;" for if the work be 
limited to any outward object, that work the magical soul never attempts without a 
medium or mean: therefore it makes use of the nail, or sword, or knife, or any other thing 
as aforesaid. 

Now this being proved, that man hath a power of acting, per nutum, or by his nod, or of 
moving any object remotely placed; it has also been sufficiently confirmed by the same 
natural example, that this efficacy was also given unto man by God. 

And as every magical faculty lies dormant, and has need of excitement, or stirring up; 
which is always true, if the object whereon it is to act is not nearly disposed, if its internal 
phantasy doth not wholly confirm to the impression of the agent, or also if the patient be 
equal in strength, or superior to the agent therein. 

But, on the contrary, where the object is plainly and nearly disposed, as steel is, for the 
receiving of magnetism, then the patient without much stirring up, the alone phantasy of 
the more outward man being drawn out to the work and bound up to any suitable mean, 
yields to the magnetism. 

Therefore we repeat, the magician must always make use of a medium for then the words 
or forms of sacraments do always operate, because from the work performed. But the 
reason why exorcisms, conjurations, charms, incantations, &c. do sometimes fail of their 
desired effect, is because the unexcited mind, or spirit of the exorcist, renders the words 
dull or ineffectual. 

Therefore no man can be a happy or successful magician, but him who knows how to stir 
up the magical virtue of his soul, or can do it practically without science. 

And there can be no nearer medium of magnetism, than human blood with human blood. 

And no sympathetic remedies, magnetical or attractive, but from the idea or phantasy of 
the operator impressing upon it a virtue and efficacy from the excited power in his own 
soul. 

And now to bring our Magnetic Treatise to a total conclusion, we have to say, that 
whoever, through ignorance or obstinacy, will say there is no validity or reason, or reality 



in the science of magnetism, proves himself unworthy the sacred name of philosopher, 
because he condemns what he knows nothing at all about. 

For those who will give themselves the leisure to examine the truth of those things which 
we have taught, will not find their expectation deceived, therefore will not condemn. 

But whoever should be so superstitious as to attribute a natural effect so created by God, 
and bestowed on the creature, unto the power and craft of the devil, he filches the honour 
due to the Omnipotent Creator, and reproachfully applies the same unto Satan; the which 
(under favour) will be found to be express idolatry and blasphemy. 

"There are three" (as says the Scripture) "who bear record in heaven; the Father, the 
Word, and the Holy Spirit; and these three are only one." 

There are three that bear record on earth; the blood, the spirit, and the water; and these 
three are only one. 

We therefore, who have the like humanity, contain blood and spirit of a co-like unity; and 
the action of the blood is merely spiritual. Therefore, in Genesis, it is not called by the 
etymology of blood, but is made remarkable by the name of a red spirit. 

Therefore, let those who would attain knowledge in these things, and be perfect in what 
we have set before them, constantly meditate and desire that the First Cause and 
Archetype of all things would graciously and mercifully illuminate their minds; without 
which, they grope but in darkness and uncertainty, and are subject to the delusions of 
impure spirits and devils, who are only to be put to flight by putting on the whole armour 
of God, in whom we all live, move, breathe, and have our being. 

END OF MAGNETISM. 
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THE CABALA; 
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CABALISTICAL MAGIC. 

CHAP. I. 

OF THE CABALA, &c. 

WE shall now turn our pen to the explaining of the high and mysterious secrets of the 
Cabala, by which only we can know the truth; and likewise how to prepare our mind and 
spirit for the contemplation of the greatest and best part of magic, which we call 
intellectual and divine, because it chiefly takes God and the good spirits for its object; 
and as the cabalistic art opens many and the chiefest mysteries and secrets of ceremonial 
magic. 

But in respect of explaining or publishing those few secrets in the Cabala, which are 
amongst a few wise men, and communicated by word of mouth only, I hope the student 
will pardon me if I pass over these in silence, because we are not permitted to divulge 
some certain things; but this we shall do; we will open all those secrets which are 
necessary to be known; and by the close reading of which, you shall find out, of your 
own head, to be both profitable and delightful. 

Therefore, all we solicit is, that those who perceive those secrets should keep them 
together as secrets, and not expose or babble them to the unworthy; but reveal them only 
to faithful, discreet, and chosen friends. And we would caution you in this beginning, that 
every magical experiment flies from the public, seeking to be hid, is strengthened and 
confirmed by silence, but is destroyed by publication; never does any complete effect 
follow after: likewise all the virtue of thy works will suffer detriment when poured into 
weak, prating, and incredulous minds; therefore, if thou would be a magician, and gain 
fruit from this art, to be secret, and to manifest to none, either thy work, or place, or time, 
nor thy desire, or will, except it be to a master or partner, or companion, who should 
likewise be faithful, discreet, silent, and dignified by nature and education; seeing that 
even the prating of a companion, his unbelief, doubting, questioning, and, lastly, 
unworthiness, hinders and disturbs the effect in every operation. 
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CHAP. II. 

WHAT DIGNITY AND PREPARATION IS ESSENTIALLY NECESSARY TO HIM WHO WOULD 
BECOME A TRUE MAGICIAN. 

IT is fit that we who endeavour to attain so great a height should first study two things: 
viz. First, how we should leave vain and carnal affections, frail sense and material 
passions; Secondly, by what ways and means we may ascend to an intellect pure, and 
joined with the powers of the celestials, without which we shall never happily ascend to 
the scrutiny of secret things, and to the power of working wonderful effects, &c. Now, if 
thou art a man perfect in thy understanding, and constantly meditating upon what we 
have in this book written, and without doubting, believeth, thou shalt be able, by praying, 
consecrating, deprecating, invocating, &c. to attract spiritual and celestial gifts, and to 
imprint them on whatever things thou shalt please; and by it to vivify every magical 
work. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. III. 

THAT THE KNOWLEDGE OF THE TRUE GOD IS NECESSARY FOR A MAGICIAN. 

SEEING that the being and operation of all things depend on the Most High God, Creator 
of all things, and from thence on the other divine powers, to whom also is granted a 
power of fashioning and creating, not principally indeed, but instrumentally, by virtue of 
the First Great Creator, (for the beginning of every thing is the first cause; but what is 
produced by the second cause, is much more produced by the first, which is the producer 
of the second cause, which therefore we call secondaries.) It is necessary, therefore, that 
every magician should know that very God, which is the first cause and creator of all 
things, and likewise the other divine powers, (which we call the second causes,) and not 
to be ignorant of them, and likewise what holy rites, ceremonies, &c. are conformable to 
them; but, above all, we are to worship in spirit and truth, and place our firm dependance 
upon that one only God who is the author and promoter of all good things, the Father of 
all, most bountiful and wise; the sacred light of justice, and the absolute and sole 
perfection of all nature, and the contriver and wisdom thereof. 
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CHAP. IV. 

OF DIVINE EMANATIONS, AND TEN SEPHIROTHS, AND TEN MOST SACRED NAMES OF GOD 
WHICH RULE THEM, AND THE INTERPRETATION OF THEM. 

GOD himself, although he is trinity in persons, yet he is but one only simple essence; yet 
we doubt not but that there are in him many divine powers, which emanate or flow from 
him. 

The Cabalists most learned in divine things have received the ten principal names of God, 
as certain divine powers, Or, as it were, members of God; which, by ten numerations, 
which we call Sephiroth, as it were vestiments, instruments, or exemplars of the 
Archetype, have an influence upon all created things, from the highest to the lowest; yet 
by a certain order: for first and immediately they have influence upon the nine orders of 
angels and quire of blessed souls, and by them into the celestial spheres, planets and men; 
by the which Sephiroth every thing receiveth power and virtue. 

The first of these is the name Eheia, the name of the divine essence; his numeration is 
called Cether, which is interpreted a crown or diadem, and signifies the most simple 
essence of the divinity; and it is called that which the eye seeth not; and is attributed to 
God the Father, and hath its influence by the order of seraphims, or Hajoth Hakados, that 
is, creatures of holiness; and then by the primum mobile, it bestows the gift of being upon 
all things, and filleth the whole universe, both through the circumference and center; 
whose particular intelligence is called Merattron, that is the prince of faces, whose duty it 
is to bring others to the face of the Prince; and by him the Lord spake to Moses. 

The second name is Jod, or Tetragrammaton joined with Jod; his numeration is Hochma, 
that is, wisdom, and signifies the divinity full of ideas, and the First Begotten; and is 
attributed to the Son, and has its influence by the order of cherubins, or that the Hebrews 
call Orphanim, i. e. forms or wheels; and from thence into the starry heavens, where he 
frames so many figures as he hath ideas in himself, and distinguishes the very chaos of 
the creatures, by a particular intelligence called Raziel, who was the ruler of Adam. 

The third name is called Tetragrammaton Elohim; his numeration is named Prina, viz. 
providence and understanding; and signifies remissness, quietness, the jubilee, penitential 
conversion, a great trumpet, redemption of the world, and the life of the world to come: it 
is attributed to the Holy Spirit, and hath his influence by the order of thrones, or which 
the Hebrews call Abalim, that is great angels, mighty and strong; and from thence, by the 
sphere of Saturn, administers form to the unsettled matter, whose particular intelligence 
is Zaphkiel, the ruler of Noah, and another intelligence named Jophiel, the ruler of Sem; 
and these are the three supreme and highest numerations, as it were, seats of the divine 
persons, by whose command all things are made; but are executed by the other seven, 
which are therefore called numerations framing. 

The fourth name is El, whose numeration is Hesed, which signifies clemency or 
goodness; likewise grace, mercy, piety, magnificence, the scepter, and right-hand; and 



hath its influx by the order of dominations, which the Hebrews called Hasmalim; and so 
through the sphere of Jupiter fashions the images of bodies, bestowing clemency and 
pacifying justice on all: his particular intelligence is Zadkiel, the ruler of Abraham. 

The fifth name is Elohim Gibor, that is, the mighty God, punishing the sins of the 
wicked; and his numeration is called Gebusach, which is to say, power, gravity, fortitude, 
security, judgment, punishing by slaughter and war; and it is applied to the tribunal of 
God, the girdle, the sword, the left hand of God: it is also called Pachad, which is fear; 
and hath his influence through the order of powers, which the Hebrews call Seraphim, 
and from thence through the sphere of Mars, to whom belongs fortitude, war, and 
affliction. It draweth forth the elements; and his particular intelligence is Camael, the 
ruler of Samson. 

The sixth name is Eloha, or a name of four letters joined with Vaudahat; his numeration 
is Tiphereth, that is, apparel, beauty, glory, pleasure, and signifies the tree of life, and 
hath his influence through the order of virtues, which the Hebrews call Malachim, that is, 
angels, into the sphere of the sun, giving brightness and life to it, and from thence 
producing metals; his particular intelligence is Raphael, who was the ruler of Isaac and 
Toby the younger, and the angel Peliel, the Ruler of Jacob. 

The seventh name is Tetragrammaton Sabaoth, or Adonai Sabaoth, that is, the God of 
Hosts; and his numeration is Nezah, that is, triumph and victory: the right column is 
applied to it, and it signifies the justice and eternity of a revenging God; it hath its 
influence through the orders of principalities, whom the Hebrews call Elohim, i. e. Gods, 
into the sphere of Venus, gives zeal and love of righteousness, and produces vegetables; 
his intelligence is Haniel, and the angel Cerviel, the ruler of David. 

The eighth is called also Elohim Sabaoth, which is likewise the God of Hosts, not of war 
and justice, but of piety and agreement, for this name signifies both, and precedeth his 
army; the numeration of this is called Hod, which is, praise, confession, honour and fame; 
the left column is attributed to it; it hath his influence through the order of the archangels, 
which the Hebrews call Ben Elohim, that is, the sons of God, into the sphere of Mercury, 
and gives elegancy, and consonancy of speech, and produces living creatures; his 
intelligence is Michael, who was the ruler of Solomon. 

The ninth name is called Sadai, that is, Omnipotent, satisfying all, and Elhai, which is the 
Living God; his numeration is Jesod, that is, foundation, and signifies a good 
understanding, a covenant, redemption and rest; and hath his influence through the order 
of angels, whom the Hebrews name Cherubim, into the sphere of the moon causing the 
increase and decrease of all things, and provideth for the genii and keepers of men, and 
distributeth them; his intelligence is Gabriel, who was the keeper of Joseph, Joshua, and 
Daniel. 

The tenth name is Adonai Melech, that is, lord and king; his numeration is Malchuth, that 
is, kingdom and empire, and signifies a church, the temple of God, and a gate; and hath 
his influence through the order of Animastic, viz. of blessed souls, which, by the 
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Hebrews, is called Issim, that is, nobles, lords, and princes; they are inferior to the 
hierarchies, and have their influences on the sons of men, and give knowledge and the 
wonderful under standing of things, also industry and prophecy; and the soul of the 
Messiah is president amongst them, or the intelligence Merattron, which is called the first 
creature, or the soul of the world, who was the ruler of Moses. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. V. 

OF THE POWER AND VIRTUE OF THE DIVINE NAMES. 

GOD himself, though he be one only essence, yet hath divers names, which expound not 
his divers essences or deities; but certain properties flowing from him; by which names 
he pours down upon us, and all his creatures, many benefits; ten of those names we have 
above described. The Cabalists, from a certa in text of Exodus, derive seventy-two 
names, both of the angels and of God, which they call the name of seventy-two letters 
and Schemhamphores, that is, the expository. From these therefore, besides those which 
we have reckoned up before, is the name of the divine essence, Eheia, ???? which Plato 
translates ? ?, from hence they call God t???, others ?? ?, that is, the Being. Hu, ???, is 
another name revealed to Esay, signifying the abyss of the godhead, which the Greeks 
translate ta?t??, the Latins, himself the same. Esch, ?? , is another name received from 
Moses, which soundeth fire, and is the name of God; Na, ??, is to be invocated in 
perturbations and troubles. There is also the name Ja, ??, and the name Elion, ?????, and 
the name Macom, ????, the name Caphu, ??? the name Innon, ???? and the name Emeth, 
which is interpreted truth, and is the seal of God; and there are two other names, Zur, ??? 
and Aben, ???, both of these signify a solid work, and one of them expresseth the Father 
with the Son; and many names we have placed in the scale of numbers; and many names 
of God and the angels, are extracted out of the Holy Scriptures by our Cabala, and the 
Notarian and Gimetrian arts, where many words retracted by certain of their letters, make 
up one name; or one name dispersed by each of its letters, signifies or renders more. 
Sometimes they are gathered from the heads of words, as the name Agla, ????, from this 
verse of the Holy Scripture, viz.??????? ?????????, that is, the Mighty God for ever. In like 
manner the name Iaia, ????, from this verse, viz. ????????? ??????? that is, God our God is 
one God; in like manner the name Java, ????, from this verse, ??? ??? ???????, that is, let 
there be light and there was light: in like manner the name Ararita, ??????? from this 
verse, ??? ???  ?????? ???  ?????? ??????????, that is, one principal of his unity, one 
beginning of his individuality, his vicissitude is one thing; and this name Hacaba, ???? is 
extracted from this verse, ???????????? the holy and blessed One; in like manner this 
name, Jesu, ?? ? is found in the heads of these two verses, viz., ????? ??????, that is until the 
Messiah shall come; and the other verse,???? ? ?????, that is, his name abides till the end. 
Thus also is the name Amen, ???, extracted from this verse, ??????? ????, that is, the Lord 
is the faithful King. Sometimes these names are extracted from the ends of words, as the 
same Amen from this verse, ??? ???? ??? , that is, the wicked not so; but the letters are 
transposed: so, by the final letters of this verse, ???? ????? that is, to me what? or what is 
his name? is found the name Tetragrammaton: in all these a letter is put for a word, and a 
letter extracted from a word, either from the beginning, end, or where you please; and 
sometimes these names are extracted from all the letters, one by one, even as those seven-
two names of God are extracted from those three verses of Exodus, beginning from these 
three words, ????? ???? ??, the first and the last verses being written from the right to the 
left; but the middle contrariwise, from the left to the right, as we shall shew hereafter; and 
so sometimes a word is extracted from a word, or a name from a name, by the 
transposition of letters, as Messia, ?? ??, from Ismah, ?? ??, and Michael from Malachi, 
????? but sometimes by changing the alphabet, which the Cabalists call Ziruph, ????? so 
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from the name Tetragrammaton,????, are drawn forth ????, Maz-Paz, ????, Kuzu. 
Sometimes, by reason of the equality of the numbers, names are changed, as Merattron, 
??????, pro Sadai ? ??, for both of them make three hundred and fourteen; so Jiai, ???? and 
El, ??, are equal in number, for both make thirty-one; and these are the hidden secrets, 
concerning which it is most difficult to judge, or to deliver a perfect science; neither can 
they be understood or taught in any other language but the Hebrew. Therefore, these 
sacred words have not their power in magical operations from themselves, as they are 
words, but from the occult divine powers working by them in the mind of those who by 
faith adhere to them. 



  

We will here deliver unto thee a sacred seal, efficacious against any disease of man, or 
any griefs whatsoever, in whose fore-side are the four-squared names of God, so 
subordinate to one another in a square, that, from the highest to the lowest, those most 
holy names or seals of the godhead do arise, whose intention is inscribed in the 
circumference; but on the backside is inscribed the seven-lettered name Araritha, and his 

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



interpretation is written about, viz. the verse from which it is extracted, even as you may 
see in the annexed plate, where A represents the former part, B the hinder; but all this 
must be done in most pure gold, or virgin parchment, pure, clean, and unspotted; also 
with ink made of the smoke of consecrated wax-lights, or incense and holy water. The 
operator must be purified and cleansed, and have an infallible hope, a constant faith, and 
have his mind lifted up to the Most High God, if he would surely obtain this divine 
power. 

Now, against the depredations of evil spirits and men, and what dangers soever, either of 
journies, waters, enemies, arms, &c. in the same manner as is above said, these characters 
on the one side ?????, and these on the other ????, which are the beginnings and ends of the 
five first verses of Genesis, and representation of the creation of the world; and, by this 
ligature, they say that a man shall be free from all mischiefs, if that he firmly believes in 
God, the Creator of all things. 

Now these being done on a small plate of gold, as before described, (will be found to 
have the effect above mentioned); the figure of which you may likewise see in the 
annexed plate, fig. C and D, where C shows the former part, and B the hinder. 

Now let no one distrust or wonder, that sacred words and divine names applied 
outwardly, can effect wonderful things, seeing, by them, the Almighty created the 
heavens and the earth; for there is no name of God amongst us (according to Moses the 
Egyptian) which is not taken from his works, besides the name Tetragrammaton, which is 
holy, signifying the substance of the Creator in a pure signification. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. VI. 

OF INTELLIGENCES AND SPIRITS, AND OF THE THREE-FOLD KIND OF THEM, AND OF THEIR 
DIFFERENT NAMES, AND OF INFERNAL AND SUBTERRANEAL SPIRITS. 

NOW, consequently, we must discourse of intelligences, spirits, and angels. An 
intelligence is an intelligible substance, free from all gross and putrifying mass of a body, 
immortal, insensible, assisting all, having influence over all; and the nature of all 
intelligences, spirits, and angels is the same. But I call angels here, not those whom we 
usually call devils, but spirits so called from the propriety of the word, as it were, 
knowing, understanding, and wise. But of these, according to the tradition of magicians, 
there are three kinds; the first of which we call super-celestial, and minds altogether 
separated from a body, and, as it were, intellectual spheres worshipping one only God, as 
it were, their most firm and stable unity or centre. Wherefore they even call them Gods, 
by reason of a certain participation of the Divinity, for they are always full of God. These 
are only about God, and rule not the bodies of the world, neither are they fitted for the 
government of inferior things, but infuse the light received from God unto the inferior 
orders, and distribute every one's duty to all of them. The celestial intelligences do next 
follow these in the second order, which they call worldly angels, viz. being appointed, 
besides the divine worship for the spheres of the world, and for the government of every 
heaven and star; whence they are divided into so many orders as there are heavens in the 
world, and as there are stars in the heavens. And they called these Saturnine, who rule the 
heaven of Saturn, and Saturn himself; others Jovial, who rule the heaven of Jupiter, and 
Jupiter himself; and in like manner they name different angels, as well for the name as 
the virtue of the other stars; and because the old astrologers maintained fifty-five 
motions, therefore they invented so many intelligences or angels. They placed also in the 
starry heaven angels who 
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might rule the signs, triplicities, decans, quinaries, degrees and stars; for although the 
school of Peripatetics assign one only intelligence to each of the orbs of the stars, yet 
seeing every star and small part of the heaven hath its proper and different power and 
influence, it is necessary also that it have its ruling intelligence which may confer power 
and operate; therefore they have established twelve princes of the angels, who rule the 



twelve signs of the zodiac, and thirty-six who may rule so many decans, and seventy-two 
who may rule so many quinaries of heaven, and the tongues of men and nations, and four 
who may rule the triplicities and elements, and seven governors of the whole world, 
according to the seven planets; and they have given to all of them names and seals, which 
they call characters, and used them in their invocations, incantations and carvings, 
describing them in the instruments of their operations, images, plates, glasses, rings, 
papers, wax-lights, and such like. And if at any time they operated for the sun, they 
invocated by the name of the sun and by the names of solar angels, and so of the rest. 
Thirdly, they established angels as ministers for the disposing of those things which are 
below, which Origen called certain invisible powers, to which those things which are on 
earth are committed to be disposed of. For sometimes, they being visible to none do 
direct our journies and all our business, are often present at battles, and, by secret helps, 
do give the desired success to their friends; for, at their pleasure, they can procure 
prosperity, and inflict adversity. In like manner they distribute these into more orders, so 
as some are fiery, some watery, some aërial, some terrestrial; which four species of 
angels are computed according to the four powers of the celestial souls, viz. the mind, 
reason, imagination, and vivifying and moving nature; hence the fiery follow the mind of 
the celestial souls, whence they concur to the contemplation of more sublime things; but 
the aërial follow reason, and favour the rational faculty, and, after a certain manner, 
separate it from the sensitive and vegetative; therefore it serves for an active life, as the 
fiery the contemplative; but the watery follow the imagination, serve for a voluptuous 
life; the earthly following nature, favours vegetable nature. Moreover, they distinguish 
also this kind of angels into saturnine and jovial, according to the names of the stars and 
the heavens; farther, some are oriental, some Occidental, some meridional, some 
septentrional. Moreover, there is no part of the world destitute of the proper assistance of 
these angels, not because they are alone, but because they reign there especially; for they 
are every where, although some especially operate, and have their influence in this place, 
some elsewhere; neither truly are these things to be understood as though they were 
subject to the influence of the stars, but as they have correspondence with the heaven 
above the world, from whence especially all things are directed, and to which all things 
ought to be conformable; whence, as these angels are appointed for diverse stars, so also 
for diverse places and times; not that they are limited to any place or time, neither by the 
bodies which they are appointed to govern, but because the Divine Wisdom hath so 
decreed; therefore they favour more, and patronize those bodies, places, times, stars: so 
they have called some diurnal, some nocturnal, others meridional. In like manner some 
are called woodmen, some mountaineers, some fieldmen, some domestics: hence the 
gods of the woods, country gods, satyrs, familiars, fairies of the fountains, fairies of the 
woods, nymphs of the sea, the Naïades, Nereïdes, Dryades, Piërides, Hamadryades, 
Patumides, Hinnides Agapte, Pales, Parcades, Dodonæ, Fanilæ, Levernæ, Parcæ, Muses, 
Aonides, Castalides, Heliconides, Pegasides, Meonides, Phebiades, Carnenæ, the graces, 
the genii, hobgobblins, and such like; whence the vulgar call them superiors, some the 
demi-gods and goddesses: some of these are so familiar and acquainted with men, that 
they are even affected with human perturbations; by whose instructions Plato thinks that 
men do oftentimes wonderful things, even as by the instruction of men; some beasts 
which are most nigh to us, apes, dogs, elephants, do often strange things above their 
species; and they who have written the chronicles of the Danes and Norwegians, do 
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testify that spirits of several kinds in those regions are subject to men's commands; 
moreover, some of these appear corporeal and mortal, whose bodies are begotten and die; 
yet to be long-lived is the opinion of the Egyptians and Platonists, and especially 
approved by Proclus, Plutarch also, and Demetrius the philosopher, and Æmilianus the 
rhetorician, affirm the same; therefore of 

  



these spirits of the third kind, as the opinion of the Platonists is, they report that there are 
so many legions as there are stars in the heaven, and so many spirits in every legion as in 
heaven itself stars: but there are, (as Athanasius delivers,) who think, that the true number 
of the good spirits is according to the number of men, ninety-nine parts, according to the 
parable of the hundred sheep; others think only nine parts, according to the parable of the 
ten goats; others suppose the number of the angels equal with men, because it is written, 
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he that hath appointed the bounds of the people according to the number of the angels of 
God; and concerning their number many have written many things; but the latter 
theologians, following the masters of the sentences, Austin and Gregory, easily resolve 
themselves, saying, that the number of the good angels transcendeth human capacity; to 
the which, on the contrary, innumerable unclean spirits do correspond, there being so 
many in the inferior world as pure spirits in the superior; and some divines affirm that 
they have received this by revelation. Under these they place a kind of spirits 
subterraneous or obscure, which the Platonists call angels that failed, revengers of 
wickedness and ungodliness, according to the decree of the divine justice; and they call 
them evil angels and wicked spirits, because they often annoy and hurt, even of their own 
accord. Of these also they reckon more legions; and, in like manner, distinguishing them 
according to the names of the stars and elements, and parts of the world, they place over 
them kings, princes, and rulers; and the names of them: of these, four most mischievous 
kings rule over the other, according to the four parts of the world. Under these many 
more princes of legions govern, and many private officers; hence the Gorgones, 
Statenocte, the Furies; hence Tisiphone, Alecto, Megæra, Cerberus. They of this kind of 
spirits, Porphyry says, inhabit a place nigh the earth, yea within the earth itself; there is 
no mischief which they dare not commit; they have altogether a violent and hurtful 
nature, therefore they plot, and endeavour violent and sudden mischiefs; and when they 
make incursions, sometimes they lie hid, and sometimes offer open violence, and are very 
much delighted in all such things done wickedly and mischievously. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. VII. 

OF THE ORDER OF EVIL SPIRITS, AND THEIR FALL, AND DIFFERENT NATURES. 

THERE are some of the school of theologians, who distribute the evil spirits into nine 
degrees, as contrary to the nine orders of angels. Therefore, the first of these, which are 
called false gods, who, usurping the name of God, would be worshipped for gods, and 
require sacrifices and adorations; as that devil who said to Christ, "If thou wilt fall down 
and worship me, I will give thee all these things," shewing him all the kingdoms of the 
world; and the prince of these is he who said, I will ascend above the height of the clouds, 
and will be like to the Most High, who is called Beelzebub, that is, an old god. In the 
second place, follow the spirits of lies, of which sort was he who went forth, and was a 
lying spirit in the mouth of the prophet of Ahab; and the prince of these is the serpent 
Pytho, from whence Apollo is called Pythius, and that woman a Pythoness, or witch, in 
Samuel, and the other in the gospel, who had Pytho in her belly. Therefore, these kind of 
devils join themselves to the oracles, and delude men by divinations and predictions, so 
that they may be deceived. In the third order, are the vessels of iniquity, which are called 
vessels of wrath: these are the inventors of evil things, and all wicked arts; as in Plato, 
that devil Theutus, who taught cards and dice; for all wickedness, malice, and deformity, 
proceeds from these, of which in Genesis, in the benedictions of Simeon and Levi, Jacob 
said, "vessels of iniquity are in their habitations, into their counsel let not my soul come;" 
which the Psalmist calls vessels of death, Isaiah, vessels of fury; and Jeremiah, vessels of 
wrath; Ezekiel, vessels of destroying and slaying; and their prince is Belial, which 
signifies, without a yoke, and disobedient, a prevaricator, and an apostate; of whom Paul 
to the Corinthians says, "what agreement has Christ with Belial?" Fourthly, follow the 
revengers of evil, and their prince is Asmodeus, viz. causing judgment. After these, in the 
fifth place, come the deluders, who imitate miracles, and serve 
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conjurers and witches, and seduce the people by their miracles, as the serpent seduced 
Eve, and their prince is Satan, of whom it is written in the Revelation, "that he seduces 
the whole world, doing great signs, and causing fire to descend from heaven in the sight 
of men; seducing the inhabitants of the earth by these signs, which are given him to do." 
Sixthly, the aerial powers offer themselves and join themselves to thunder and lightning, 



corrupting the air, causing pestilences, and other evils; in the number of which are the 
four angels of whom the Revelations speak, to whom it is given to hurt the earth and the 
sea, holding the four winds from the four corners of the earth and their prince is called 
Meririm: he is the meridian devil, a boiling spirit, a devil raging in the south, whom Paul, 
to the Ephesians, calls "the prince of the power of the air, and the spirit which works in 
the children of disobedience." The seventh mansion the furies possess, who are powers of 
evil, discords, war, and devastation; whose name in the Revelation is called in Greek, 
Apollyon; in the Hebrew, Abaddon, that is, destroying and wasting. In the eighth place are 
the accusers or inquisitors, whose prince is Astaroth, that is, a searcher out; in the Greek 
language he is called Diabolus, that is, an accuser or calumniator; which in the Revelation 
is called the "accuser of the brethren, accusing them night and day before the face of 
God." Moreover, the tempters and ensnarers have the last place; one of which is present 
with every man, which we call the evil genius, and their prince is Mammon, which is 
interpreted covetousness. But we of the Cabala unanimously maintain that evil spirits do 
wander up and down this inferior world, enraged against, all whom we call devils; of 
whom Austin, in his first book of the Incarnation of the Word, to Januarius, says, 
concerning the devils and his angels contrary to virtues, the ecclesiastical preachers have 
taught that there are such things, but what they are, and who they are, he has not clear 
enough expounded: yet there is this opinion among them, that this devil was an angel, 
and being made an apostate, persuaded many of the angels to fall with him, who to this 
day are called his angels. Greece, notwithstanding, thinks not that these are damned, nor 
that they are all purposely evil; but that from the creation of the world the dispensation of 
things is ordained by this means, that the tormenting of sinful souls is made over to them. 
The other theologians say, that no devil was created evil, but that they were driven and 
cast out of heaven from the orders of good angels, for their pride whose fall not only our 
and the Hebrew theologians, but also the Assyrians, Arabians, Egyptians, and Greeks, do 
confirm by their tenets. Pherycies, the Assyrian, describes the fall of the devils; and 
Ophis, that is, the devilish serpent, was the head of that rebelling army; Trismegistus 
sings the same fall, in his Pimander; and Homer, under the name of Ararus, in his verses; 
and Plutarch, in his Discourse on Usury, signifies that Empedocles knew that the fall of 
the devils was in this manner; the devils themselves often confess their fall. They being 
cast out into this valley of misery, some that are near to us wander up and down in this 
obscure air; others inhabit lakes, rivers, and seas; others the earth, and terrify earthly 
things, and invade those who dig wells and metals, cause the gaping of the earth, to strike 
together the foundations of the mountains, and vex not only men but also other creatures; 
some being content with laughter and delusion only, do contrive rather to weary men than 
to hurt them; some heightening themselves to the length of a giant's body, and again 
shrinking themselves down to the smallest of pigmies, and changing themselves into 
different forms, to disturb men with vain fear; others study lies and blasphemies, as we 
read of one in third book of Kings, saying, "I will go forth and be a lying spirit in the 
mouth of all the prophets of Ahab." But the worst sort of devils are those who lie in wait, 
and overthrow passengers in their journies, and rejoice in wars and effusion of blood, and 
afflict men with most cruel stripes: we read of such in Matthew, "for fear of whom no 
man dare pass that way." Moreover, the Scripture reckons up nocturnal, diurnal, and 
meridional devils; and describes other spirits of wickedness by different names, as we 
read in Isaiah of satyrs, screech-owls, sirens, storks, owls; and in the Psalms, of asps, 
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basilisks, lions, dragons; and in the Gospel, we read of scorpions, and Mammon, and the 
prince of this world, and rulers of darkness, of all whom Beelzebub is the prince, whom 
the Scripture calls the Prince of wickedness. 

  

 



CHAP. VIII. 

OF THE ANNOYANCE OF EVIL SPIRITS, AND THE PRESERVATION WE HAVE FROM GOOD 
SPIRITS. 

IT is the opinion of divines, that all evil spirits are of that nature, that they hate God as 
well as man; therefore Divine Providence has set over us more pure spirits, with whom he 
hath entrusted us, as with shepherds and governors, that they should daily help us, and 
drive away evil spirits from us, and curb and restrain them, that they should not hurt us, 
as they would otherwise; as is read in Tobias, that Raphael did apprehend the demon 
called Asmodeus, and bound him in the wilderness of the Upper Egypt. Of these, Hesiod 
says, there are 30,000 of Jupiter's immortal spirits living on the earth, who are the keepers 
of mortal men, who, that they might observe justice and merciful deeds, having clothed 
themselves with air, go to and fro every where on the earth. For there is no potentate 
could be safe, nor any woman continue uncorrupted, no man in this vale of ignorance 
could come to the end appointed to him by God, if good spirits did not secure us, or if 
evil spirits should be permitted to satisfy the wills of men; as therefore among the good 
there is a proper keeper or protector deputed to every one, corroborating the spirit of the 
man to good; so of evil spirits, there is sent forth an enemy ruling over the flesh and 
desire thereof; and the good spirit fights for us as a preserver against the enemy and flesh. 
Now man, between these contenders is in the middle, and left in the hand of his own 
counsel, to whom he will give victory: we cannot therefore accuse angels, or deny free-
will, if they do not bring the nations entrusted to them to the knowledge of the true God 
and true piety, but suffer them to fall into errors and perverse worship; it is to be imputed 
to themselves, who have, of their own accord, declined from the right path, adhering to 
the spirits of error, giving victory to the devil: for it is in the hand of man to adhere to 
whom he pleases, and overcome whom he will; by whom if once the devil be overcome, 
he is made his servant, and being overcome, cannot fight any more with another, as a 
wasp that has lost his sting. To which opinion Origen assents, in his book Periarchon, 
concluding that the saints fight against evil spirits, and overcoming, do lessen their army; 
neither can he that is overcome by any molest any more. As therefore there is given to 
every man a good spirit, so there is given to every man an evil diabolical spirit, whereof 
each seeks an union with our spirit, and endeavours to attract it to itself, and to be mixed 
with it, as wine with water; the good indeed, through all good works comformable to 
itself, change us into angels by uniting us; as it is written of John the Baptist in Malachi, 
"behold I send my angel before thy face;" of which transmutation and union it is written 
elsewhere, he that adheres to God is made one spirit with him. An evil spirit also, by evil 
works, studies to make us conformable to itself, and unite us, as Christ says of Judas, 
"Have not I chosen twelve, and one of you is a devil?" And this is that which Hermes 
says, when a spirit hath influence on the soul of man, he scatters the seed of his own 
notion, whence such a soul, being sown with seeds, and full of fury, brings forth thence 
wonderful things, and whatsoever are the offices of spirits: for when a good spirit hath 
influence on a holy soul, it does exalt it to the light of wisdom; but an evil spirit being 
transfused into a wicked soul, doth stir it up to theft, to man-slaughter, to lust, and 
whatsoever are the offices of evil spirits. Good spirits, as Jamblicus says, purge the souls 
most perfectly, and some bestow upon us other good things: they being present, do give 
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health to the body, virtue to the soul, and security; what is mortal in us they take away, 
cherish heat, and make it more efficacious to life; and, by an harmony, do always infuse 
light into an intelligible mind. But whether there be many keepers of a man, or one alone, 
theologians differ among themselves: we think there are more, the prophet saying, "he 
hath given his angels a charge concerning thee, that they should keep thee in all thy 
ways," which, as Hierome says, is to be understood of any man, as well as of Christ. All 
men, therefore, are governed by the ministry of different angels, and are brought to any 
degree of virtue, deserts, and dignity, who behave themselves worthy of them; but they 
who carry themselves unworthy of them, are deposed and thrust down, as well by evil 
spirits as good spirits, unto the lowest degree of misery, as their evil merits shall require; 
but they that are attributed to the sublimer angels are preferred before other men; for 
angels having the care of them, exalt them, and subject others to them by a certain occult 
power, which, although neither of them perceive, yet he that is subjected feels a certain 
yoke of presidency, of which he cannot easily quit himself; yea, he fears and reverences 
that power, which the superior angels make to flow upon inferiors, and with a certain 
terror bring the inferiors into a fear of presidency. This did Homer seem to be sensible of, 
when he says, that the Muses begot of Jupiter, did always, as inseparable companions, 
assist the kings begot of Jupiter, speaking figuratively, who by them were made 
venerable and magnificent: so we read that M. Antoninus being formerly joined in 
singular friendship with Octavius Augustus, were accustomed always to play together; 
but when, as always, Augustus always went away Conqueror, a certain magician 
counselled M. Antoninus thus: "O Anthony, what dost thou do with that young man? 
Shun and avoid him, for although thou art older than he, and art more skilful than he, and 
art better descended than he, and hath endured the wars of more emperors, yet thy Genius 
doth much dread the Genius of this young man, and thy fortune flatters his fortune; unless 
thou shalt shun him, it seems wholly to decline to him." Is not the prince like other men? 
how should other men fear and reverence him, unless a divine terror should exalt him, 
and striking a fear into others, depress them, that they should reverence him as a prince? 
Wherefore we must endeavour, that, being purified by doing well, and following sublime 
things, and choosing opportune times and seasons, we be entrusted or committed to a 
degree of sublimer and more potent angels, who taking care of us we may deservedly be 
preferred before others. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. IX. 

THAT THERE IS A THREEFOLD KEEPER OF MAN, AND FROM WHENCE EACH OF THEM 
PROCEED. 

EVERY man hath a threefold good demon as a proper keeper or preserver, the one 
whereof is holy, another of the nativity, and the other of profession. The holy demon is 
one, according to the doctrine of the Egyptians, assigned to the rational soul, not from the 
stars or planets, but from a supernatural cause--from God himself, the president of 
demons, being universal and above nature. This directs the life of the soul, and does 
always put good thoughts into the mind, being always active in illuminating us, although 
we do not always take notice of it; but when we are purified and live peaceably, then it is 
perceived by us, then it does, as it were, speak with us, and communicates its voice to us, 
being before silent, and studies daily to bring us to a sacred perfection. So it falls out that 
some profit more in any science, or art, or office, in a less time and with little pains, when 
another takes much pains and studies hard, and all in vain; and although no science, art or 
virtue, is to be contemned, yet that you may live prosperously, carry on thy affairs 
happily, in the first place, know thy good genius, and his nature, and what good the 
celestial disposition promises thee, and God the distributer of all these, who distributes to 
each as he pleases, and follow the beginnings of these, profess these, be conversant in 
that virtue to which the most high distributer doth elevate and lead thee; who made 
Abraham excel in justice and clemency, Isaac with fear, Jacob with strength, Moses with 
meekness and miracles, Joshua in war, Phineas in zeal, David in religion and victory, 
Solomon in knowledge and fame, Peter in faith, John in charity, Jacob in devotion, 
Thomas in prudence, Magdalen in contemplation, Martha in officiousness. Therefore in 
what virtue you think you can most easily be a proficient in, use diligence to attain to the 
height thereof, that you may excel in one, when in many you cannot, but in the rest 
endeavour to be as great a proficient as you can; but if thou shalt have the overseers of 
nature and religion agreeable, thou shalt find a double progress of thy nature and 
profession; but if they shall be disagreeing, follow the better, for thou shalt better 
perceive at some time a preserver of an excellent profession than of nativity. 
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CHAP. X. 

OF THE TONGUE OF ANGELS, AND OF THEIR SPEAKING AMONGST THEMSELVES AND 
WITH US. 

WE might doubt whether angels or demons, since they are pure spirits, use any vocal 
speech or tongue among themselves or to us; but that Paul, in some place says, "if I speak 
with the tongue of men or angels;"--but what their speech or tongue is, is much doubted 
by many. For many think that if they use any idiom, it is Hebrew, because that was first 
of all, and came from heaven, and was before the confusion of languages in Babylon, in 
which the law was given by God the Father, and the gospel was preached by Christ the 
Son, and so many oracles were given to the prophets by the Holy Ghost; and seeing all 
tongues have and do undergo various mutations and corruptions, this alone does always 
continue inviolated. Moreover, an evident sign of this opinion is, that though this demon 
and intelligence do use the speech of those nations with whom they do inhabit, yet, to 
them who understand it, they never speak in any idiom but in this alone, viz. Hebrew. But 
now, how angels speak, it is hid from us, as they themselves are. Now, to us, that we may 
speak, a tongue is necessary with other instruments; as the jaws, palate, lips, teeth, throat, 
lungs, the aspera artertia, and muscles of the breast, which have the beginning of motion 
from the soul. But if I speak at a distance to another, he must use a louder voice; but, if 
near, he whispers in my ear, as if he should be coupled to the hearer, without any noise, 
as an image in the eye or glass. So souls going out of the body, so angels, so demons 
speak; and what man does with a sensible voice, they do by impressing the conception of 
the speech in those to whom they speak after a better manner than if they should express 
it in an audible voice. So the Platonist says, that Socrates perceived his demon by sense, 
indeed, but not of this body, but by the sense of the etherial body concealed in this; after 
which manner. Avicen believes the angels were wont to be seen and heard by the 
prophets. That instrument, whatsoever the virtue be, by which one spirit makes known to 
another spirit what things are in his mind, is called by the apostle Paul, the tongue of 
angels. Yet oftentimes they send forth an audible voice, as they that cried at the ascension 
of the Lord, Ye men of Galilee, why stand ye here gazing unto the heaven? And in the 
old law they spake with divers of the fathers with a sensible voice; but this never but 
when they assumed bodies. But with what senses these spirits and demons hear our 
invocations and prayers, and see our ceremonies, we are altogether ignorant. 

For there is a spiritual body, of demons every where sensible by nature, so that it touches, 
sees, hears without any medium, and nothing can be an impediment to it; yet they do not 
perceive after the same manner as we do, with different organs, but haply as sponges 
drink in water, so do they all sensible things with their body or some other way unknown 
to us; neither are all animals endowed with those organs, for we know that many want 
ears, yet we know they perceive a sound, but after what manner we know not. 

 

 



CHAP. XI. 

OF THE NAMES OF SPIRITS, AND THEIR VARIOUS IMPOSITION, AND OF THE SPIRITS THAT 
ARE SET OVER THE STARS, SIGNS, CORNERS OF THE HEAVEN, AND THE ELEMENTS. 

MANY and different are the names of good and bad spirits; but their proper and true 
names, as those of the stars, are known to God alone, who only numbers the multitude of 
stars, and calls them by their names, whereof none can be known by us but by divine 
revelation; very few are expressed to us in sacred writ. But the masters of the Hebrews 
think, that the names of angels are imposed on them by Adam, according to that which is 
written, "the Lord brought all things which he had made unto Adam, that he should name 
them, and as he called any thing, so the name of it was." Hence the Hebrew Mecubals 
think, together with Magicians and Cabalists, that it is in the power of man, to impose 
names upon spirits, but of such a man only who is dignified and elevated to this virtue by 
some divine gift or sacred authority: but because a name that may express the nature of 
divinity, or the whole virtue of angelical essences, cannot be made by any human voice, 
therefore names for the most part are put upon them from their works, signifying some 
certain office or effect which is required by the quire of spirits; which name then, and not 
otherwise, obtains efficacy and virtue to draw any spiritual substance from above, or 
beneath, to make any desired effect. 

I have seen and known some writing on virgin parchment the name and seal of some 
spirit in the hour of the moon, which afterwards he gave to be devoured by a water-frog, 
and had muttered over some verse; the frog being let go into the water, rains and showers 
presently followed. I saw also the same man inscribing the name of another spirit with the 
seal thereof in the hour of Mars, which was given to a crow, who, being let go, after a 
verse muttered over, there followed from that part of the heaven whither it flew, 
lightnings, shaking, and horrible thunders, with thick clouds; neither were those names of 
spirits of an unknown tongue, neither did they signify any thing else but their offices; of 
this kind are the names of those angels, Raziel, Gabriel, Michael, Raphael, Haniel, which 
is as much as to say the vision of God, the virtue of God, the strength of God, the 
medicine of God, the glory of God. In like manner, in the offices of evil demons are read 
their names, viz. a player, a deceiver, a dreamer, a fornicator, and many such like. So we 
receive from many of the ancient fathers of the Hebrews the names of angels set over the 
planets and signs; over Saturn, Zaphiel; over Jupiter, Zadkiel; over Mars, Camael; over 
the Sun, Raphael; over Venus, Haniel; over Mercury, Michael; over the Moon, Gabriel. 
These are those seven spirits which always stand before the face of God, to whom is 
entrusted the disposing the whole celestial and terrene kingdoms which are under the 
moon: for these (as the more curious theologians say) govern all things by a certain 
vicissitude of hours, days, and years; as the astrologers teach concerning the planets 
which they are set over, which Mercurius Trismegistus calls the seven governors of the 
world, who, by the heavens as by instruments, distribute the influences of all the stars and 
signs upon their inferiors. There are some who ascribe them to the stars by names 
somewhat differing, saying, that over Saturn is set an intelligence called Oriphael, over 
Jupiter Zachariel, over Mars Zamael, over the Sun Michael, over Venus Anael, over 
Mercury Raphael, over the Moon Gabriel. And every one of these governs the world 354 
years and four months; and the government begins from the intelligence of Saturn; 
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afterwards, in order, the intelligences of Venus, Jupiter, Mercury, Mars, the Moon, and 
the Sun reign, and the government returns to the spirit of Saturn. 

Tritemius writ to Maximilian Cæsar a special treatise concerning these, which he that will 
thoroughly examine may from thence draw great knowledge of future times.  1Over the 
twelve signs are set these, viz. over Aries, Malahidael; over Taurus, Asmodel; over 
Gemini, Ambriel; over Cancer, Muriel; over Leo, Verchiel; over Virgo, Hamaliel; over 
Libra, Zuriel; over Scorpio, Barchiel; over Sagittarius, Advachiel; over Capricorn, 
Hanael; over Aquarius, Cambiel; over Pisces, Barchiel. Of these spirits set over the 
planets and signs, signs, John made mention of in the Revelation, speaking of the former 
in the beginning; and the seven spirits which are in the presence of the throne of God, 
which I find are set over the seven planets, in the end of the book, where he describes the 
platform of the heavenly city, saying, that on the twelve orates thereof are twelve angels. 
There are again twenty-eight angels, who rule in the twenty-eight mansions of the moon, 
whose names are these; Geniel, Enediel, Anixiel, Azariel, Gabriel, Dirachiel, Scheliel, 
Amnediel, Barbiel, Ardefiel, Neciel, Abdizuel, Jazeriel, Ergediel, Atliel, Azeruel, Adriel, 
Egibiel, Amutiel, Kyriel, Bethnael, Geliel, Requiel, Abrinael, Agiel, Tagriel, Atheniel, 
Amnixiel. There are also four princes of the angels, which are set over the four winds, and 
over the four parts of the world. Michael is placed over the east-wind, Raphael over the 
west, Gabriel over the north, Nariel, who by some is called Ariel, is over the south. There 
are also assigned to the elements these, viz. to the air Cherub, to the water Tharsis, to the 
earth Ariel, to the fire Seraph. Now every one of these spirits is a great prince, and has 
much power and freedom in the dominion of his own planets and signs, and in their 
times, years, months, days and hours: and in their elements, and parts of the world, and 
winds. And every one of them rules over many legions; and after the same manner, 
among evil spirits, there are four, who, as most potent kings, are set over the rest, 
according to the four parts of the world, whose names are these, viz. Urieus, king of the 
east; Amaymon, king of the south; Paymon, king of the west; Egin, king, of the north; 
which the Hebrew doctors perhaps call more rightly thus, Samuel, Azazel, Azael, and 
Mahazuel, under whom many others rule as princes of legions and rulers. Likewise there 
are innumerable demons of private offices. Moreover, the ancient theologians of the 
Greeks reckon up six demons, which they call Telchines, others Alastores; which bearing 
ill-will to men, take up water out of the river Styx with their hands, sprinkle it upon the 
earth, whence follow calamities, plagues, and famines; and these are said to be Acteus, 
Megalezius, Ormenus, Lycus, Nicon, Mimon. But he that desires to know exactly the 
distinct names, offices, places, and times of angels, and evil demons, let him inquire into 
the book of Rabbi Simon of the Temples, and in his book of Lights, and in his treatise of 
the Greatness of Stature, and in the treatise of the Temples of Rabbi Ishmael, and in 
almost all the commentaries of his book of Formation, and he shall find it written at large 
concerning them. 

 

Footnotes 

56:1 TRITEMIUS on Spirits. 



CHAP. XII. 

THE CABALISTS DRAW FORTH THE SACRED NAMES OF ANGELS FROM SACRED WRIT, AND 
OF THE SEVENTY-TWO ANGELS, WHO BEAR THE NAMES OF GOD; WITH THE TABLES OF 
ZIRUPH AND THE COMMUTATIONS OF NAMES AND NUMBERS. 

THERE are also other sacred names of good and evil spirits deputed to each office of 
much greater efficacy than the former, which the Cabalists draw from sacred writ, 
according to that art which we teach concerning them; as also certain names of God are 
drawn forth out of certain places: the general rule of these is, that wheresoever any thing 
of divine essence is expressed in the Scripture, from that place the name of God may be 
gathered; but in what place soever in the Scripture the name of God is found expressed, 
then mark what office lies under that name; wheresoever therefore the Scripture speaks of 
the office or work of any spirit, good or bad, from thence the name of that spirit, whether 
good or bad, may be gathered; this unalterable rule being observed, that of good spirits 
we receive the names of good spirits, of evil the names of evil: and let us not confound 
black with white, nor day with night, nor light with darkness, which, by these verses as 
by an example, is manifest: 

"Let them be as dust before the face of the wind; and let the angel of the Lord scatter 
them: let their ways be darkness and slippery and let the angel of the Lord pursue them." 

???? ???? ???? ??? ?????? ??????? 
??????? ??? ???? ???? ???? ???? 

in the xxxvth Psalm with the Hebrews, but with us, the xxxivth; of which the names of 
those angels are drawn, ????? Midael, and ????? Miriael, of the order of warriors; so of 
that verse, "thou shall set over him the wicked, and Satan shall stand at his right-hand," 
out of Psalm cix. with the Hebrews, but with the Latins, cviii. 

???? ???? ?? ?? ?????? ????? 

is extracted the name of the evil spirit Schii, ? ??? which signifies a spirit that is a worker 
of engines. There is a certain text in Exodus contained in three verses, whereof every one 
is written with seventy-two letters, beginning thus; the first Vajisa, ????, the second 
Vajabo, ???? the third Vajot, ??? which are extended into one line, viz. the first and the 
third from the left-hand to the right, but the middle in a contrary order, beginning from 
the right to the left, is terminated on the left-hand; then each of the three letters being 
subordinate the one to the other, make one name, which are seventy-two names, which 
the Hebrews called Schemhamphoræ, to which if the divine name El ?? or Jah ??? be 
added, they produce seventy-two trisyllable names of angels, whereof every one carries 
the great name of God, as it is written, "my angel shall go before thee; observe him, for 
my name is in him." And these are those that are set over the seventy-two celestial 
quinaries, and so many nations and tongues, and joints of man's body, and cooperate with 
the seventy-two seniors of the synagogue, and so many disciples of Christ: and their 
names, according to the extraction which the Cabalists make, are manifest in the 
following table, according to the manner which we have mentioned. 
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Now there are many other ways of making Schemhamphoræ out of those verses; as when 
all three are written in a right order, one after the other, from the right to the left, besides 
those which are extracted by the tables of Ziruph, and the tables of commutations, of 
which we made mention of before. Because these tables serve for all names, as divine, so 
angelical, we shall therefore subjoin them to this chapter. 

These are the seventy-two angels, bearing the name of God, Schemhamphoræ. 

For the tables, &c. see the annexed Plates, No. 1, 2, 3, 4. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. XIII. 

OF FINDING OUT THE NAMES OF SPIRITS AND GENII, FROM THE DISPOSITION OF THE 
CELESTIAL BODIES. 

THE ancient magicians taught an art of finding out the name of a spirit to any desired 
effect, drawing it from the disposition of the heavens; as, for example, any celestial 
harmony being proposed to thee, to make an image or a ring, or any other work to be 
done under any constellation, if thou wilt find out the spirit that is the ruler of that work, 
the figure of the heaven being erected, cast forth letters in their number and order, from 
the degree of the ascendant, according to the succession of signs through each degree, by 
filling the whole circle of the heavens; then those letters which fall into the places of the 
stars, the aid of which you would use, being according to the number and power of those 
stars marked without into number and order, make the name of a good spirit. But if thou 
wilt do so from the beginning of a degree falling against the progress of the signs, the 
resulting spirit shall be evil. By this art some of the Hebrews and Chaldean masters teach 
that the, nature and name of any genius may be found out; as for example, the degree of 
the ascendant of any one's nativity being known, and the other corners of the heaven 
being co-equated, then let that which has the most dignities of planets in those four 
corners, which the Arabians call Almutez, be first observed among the rest; and according 
to that in the second place, that which shall be next to it in the number of dignities, and so 
in order the rest of them, which obtain any dignity in the aforesaid corners. 

This order being used, you may know the true place and degree of them in the heavens, 
beginning from the degree of the ascendant through each degree, according to the order 
of signs, to cast twenty-two of the letters of the Hebrews; then what letters shall fall into 
the places of the aforesaid stars, being marked and disposed according to the order found 
out above in the stars, and rightly joined together according to the rules of the Hebrew 
tongue, make the name of a genius; to which, according to the custom, some 
monosyllable name of Divine Omnipotence, viz. El or Jah, is subjoined. But if the casting 
of the letters be made from an angle of the falling, and against the succession of the signs, 
and the letters which shall fall in the Nadir (that is the opposite point) of the aforesaid 
stars be after that order, as are said, joined together, shall make the name of an evil 
genius. 

But the Chaldeans proceed another way, for they take not the Almutez of the angles but 
the Almutez of the eleventh house, and do all things as has been said. Now they find out 
an evil genius from the Almutez of the angle of the twelfth house, which they call an evil 
spirit, casting from the degree of the falling against the progress of the signs. 
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CHAP. XIV. 

OF THE CALCULATING ART OF SUCH NAMES BY THE TRADITION OF CABALISTS. 

THERE is yet another art of these kind of names, which they call calculatory; and it is 
made by the following tables, by entering with some sacred, divine, or angelical name, in 
the column of letters descending, by taking those letters which thou shalt find in the 
common angles under their stars and signs, which being reduced into order, the name of a 
good spirit is made of the nature of that star or sign under which thou didst enter; but if 
thou shalt enter in the column ascending, by taking the common angles above the stars 
and signs marked in the lowest line, the name of an evil spirit is made. And these are the 
names of spirits of any order of heaven ministering, as of good, so of bad, which you may 
after this manner multiply into nine names of so many orders; inasmuch as you may, by 
entering with one name, draw forth another of a spirit of a superior order out of the same, 
as well of a good as a bad one; yet the beginning of this calculation depends upon the 
names of God; for every word hath a virtue in magic, inasmuch as it depends on the word 
of God, and is thence framed. Therefore we must know that every angelical name must 
proceed from some primary name of God. Therefore angels are said to bear the name of 
God, according to that which is written, "because my name is in him;" therefore that the 
names of good angels may be discerned from the names of bad, there is wont oftentimes 
to be added some name of Divine Omnipotence, as El, or On, or Jah, or Jod, and to be 
pronounced together with it: and because Jah is a name of beneficence, and Jod the name 
of a deity, therefore these two names are put only to the names of angels; but the name 
El, because it imports power and virtue, is therefore added, not only to good but bad 
spirits; for neither can evil spirits either subsist or do any thing without the virtue of El, 
God. But we must know that common angles of the same star and sign are to be taken, 
unless entrance be made with a mixt name, as are the names of genii, and those of which 
it hath been spoken in the preceding chapter, which are made of the dispositions of the 
heavens, according to the harmony of divers stars. For as often as the table is to be 
entered with these, the common angle is to be taken under the star or sign of him that 
enters. 

There are moreover some that do so extend those tables that they think also if there be an 
entrance made with the name of a star, or office, or any desired effect, a demon, whether 
good or bad, serving to that office or effect may be drawn out; upon the same account 
they that enter with the proper name of any person can extract the names of the genii 
under that star which shall appear to be over such a person as they shall, by his 
physiognomy, or by the passions and inclinations of his mind, and by his profession and 
fortune, know him to be either martial, or saturnine, or solary, or of the nature of any 
other star. 

And although such kind of primary names have none or little power by their signification, 
yet such kind of extracted names, and such as are derived from them, are of very great 
efficacy; as the rays of the sun collected in a hollow glass do most intensely burn, the sun 
itself being scarce warm. 
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Now there is an order of letters in those tables under the stars and signs, almost like that 
which is with the astrologers, of tens, elevens, twelves. Of this calculatory art Alphonsus 
Cyprius once wrote, and also fitted it to Latin characters; but because the letters of every 
tongue, as we shewed in the first book, have, in their number, order and figure, a celestial 
and divine original, I shall easily grant this calculation concerning the names of spirits to 
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be made not only by Hebrew letters, but also Chaldean, Arabick, Egyptian, Greek and 
Latin, and many others, the tables being rightly made after the imitation of the presidents. 

But here it is objected by many, that it falls out that in these tables men of a differing 
nature and fortune do oftentimes, by reason of the sameness of name, obtain the same 
genius of the same name. We must know therefore that it must not be thought absurd, that 
the same daemon may be separated from any one soul, and the same be set over more. 
Besides, as many men have the same name, so also spirits of divers offices or natures 
may be noted or marked by one name, and by one and the same seal or character, yet in a 
different respect; for as the serpent does sometimes typify Christ, and sometimes the 
devil, so the same names and the same seals may be applied sometimes to the order of a 
good demon, sometimes of a bad one. Lastly, the very ardent intention of the invocator, 
by which our intellect is joined to the separated intelligences, is the cause that we have 
sometimes one spirit, sometimes another, (although called upon under the same name,) 
made obsequious to us. 

See the following Plates for the tables of the calculation of the names of spirits, good and 
bad, under the presidency of the seven planets, and under the order of the twelve militant 
signs. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. XV. 

OF THE CHARACTERS AND SEALS OF SPIRITS. 

WE must now speak of the characters and seals of spirits. Characters are nothing else 
than certain unknown letters and writings, preserving the secrets of spirits and their 
names from the use and reading of prophane men, which the ancient called 
hieroglyphical, or sacred letters, because devoted to the secrets of God only. They 
accounted it unlawful to write the mysteries of God with those characters which prophane 
and vulgar things were wrote. Whence Porphyry says, "that the ancients were willing to 
conceal God and divine virtues, by sensible figures and by those things which are visible, 
yet signifying invisible things;" as being willing to deliver great mysteries in sacred 
letters, and explain them in certain symbolical figures; as when they dedicated all round 
things to the world, the sun and the moon, hope and fortune; a circle to the heavens, and 
parts of a circle to the moon; pyramids and obelisks to the fire, a cylinder to the sun and 
earth.--See the plate. 
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CHAP. XVI. 

ANOTHER WAY OF MAKING CHARACTERS, ACCORDING TO THE CABALISTS. 

AMONG the Hebrews I find more fashions of characters, whereof one is most ancient, 
viz. an ancient writing which Moses and the prophets used, the form of which is not 
rashly to be discovered to any; for those letters which they use at this day were instituted 
by Esdras. There is among them a writing which they call celestial, because they shew it 
placed and figured among the 
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stars. There is also a writing which they call Malachim, or Melachim, i. e. of angels, or 
regal; there is also another, which they call the passing through the river, and the 
characters and figures of all which you may see in the following Plates. 

There is another manner among the Cabalists, formerly held in great esteem, but now it is 
so common that it is placed among prophane things, viz. the twenty-seven characters of 
the Hebrews may be divided into three classes, whereof every one contains nine letters. 



The first, viz. ????????? which are the seals or marks of simple numbers and of intellectual 
things distributed into nine orders of angels. The second hath ?????????, the marks of tens 
and celestial things in the nine orbs of the heavens. The third hath the other four letters, 
with the five final, viz. ??? ????? which are marks of hundreds, and inferior things, viz. 
four simple elements, and five kinds of perfect com pounds. They do now and then 
distribute these three classes into nine chambers, the first is of units, vi-,. intellectual, 
celestial and elemental. The second is of two's, the third of three's, and so of the rest; 
these chambers are framed by the intersection of four parallel lines intersecting 
themselves into right angles, as is expressed in the following Plate, fig. A. 

Out of which, being dissected into parts, proceed nine particular figures (See Plate, fig. 
B.) which are of the nine chambers, characterizing their letters by that Notariacon, which, 
if it be of one point, shews the first letter of that chamber; if of two, the second; if of 
three, the third letter; as if you would frame the character, Michael, ?????, that comes 
forth extended with five figures (for which see the Plate C.) which are contracted to three 
figures, which then are contracted into one, yet the points Notariacon are usually omitted, 
and then there comes forth such a character of Michael. See fig. D. 

There is yet another fashion of characters common to almost all letters and tongues, and 
very easy, which is by gathering together of letters; as if the name of the angel Michael 
be given, the characters thereof shall be framed according to the fig. E. 

And this fashion among the Arabians is most received; neither is there any writing which 
is so readily and elegantly joined to itself as the Arabick. You must know that angelical 
spirits, seeing they are of a pure intellect, and altogether incorporeal, are not marked with 
any marks or characters, or any other human signs; but we, not otherwise knowing their 
essence or quality, do, from their names, or works, or otherwise, devote and consecrate to 
them figures and marks, by which we cannot any way compel them to us, but by which 
we rise up to them, as not to be known by such characters and figures, and, first of all, we 
do set our senses, both inward and outward, upon them; then, by a certain admiration of 
our reason, we are induced to a religious veneration of them; and then are wrapt with our 
whole mind into an ecstatical adoration; and then with a wonderful belief, an undoubted 
hope, and quickening love, calling upon them in spirit and truth by true names and 
characters, do obtain from them that virtue or power which we desire. 
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CHAP. XVII. 

THERE IS ANOTHER KIND OF CHARACTERS, OR MARKS OF SPIRITS, WHICH ARE RECEIVED 
ONLY BY REVELATION. 

THERE is another kind of character received by revelation only, which can be found out 
no other way; the virtue of which characters is from the Deity revealing; of whom there 
are some secret works breathing out a harmony of some divinity, or they are, as it were, 
some certain agreements or compacts of a league between us and them. Of this kind there 
was a sign shewed to Constantine, which was this, in hoc vince; there was another 
revealed to Antiochus in the figure of a Pentangle, which signifies health; for, 

  



  

being resolved into letters, it speaks the word ???e?a i. e. health: in the faith and virtue of 
which signs, both kings obtained a great victory against their enemies. So Judas, who by 
reason of that, was afterwards surnamed Machabeus, being to fight with the Jews against 
Antiochus Eupator, received from an angel a notable sign, ???? in the virtue of which they 
first slew 11,000, with an infinite number of elephants, then again 35,000 of their 
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enemies: for that sign did represent the name of Jehovah, and was a memorable emblem 
of the name of seventy-two letters by the equality of number; and the exposition thereof 
is ?? ???? ???? ????? i. e. who is there among thee strong as Jehovah? See Plate, fig. F. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



CHAP. XIX. 

BY WHAT MEANS MAGICIANS AND NECROMANCERS CALL FORTH THE 
SOULS OF THE DEAD. 

BY the things which have been already spoken it is manifest, that souls after death do as 
yet love their body which they left, as those souls do whose bodies want due burial or 
have left their bodies by violent death, and as yet wander about their carcasses in a 
troubled and moist spirit, being, as it were, allured by something that hath an affinity with 
them, the means being known, by which in times past, they were joined to their bodies, 
they may be easily called forth and allured by the like vapours, liquors and savours, 
certain artificial lights being also used, songs, sounds, and such like, which moves the 
imaginative and spiritual harmony of the soul; and sacred invocations, and such like, as 
belong to religion, ought not to be neglected by reason of the portion of the rational soul 
which is above nature. 

Necromancy has its name because it works on the bodies of the dead, and gives answers 
by the ghosts and apparitions of the dead, and subterraneous spirits, alluring them into the 
carcasses of the dead by certain hellish charms, and infernal invocations, and by deadly 
sacrifices and wicked oblations. 

There are two kinds of necromancy: raising the carcasses, which is not done without 
blood; the other sciomancy, in which the calling up of the shadow only suffices. To 
conclude, it works all its experiments by the carcasses of the slain and their bones and 
members, and what is from them; for there is in these things a spiritual power friendly to 
them: therefore they easily allure the flowing down of wicked spirits, by reason of the 
similitude and property of every familiar, by whom the necromancer, strengthened by 
their help, can do much in human and terrestrial things, and kindle unlawful lusts, cause 
dreams, diseases, hatred, and such like passions; to which also they can confer the powers 
of the soul, which as yet being involved in a moist and turbid spirit, wandering about 
their cast bodies, can do the same things that the wicked spirits commit, seeing therefore 
they, experimentally find, that the wicked and impure souls violently plucked from their 
bodies, and of men not expiated, and wanting burial, do stray about carcasses, and are 
drawn to them by affinity. The witches easily abuse them for effecting witchcraft, 
alluring these unhappy souls, by the opposition of their body, or by the taking of some 
parts thereof, and compelling them by their devilish charms, by entreating them by the 
deformed carcasses dispersed through the wide fields, and the wandering shadows of 
those who want burials, and by the ghosts sent back from Acheron, and the guests of hell, 
whom untimely death has precipitated into hell, and by the horrible desires of the damned 
and proud devils, revengers of wickedness. But he who could restore the souls truly to 
their bodies, must first know what is the proper nature of the soul from whence it went 
forth, with how many and how great degrees of perfection it is replenished, with what 
intelligence it is strengthened, by what means diffused into the body, by what harmony it 
shall be compacted with it, what affinity it hath with God, with the intelligences, with the 
heavens, elements, and all other things, whose image and resemblance it holds, To 
conclude, by what influences the body may be knit together again for the raising of the 
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dead, requires all these things which belong not to men, but to God only, and to whom he 
will communicate them. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

CHAP. XVIII. 

ON THE BONDS OF SPIRITS, AND THEIR ADJURATIONS, AND CASTINGS OUT. 

THE bond by which spirits are bound, besought, or cast out, are three; some of them are 
taken from the elemental world, as when we adjure a spirit by an inferior and natural 
thing of affinity with or adverse to them; inasmuch as we would call up or cast them out, 
as by fumigations of flowers, herbs, animals, snow, ice, or by hell, fire, and such like; and 
these also are often mixt with. divine praises, and blessings, and consecrations, as appears 
in the song of the Three Children, and in the psalm, Praise ye the Lord from the heavens, 
and in the consecration and blessing of the paschal taper. This bond works upon the 
spirits by an apprehensive virtue, under the account of love or hatred, inasmuch as the 
spirits are present with, or favour, or abhor any thing that is natural or against nature, as 
these things themselves love or hate one another. The second bond is taken from the 
celestial world, viz. when we adjure them by their heaven, by the stars, by their motions, 
rays, light, beauty, clearness, excellency, fortitude, influence and wonders, and such like; 
and this bond works upon spirits by way of admonition and example. It hath also some 
command, especially upon the ministering spirits, and those who are of the lowest orders. 
The third bond is from the intellectual and divine world, which is perfected by religion; 
that is to say, when we swear by the sacraments, miracles, divine names, sacred seals, and 
other mysteries of religion; wherefore this bond is the highest of all and the Strongest, 
working upon the spirits by command and power; but this is to be observed, that as after 
the universal Providence there is a particular one, and after the universal soul, particular 
souls; so, in the first place, we invocate by the superior bonds, and by the names and 
powers which rule the things, then by the inferior and the things themselves. We must 



know further, that by these bonds, not only spirits, but also all creatures are bound, as 
tempests, burnings, floods, plagues, diseases, force of arms, and every animal, by 
assuming them, either by adjuration or deprecation, or benediction, as in the charming of 
serpents; besides the natural and celestial, by rehearsing out of the mysteries and religion, 
the cure of the serpent in terrestrial paradise, the lifting up of the serpent in the 
wilderness; likewise by assuming that verse of the 91st Psalm, thou shall walk upon the 
asp and the basilisk, and shall tread upon the lion and the dragon. 
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CHAP. XX. 

OF PROPHETICAL DREAMS. 

I CALL that a dream which proceeds either from the spirit of the phantasy and intellect 
united together, or by the illustration of the agent intellect above our souls, or by the true 
revelation of some divine power in a quiet and purified mind; for by this our soul receives 
true oracles, and abundantly yields prophecies to us; for in dreams we seem both to ask 
questions, and learn to find them out; also many doubtful things, many policies, many 
things unknown, unwished for, and never attempted by our minds, are manifested to us in 
dreams: also the representation of things unknown, and unknown places appear to us; and 
the images of men, both alive and dead, and of things to come, are foretold; and also 
things which at any time have happened are revealed, which we know not by any report. 
And these dreams need not any art of interpretation, as those of which we have before 
spoken, which belong to divination, not to foreknowledge; and it comes to pass that they 
who see dreams, for the most part, understand them not: for as to see dreams is from the 
strength of imagination, so to understand them is from the strength of the understanding. 
They, therefore, whose intellect being overwhelmed by too much commerce of the flesh 
is in a dead sleep, or its imaginative or phantastic power or spirit is too dull and 
unpolished, that it cannot receive the species and representation which flow from the 
superior intellect; this man, I say, is altogether unfit for the receiving of dreams and 
prophesying by them. 

Therefore it is necessary that he who would receive true dreams should keep a pure 
undisturbed, and an undisquieted imaginative spirit, and so compose it that it may be 
made worthy of the knowledge and government by the mind and understanding; for such 
a spirit is most fit for prophesying, and is a most clear glass of all the images which flow 
(every where) from all things. When therefore we are sound in body, not disturbed in 
mind, our intellect not dulled by meats and drinks, not sad through poverty, not provoked 
through lust, not incited by any vice, not stirred up by wrath or anger, not being 
irreligiously and prophanely inclined, not given to levity, not lost in drunkenness, but 
chastely going to bed, fall asleep; then our pure and divine soul, being free from all the 
evils above recited, and separated from all hurtful thoughts, and now freed by dreaming, 
is endowed with this divine spirit as an instrument, and doth receive those beams and 
representations which are darted down, as it were, and shine forth from the Divine Mind 
into itself; and, as it were in a deifying glass, it does more certain, more clear and 
efficaciously behold all things than by the vulgar inquiry of the intellect, and by the 
discourse of reason. The divine powers instructing the soul, being invited to their society 
by the opportunity of the nocturnal solitariness, neither will that genius be wanting to him 
when he is awake, which rules all his actions. 

Whosoever therefore, by quiet and religious meditation, and by a diet temperate and 
moderate according to nature, preserves his spirit pure shall very much prepare himself, 
and by this means become (in a degree) divine and knowing all things, justly merits the 
same. But whosoever, on the contrary, languishes with a fantastic spirit, he receives not 
perspicuous and distant visions; but even as the divine sight, by reason of its vision, being 



weakened and impaired, judges confusedly and indistinctly, so also when we are 
overcome with wine and drunkenness, then our spirit, being oppressed with noxious 
vapours (as a troubled water is apt to appear in various forms) is deceived, and waxes 
dull; therefore those who would receive oracles by dreams, and those oracles true and 
certain, I would advise him to abstain one whole day from meat, and three days from 
wine or any strong liquors, and drink nothing but pure water; for, to sober and religious 
minds, the pure spirits are adherent, but fly those who are drowned in drunkenness and 
surfeiting. Although impure spirits do very often administer notable secrets to those who 
are apparently besotted with wine or liquors; yet all such communications are to be 
contemned and avoided. 

But there are four kinds of true dreams, viz. the first, matutine, i. e. between sleeping and 
waking; the second that which one sees concerning another, the third, that whose 
interpretation is shewn to the same dreamer in the nocturnal vision; and, lastly, the fourth, 
that which is repeated to the same dreamer in the nocturnal vision. 

END OF PART FIRST. 
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THE PERFECTION AND KEY 

OF 

THE CABALA, 

OR 

CEREMONIAL MAGIC. 

BOOK II. PART II. 

IN this last book, which we have made the Perfection and Key of all that has been 
written, we have given thee the whole and entire practice of Ceremonial Magic, shewing 
what is to be done every hour of the day; so that as by reading what we have heretofore 
written, thou shalt contemplate in theory, here thou shalt be made perfect by experiment 
and practice: for in this Key you may behold, as in a mirror, the distinct functions of the 
spirits, and how they are to be drawn into communication in all places, seasons, and 
times. 

This then is to be known, that the names of the intelligent presidents of every one of the 
planets are constituted after this manner; that it to say, by collecting together the letters 
out of the figures of the world from the rising of the body of the planet, according to the 
succession of the signs through the several degrees, and out of the several degrees, from 
the aspects of the planet himself, the calculation being made from the degree of the 
ascendant. 

In like manner are constituted the names of the princes of the evil spirits; they are taken 
under all the planets of the presidents in a retrograde order, the projection being made 
contrary to the succession of the signs, from the beginning of the seventh house. Now the 
name of the supreme and highest intelligence, which many suppose to be the soul of the 
world, is collected out of the four cardinal points of the figure of the world, after the 
manner already delivered; and by the opposite and contrary way is known the name of 
the great demon or evil spirit, upon the four cadent angles. 

In like manner you shall understand the names of the great presidential spirits ruling in 
the air, from the four angles of the succedent houses, so as to obtain the names of the 
good spirits: the calculation is to be made according to the succession of the signs, 
beginning from the degree of the ascendant, and to attain the names of the evil spirits by 
working the contrary way. 

You must also observe, that the names of the evil spirits are extracted as well from the 
names of the good spirits as of the evil: so, notwithstanding, that if we enter the table 
with the name of a good spirit of the second order, the name of the evil shall be extracted 
from the order of princes and governors; but if we enter the table with the name of a good 
spirit of the third order, or with the name of an evil spirit, a governor, after what manner 
soever they are extracted, whether by this table or from a celestial figure, the names 



which do proceed from hence shall be the names of the evil spirits, the ministers of the 
inferior order. 

It is further to be noted, that as often as we enter this table with the good spirits of the 
second order, the names extracted are of the second order; and if under them we extract 
the name of an evil spirit, he is of the superior order of the governors. The same order is, 
if we enter with the name of an evil spirit of the superior. If therefore we enter this table 
with the names of the spirits of the third order, or with the names of the ministering 
spirits, as well of the good spirits as of the evil, the names extracted shall be the names of 
the ministering spirits of the inferior order. 

But many magicians, men of no small authority, will have the tables of this kind to be 
extended with Latin letters; so that by the same tables also, out of the name of any office 
or effect, might be found out the name of any spirit, as well good as evil, by the same 
manner which is above delivered, by taking the name of the office or of the effect in the 
column of letters, in their own line, under their own star. And of this practice 
Trismegistus is a great author, who delivered this kind of calculation in Egyptian letters: 
not improperly also may they be referred to the letters of other tongues, for the reason 
assigned to the signs; for truly he only is extant of all men who have treated concerning 
the attaining to the names of spirits. 

Therefore the force, secrecy, and power, in what manner the sacred names of spirits are 
truely and rightly found out, consisteth in the disposing of vowels, which make the name 
of a spirit, and wherewith is constituted the true name and right word. Now this art is thus 
perfected and brought to pass. First, we are to take heed to placing the vowels of the 
letters, which are found by the calculation of the celestial figure, to find the names of the 
spirits of the second order, presidents and governors: and this, in the good spirits, is thus 
brought to effect, by considering the stars which do constitute and make the letters, and 
by placing them according to their order. First, let the degree of the eleventh house be 
subtracted from the degree of that star which is first in order, and that which remains 
thereof, let it be projected from the degree of the ascendant; and where the number ends, 
there is part of the vowel of the first letter. 

Begin therefore to calculate the vowels of these letters according to their number and 
order, and the vowel which falls in the place of the star, which is the first in order, the 
same vowel is attributed to the first letter; then afterwards thou shalt find the part of the 
second letter, by subtracting the degree of a star, which is the second in order from the 
first star; and that which remains cast from the ascendant. And this is the part from which 
you shall begin the calculation of vowels; and that vowel which falls upon the second star 
the same is the vowel of the second letter: and so consequently thou mayest search out 
the vowels of the following letters by always subtracting the degree of the following star 
from the degree of the star next preceding and going before. And, likewise, all 
calculations and numerations in the names of the good spirits ought to be made according 
to the succession of the signs. And whereas in calculating the names of the evil spirits, 
the names of the good spirits are taken from the degree of the eleventh house; in these 
ought to be taken the degree of the twelfth house. And all numerations and calculations 

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



may be made with the succession of the signs, by taking the beginning from the degree of 
the tenth house. 

But in all extractions by tables, the vowels are placed after another manner. In the first 
place, is taken the certain number of letters, making the name itself, and is thus numbered 
from the beginning of the column of the first letter, or whereupon the name is extracted; 
and the letter on which this number falleth is referred to the first letter of the name 
extracted, by taking the distance of the one from the other, according to the order of the 
alphabet. But the number of that distance is projected from the beginning of that column, 
and where it ends there is part of the first vowel; from thence thou shalt calculate the 
vowels themselves, in their own number and order in the same column; and the vowel 
which shall fall upon the first letter of a name, the same shall be attributed to that name. 

Now thou shalt find the following vowels, by taking the distance from the preceding 
vowel to the following, and so consequently according to the succession of the alphabet; 
and the number of that distance is to be numbered from the beginning of his own column, 
and where he shall cease, there is part of the vowel sought after. From thence therefore 
must you calculate the vowels, as we have above said, and those vowels which shall fall 
upon your own letters, are to be attributed to them. If therefore any vowel should happen 
to fall upon a vowel, the former must give place to the latter: and this you are to 
understand only of the good spirits. In the evil spirits likewise you may proceed in the 
same way; except only that you make the numerations after a contrary and backward 
order, contrary to the succession of the alphabet, and contrary to the order of the columns 
(that is to say) ascending. 

The name of good angels, and of every man, which we have before taught how to find 
out, according to that manner, is of no little authority, nor of a mean foundation. But now 
we will give thee some other ways illustrated with no vain reasons. One whereof is by 
taking in the nativity the five places of Hylech; which being noted, the characters of the 
letters are projected in their order and number, beginning from Aries, and those letters 
which fall upon the degrees of the said places, according to their order and dignity 
disposed and aspected, make the name of an angel. 

There is also another way wherein they take Almutel, which is the ruling and governing 
star over the aforesaid five places, and the projection is to be made from the degree of the 
ascendant; which is done by gathering together the letters falling upon Almutel, which 
being placed in order, according to their dignity, make the name of an angel. There is 
likewise another way used, and very much had in observation from the Egyptians, by 
making calculations from the degree of the ascendant, and by gathering together the 
letters according to the Almutel of the eleventh house; which house they call a good 
demon; which being placed according to their dignities, the names of the angels are 
constituted. 

Now the names of the evil angels are known after the like manner, except only that the 
projections must be performed contrary to the course and order of the succession of the 
signs; so that in seeking the names of good spirits, we are to calculate from the beginning 



of Aries; contrariwise, in attaining the names of evil, we ought to account from the 
beginning of Libra. And whereas, in the good spirits, we number from the degree of the 
ascendant; contrariety, in the evil, we must calculate from the degree of the seventh 
house. 

But according to the Egyptians, the name of this angel is collected according to the 
Almutel of the twelfth house, which they call an evil spirit. Now all those rites, which are 
elsewhere already by us delivered in this Book, may be made by the characters of any 
language. In all which (as we have said before) there is a mystical and divine number, 
order and figure, from whence it comes to pass, that the same spirit may be called by 
divers names; but others are discovered from the name of the spirit himself, of the good 
or evil, by tables formed to this purpose. 

Now these celestial characters do consist of lines and heads. The heads are six, according 
to the six magnitudes of the stars, whereunto the planets likewise are reduced. The first 
magnitude holds a star with the sun or a cross, the second, with Jupiter, a circular point; 
the third, with Saturn, a semicircle, a triangle, either crooked, round, or acute; the fourth, 
with a Mars, a little stroke penetrating the line, either square, straight or oblique; the fifth, 
with Venus and Mercury, a little stroke or point with a tail ascending or descending; the 
sixth, with the moon, a point made black, all which you may see in the annexed plate. 
The heads then being posited according to the site of the stars of the figure of heaven then 
the lines are to be drawn out according to the congruency or agreement of their natures. 
And this you are to understand of the fixed stars. But in the erecting of the planets, the 
lines are drawn out, the heads being posited according to their course and nature among 
themselves.--See the Plate, No. 1. 

So when a character is to be found, of any celestial image ascending in any degree or face 
of a sign, which consists of stars of the same magnitude and nature, then the number of 
these stars being posited according to their place and order, the lines are drawn after the 
similitude of the image signified, as copiously as the same can be done. 

But the characters which are extracted according to the name of a spirit are composed by 
the table following, by giving to every letter that name which agrees to him out of the 
table; and although it may appear easy to those that apprehend it, yet there is no small 
difficulty herein; to wit, when the letter of a name falls upon the line of letters or figures, 
that we may know which figure or which letter is to be taken. And this may thus be 
known; if a letter falls upon the line of letters, consider of what number this letter may be 
in the order of the name, as the second or the third; then how many letters that name 
contains, as five or seven; and multiply these numbers one after another by themselves 
and treble the product; then cast the whole (being 
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added together) from the beginning of the letters according to the succession of the 
alphabet; and the letter upon which that number shall happen to fall, ought to be placed 
for a character of that spirit. But if any letter of a name fall upon the line of figures, it is 
thus wrought: take the number how many this letter is in the order of the name, and let it 
be multiplied by the number of which this letter is in the order of the alphabet; and, being 
added together, divide it by nine, and the remainder will shew the figure or number to be 
placed in the character, and this may be put either in a geometrical or arithmetrical figure 



of number; which, notwithstanding, ought not to exceed the number of nine, or nine 
angels.--See the Plate, No. 2. 

But the characters which are understood by the revelations of spirits take their virtue from 
thence, because they are, as it were, certain hidden seals, making the harmony of some 
divinity: either they are signs of a covenant entered into, and of a promised or plighted 
faith, or of obedience. And those characters cannot by any other means be found out. 

Besides these characters there are certain familiar figures and images of evil spirits, under 
which forms they are wont to appear, and yield obedience to those who invoke them. And 
all these characters and images may be seen in the considerations of each day's business, 
according to the course of the letters constituting the names of spirits themselves; so that 
if in any letter there is found more than the name of one spirit, his image holds the pre-
eminence, the others imparting their own orders; so they which are of the first order, to 
them is attributed the head, the upper part of the body, according to their own figure; 
those which are lowest possess the thighs and feet; so likewise the middle letters do 
attribute like to themselves the middle parts of the body, to give the parts that fit; but if 
there happen any contrariety, that letter which is the strongest in the number shall bear 
rule; and if they are equal they all impart equal things. Moreover if any name shall obtain 
any notable character or instrument out of the table, he shall likewise have the same 
character in the image. 

We may also attain to the knowledge of the dignities of the evil spirits, by the same tables 
of characters and images: for upon whatsoever spirit falls any excellent sign or 
instrument out of the table of characters, he possesses that dignity. As if there should be a 
crown, it shows a kingly dignity; if a crest or plume, a dukedom; if a horn, a county: if 
without these there be a sceptre, sword, or forked instrument, it shows rule and authority. 
Likewise out of the table of images you shall find them who bear the chief kingly dignity: 
from the crown judge dignity; and from the instruments, rule and authority. 

Lastly, they which bear a human shape and figure have a greater dignity than those which 
appear under the forms and images of beasts. They likewise who ride do excel them 
which appear on foot. And thus, according to all their commixtures, you may judge the 
dignity and excellency of spirits, one before another. Moreover, you must understand that 
the spirits of the inferior order, of what dignity soever, they are always subject to the 
spirits of the superior order; likewise that it is not incongruent for their kings and dukes to 
be subject and minister to the presidents of the superior order. 
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Of MAGIC PENTACLES and their COMPOSITION. 

WE now proceed to speak of the holy and sacred Pentacles and Seals. For these pentacles 
are certain holy signs and characters, preserving us from evil chances and events, helping 
and assisting us to bind, exterminate, and drive away evil spirits, alluring the good spirits, 
and reconciling them to us. These pentacles consist either of characters of good spirits of 
the superior order, or of sacred pictures of holy letters or revelations, with apt and proper 
versicles, which are composed either of geometrical figures and holy names of God, 
according to the course and manner of many of them, or they are compounded of all of 
them, or many of them mixed. The characters which are useful for us to constitute and 
make the pentacles are the characters of the good spirits, chiefly of the good spirits of the 
first and second order, and sometimes of the third order. These kind of characters are 
especially to be named holy. 

Whatsoever characters of this kind are to be instituted, we must draw about him a double 
circle, wherein we must write the name of his angel; and if we will add some divine name 
congruent with his spirit and office, it will be of greater force and efficacy; and if we 
draw about him any angular figure, according to the manner of his numbers that is lawful 
to be done. But the holy pictures which make the pentacles are they which every where 
are delivered to us in the prophets and sacred writings, both in the Old and New 
Testaments; even as the figure of the serpent hanging on the cross, and such like; whereof 
many may be found in the visions of the prophets, as in Isaiah, Daniel, Esdras, and 
others, and likewise in the revelations of the Apocalypse. And we have before spoken of 
them in our First Part, where we have made mention of holy things, therefore where any 
picture is posited of any of these holy images, let the circle be drawn round it on each 
side; wherein let there be written some divine name that is apt and conformed to the 
effect of that figure, or else there may be written around it some versicle taken out of part 
of the body of holy Scripture, which may ascertain or deprecate the desired effect. 

If a pentacle were to be made to gain a victory, or revenge against one's enemies, as well 
visible as invisible, the figure may be taken out of the Second book of the Maccabees, 
that is to say, a hand holding a golden sword drawn, about which let there be written the 
versicle there contained, to wit, take the holy sword, the gift of God, wherewith thou shall 
slay the adversaries of my people Israel. Or else there may be written about a versicle of 
the fifth Psalm; in this is the strength of thy arm: before they face there is death; or some 
other such like versicle. But if you will write a divine name about the figure, then let 
some name be taken that signifies fear; a sword, wrath, the revenge of God, or some such 
like name congruent and agreeing with the effect desired. And if there shall be written 
any angular figure, let it be taken according to the rule of the numbers, as we have taught 
where we have treated of numbers, and the like operations. And of this sort there are two 
pentacles of sublime virtue and great power, very useful and necessary to be used in the 
consecration of experiments and spirits; one whereof is that in the first chapter of the 
Apocalypse, to wit, a figure of the majesty of God sitting. upon a throne, having in his 
mouth a two-edged sword, as there is described; about which let there be written, "I am 
Alpha and Omega, the Beginning and the End, which is, and which was, and which is to 
come, the Almighty. I am the First and the Last, who am living, and was dead, and 



behold I live for ever and ever; and I have the keys of death and hell." Then there shall be 
written about it these three versicles: 

Munda Deus virtuti tuæ &c.--Give commandment, O God, to thy strength; confirm, O 
God, thy strength in us. Let them be as dust before the face of the wind: and let the angel 
of the Lord scatter them. Let all their ways be darkness and uncertain: and let the angel 
of the Lord persecute them. 

Moreover, let there be written about it the ten general names, which are El, Elohim, 
Elohe, Zebaoth, Elion, Escerchie, Adonay, Jah, Tetragrammaton, Saday. 

There is another pentacle, the figure whereof is like a lamb slain, having seven eyes and 
seven horns; and under his feet a book sealed with seven seals, as it is in the fifth chapter 
of the Apocalypse. Round about let be written this versicle, behold the lion hath 
overcome of the tribe of Judah, the root of David. I will open the book and unloose the 
seven seals thereof. And another versicle, I saw Satan like lightning fall down from 
heaven. Behold I have given you power to tread upon serpents and scorpions, and over 
all the power of your enemies, and nothing shall be able to hurt you. And let there be also 
written about it the ten general names as aforesaid. 

But those pentacles which are thus made of figures and names, let them keep this order; 
for when any figure is posited, conformable to any number, to produce any certain effect 
or virtue, there must be written thereupon, in all the several angles, some divine name 
obtaining the force and efficacy of the thing desired; yet so nevertheless, that the name 
which is of this sort do consist of just so many letters as the figure may constitute a 
number; or of so many letters of a name, as, joined together among themselves, may 
make the number of a figure; or by any number which may be divided without any 
superfluity or diminution. Now such a name being found, whether it be only one name or 
more, or divers names, it is to be written in all the several angles in the figure; but in the 
middle of the figure let the revolution of the name be wholly and totally placed, or at least 
principally. 

We likewise constitute pentacles by making the revolution of some kind of name, in a 
square table, and by drawing about it a single or double circle, and writing therein some 
holy versicle competent and befitting this name, or from which that name is extracted. 
And this is the way of making the pentacles, according to their several distinct forms and 
fashions, which we may, if we please, either multiply or commix together by course 
among themselves, to work the greater efficacy, extension and enlargement of force and 
virtue. 

As, if a deprecation would be made for the overthrow and destruction of one's enemies, 
we are to mind, and call to remembrance how God destroyed the face of the whole earth 
in the deluge of waters, and the destruction of Sodom and Gomorrah, by raining down 
fire and brimstone; likewise, how God overthrew Pharaoh and his host in the Red Sea; 
and to call to mind if any other malediction or curse be found in holy writ. And thus in 
things of the like sort. So likewise in deprecating and praying against perils and dangers 
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of waters, we ought to call to remembrance the saving of Noah in the deluge of waters, 
the passing of the children of Israel through the Red Sea; and also we are to mind how 
Christ walked on the waters, and how he saved the ship in danger from being cast away 
by the tempest; and how he commanded the winds and the waves, and they obeyed him; 
and also, that he drew Peter out of the water, being in danger of drowning, and the like. 
And, lastly, with these we invoke and call upon some certain holy names of God; to wit, 
such as are significative to accomplish our desire and accommodated to the desired 
effect; as if it be to overthrow enemies; we are to invoke and call upon names of wrath, 
revenge, fear, justice, and fortitude of God; and if we would avoid and escape any evil or 
danger, we then call upon the names of mercy, defence, salvation, fortitude, goodness, 
and such like names of God. When likewise we pray to God that he would grant us our 
desires, we are likewise to intermix therewith the name of some good spirit, whether one 
only, or more, whose office it is to execute our desires; and sometimes also we require 
some evil spirit to restrain or compel, whose name likewise we intermingle, and that 
rightly, especially if it be to execute any evil work; as revenge, punishment, or 
destruction. 

Furthermore, if there be any versicle in the Psalms, or any other part of the holy 
Scripture, that shall seem congruent and agreeable to our desire, the same is to be 
mingled with our prayers. Now, after prayer has been made to God, it is expedient 
afterwards to make an oration to that executioner, whom, in our precedent prayer to God, 
we have desired should administer to us, whether one or more, or whether he be an angel, 
or star, or soul, or any of the noble angels. But this kind of oration ought to be composed 
according to the rules which we have delivered in the former part of our work, where we 
have treated of the manner of the composition of enchantments, &c. 

You may know farther, that these kind of bonds have a threefold difference; for the first 
bond is when we conjure by natural things; the second is compounded of religious 
mysteries, by sacraments, miracles, and things of this sort; and the third is constituted by 
divine names and holy seals. With these kind of bonds we may bind not only spirits, but 
also other creatures whatsoever, as animals, tempests, burnings, floods of waters, the 
force and power of arms. Also we use these bonds aforesaid, not only by conjuration, but 
sometimes also using the means of deprecation and benediction. Moreover it conduces 
much to this purpose to join some sentence of holy Scripture, if any shall be found 
convenient thereto, as in the conjuration of serpents, by commemorating the curse of the 
serpent in the earthly paradise, and the setting up the serpent in the wilderness; and 
further, adding that versicle, thou shall walk upon the asp and the basilisk, &c. 
Superstition is also of much prevelancy herein, by the translation of some sacramental 
rites, to bind that which we intend to hinder; as, the rites of excommunication, of 
sepulchres, funerals, buryings, and the like sort. 

 

 

 



Of the Consecration of all magical Instruments and Materials which are used 
in this Art. 

THE virtue of consecrations chiefly consists in two things, viz. the power of the person 
consecrating, and the virtue of the prayer by which the consecration is made. 

For in the person consecrating, there is required firmness, constancy, and holiness of life; 
and that the consecrator himself shall, with a firm and undubitable faith, believe the 
virtue, Power, and effect thereof. 

Then in the prayer by which the consecration is made it derives its virtue either from 
divine inspiration, or else by composing it from sundry places in the holy Scriptures, in 
the commemoration of some of the wonderful miracles of God, effects, promises, 
sacraments and sacramental things, of which we have abundance in holy writ. 

There must likewise be used the invocation of divine names, that are significative of the 
work in hand; likewise a sanctifying and expiation which s wrought by sprinkling with 
holy water, unctions with holy oil, and odoriferous suffumigations. Therefore in every 
consecration there is generally used a benediction and consecration of water, earth, oil, 
fire, and suffumigations, &c. with consecrated wax-lights or lamps burning; for without 
lights no consecration is duly performed. You must therefore particularly observe this, 
that when any thing (which we call prophane) is to be used, in which there is any 
defilement or pollution, it must, first of all, be purified by an Exorcism composed solely 
for that purpose, which ought to precede the consecration; which things being so made 
pure are most apt to receive the influences of the divine virtue. We must also observe that 
at the end of any consecration after the prayer is rightly performed, as we have 
mentioned, the operator ought to bless the thing consecrated, by breathing out some 
sentence with divine virtue and power of the present consecration, with a 
commemoration of his virtue and authority, that so it may be the more duly performed, 
and with an earnest and attentive mind. Now I shall mention here some examples, that, by 
these, a path may be made to the whole perfection thereof. 

The Consecration of WATER. 

SO in the consecration of water, we must commemorate that God has placed the 
firmament in the midst of the waters, and likewise that God placed the fountain of waters 
in the earthly paradise, from whence sprang four holy rivers that watered the whole earth; 
likewise we are to remember that God caused the waters to be an instrument of his justice 
in destroying the giants, by bringing on the deluge which covered the face of the whole 
earth; and in the overthrow of the host of Pharaoh in the Red Sea, and that God led the 
children of Israel through on dry land, and through the midst of the river Jordan, and 
likewise his marvellously drawing water out of the stony rock in the wilderness; and that, 
at the prayer of Samson, he caused water to flow out of the jaw-bone of an ass; and 
likewise that God has made water the instrument of his mercy and salvation for the 
expiation of original sin; also that Christ was baptized in the river Jordan, and hath 
thereby sanctified and cleansed the waters. Likewise certain divine names are to be 
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invocated which are conformable hereto; as, that God is a living fountain, living water, 
the fountain of mercy, and names of the like sort. 

Consecration of FIRE. 

AND likewise, in the consecration of fire, we are to commemorate that God hath created 
the fire to be an instrument to execute his justice, for punishment, vengeance, and the 
expiation of sins; also, when God comes to judge the world that he will command a 
conflagration of fire to go before him; likewise we are to mention that God appeared to 
Moses in a burning bush; and also how he went before the children of Israel in a pillar of 
fire; and that nothing can be duly offered, sanctified, or sacrificed, without fire; and how 
that God instituted fire to be kept in continually in the tabernacle of the covenant; and 
how miraculously he re-kindled the same, being extinct, and preserved it elsewhere from 
going out being hidden under the waters; and things of this sort; likewise the names of 
God are to be called upon which are consonant to this; as we read in the law and 
prophets, that God is a consuming fire; and likewise if there are any divine names which 
signify fire, as the glory of God, the light of God, the splendor and brightness of God,. 
&c. 

 

The Consecration of OIL. 

AND likewise in the consecration of oil and perfumes we are to mention such things as 
are consonant to this purpose, as of the holy anointing oil mentioned in Exodus, and 
divine names significant thereunto; such as is the name Christ, which signifies anointed; 
and whatever mysteries there are relative to oil in the Scriptures, as the two olive-trees 
distilling holy oil into the lamps that burn before the face of God, mentioned in 
Revelations. 

Of the Benediction of LIGHTS, LAMPS, WAX, &c. 

NOW, the blessing of the lights, lamps, wax, &c. is taken from the fire, and whatever 
contains the substance of the flame, and whatever similitudes are in the mysteries, as the 
seven candlesticks which burn before the face of God. Therefore we have here given the 
manner of composing the consecrations, which first of all are necessary to be used in 
every kind of ceremony, and ought to precede every experiment or work, and without 
which nothing in magic rites can be duly performed. 

In the next place, we will shew thee the consecration of places, instruments, and the like 
things. 

 

 



The Consecration of PLACES, GROUND, CIRCLE, &c. 

THEREFORE when you would consecrate any place or circle, you should take the prayer 
of Solomon used in the dedication and consecration of the temple; you must likewise 
bless the place by sprinkling with holy water and with suffumigations, and commemorate 
in the benediction holy mysteries; such as these, the sanctification of the throne of God, 
of Mount Sinai, of the tabernacle of the covenant, of the holy of holies, of the temple of 
Jerusalem; also the sanctification of Mount Golgotha, by the crucifixion of Christ; the 
sanctification of the temple of Christ; of Mount Tabor, by the transfiguration and 
ascension of Christ, &c. And by, invocating all divine names which are significant to 
this; such as the place of God, the throne of God, the chair of God, the tabernacle of God, 
the altar of God, the habitation of God, and the like divine names of this sort, which are 
to be written about the circle, or place to be consecrated. 

And, in the consecration of instruments, and every other thing that is used in this art, you 
must proceed after the same manner, by sprinkling with holy water the same, by 
fumigation, by anointing with holy oil, sealing it with some holy seal, and blessing it with 
prayer, and by commemorating holy things out of the sacred Scriptures, collecting divine 
names which are agreeable to the things to be consecrated; as for example, in the 
consecration of the sword we are to remember in the gospel, "he that hath two coats," &c. 
and that in the second of the Maccabees, it is said that a sword was divinely and 
miraculously sent to Judas Maccabeus; and if there is any thing of the like in the 
prophets, as "take unto you two-edged swords," &c. And you shall also, in the same 
manner, consecrate experiments and books, and whatever of the like nature, as writings, 
pictures, &c. by sprinkling, perfuming, anointing, scaling, blessing, with holy 
commemorations, and calling to remembrance the sanctification of mysteries; as the table 
of the ten commandments, which were delivered to Moses by God in mount Sinai, the 
sanctification of the Old and New Testaments, and likewise of the law, prophets, and 
Scriptures, which were promulgated by the Holy Ghost: and again, there are to be 
mentioned such divine names as are convenient to this; as these are, viz. the testament of 
God, the book of God, the book of life, the knowledge of God, the wisdom of God, and 
the like. And with such kind of rites as these is the personal consecration performed. 

There are beside these another rite of consecration of great power and efficacy; and this is 
one of the kinds of superstition, viz. when the rite of consecration or collection of any 
sacrament in the church is transferred to that thing which we would consecrate. 

It must be noted that vows, oblations, and sacrifices, have the power of consecration also, 
as well real as personal; and they are, as it were, certain conventions between those 
names with which they are made and us who make them, strongly cleaving to our desire 
and wished effects, as when we sacrifice with certain names., or things; as fumigations, 
unctions, rings, images, mirrors; and some things less material, as characters, seals, 
pentacles, enchantments, orations, pictures, Scriptures, of which we have largely spoken 
before. 
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Of the Invocation of EVIL SPIRITS, and the binding, of, and constraining of 
them to appear. 

NOW, if thou art desirous of binding any spirit to a ready obedience to thee, we will 
shew you how a certain book may be made by which they may be invoked; and this book 
is to be consecrated a book of Evil Spirits, ceremoniously to be composed in their name 
and order, whereunto they bind with a certain holy oath, the ready and present obedience 
of the spirit. This book is therefore to be made of the most pure and clean paper, which is 
generally called virgin paper; and this book must be inscribed after this manner, viz. let 
there be drawn on the left side of the book the image of the spirit, and on the right side 
thereof his character, with the oath above it, containing the name of the spirit, his dignity 
and place, with his office and power. Yet many magicians do compose this book 
otherwise, omitting the characters and images; but I think that it is much more efficacious 
not to neglect any thing above mentioned in the forms. 

There is likewise to be observed the circumstances of places, times, hours, according to 
the stars which these spirits are under, and are seen to agree to; with their site, rite, and 
order, being applied. 

Which book being so written, is to be well bound, adorned, garnished, embellished and 
kept secure, with registers and seals, lest it should happen after the consecration to open 
in some part not designed, and endanger the operator. And, above all, let this book be 
kept as pure and reverent as possible; for irreverance of mind causes it to lose its virtue 
by pollution and prophanation. 

Now this sacred book being thus composed according to the form and manner we have 
delivered, we are to consecrate it after a two-fold way; the first is, that all and singularly 
each of the spirits who are written in the book be called to the circle, according to the 
rites magical, which we have before taught, and place the book which is to be 
consecrated in a triangle on the outside of the circle; then read, in the presence of the 
spirits, all the oaths which are contained and written in that book; then the book to be 
consecrated being already placed without the circle in a triangle there drawn, compel all 
the spirits to impose their hands where their images and characters are drawn, and to 
confirm and consecrate the same with a special and common oath. This being done, let 
the book be shut and preserved as we have spoken before; then licence the spirits to 
depart according to due rite and magical order. 

There is another method extant among us of consecrating a general book of spirits which 
is more easy, and of as much efficacy to produce every effect, except that in opening this 
book, the spirits do not always appear visible. And this way is thus: let be made a book of 
spirits, as we have before shewn, but in the end thereof write invocations, bonds, and 
strong conjurations, wherewith every spirit may be bound; then bind this book between 
two lamens or tables, and on the inside thereof draw or let be drawn two holy pentacles of 
the divine Majesty, which we have before set forth, out of the Apocalypse. Then let the 
first of them be placed in the beginning, of the book, and the second at the end of the 
same. 



This book being thus perfected, let it be brought, in a clear and fair night, to a circle 
prepared in a cross-way, according to the art which we have before delivered; and there, 
in the first place, the book is to be opened, and to be consecrated according to the rites 
and ways which we have before delivered concerning consecration, which being done, let 
all the spirits be called which are written in the book, in their own order and place, 
conjuring them thrice by the bonds described in the book that they come to that place 
within the space of three days, to assure their obedience and confirm the same, to the 
book so to be consecrated; then let the book be wrapped up in a clean linen cloth, and 
bury it in the midst of the circle, and stop the hole so as it may not be perceived or 
discovered: the circle being destroyed after you have licensed the spirits, depart before 
sun-rise; and on the third day, about the middle of the night, return and make the circle 
anew and on thy knees make prayer unto God, and give thanks to him; and let a precious 
perfume be made, open the hole in which you buried your book and take it out, and so let 
it be kept, not opening the same. Then after licensing the spirits in their, order and 
destroying the circle, depart before sunrise. And this is the last rite and manner of 
consecrating, profitable to whatever writings, experiments, &c. that direct the spirits, 
placing the same between two holy lamens or pentacles, as is before mentioned. 

But when the operator would work by the book thus consecrated he should do it in a fair 
and clear season, when the spirits are least troubled; and let him turn himself towards the 
region of the spirits; then let him open the book under a due register, and likewise invoke 
the spirits by their oaths there described and confirmed, and by the name of their 
character and image, to whatever purpose you desire, and if there be need conjure them 
by the bonds placed in the end of the book. 1 And having attained thy desired effect 
license them to depart. 

And now we proceed to speak of the Invocation of good as well as bad Spirits. 

The good spirits may be invocated of us, or by us, divers ways, and they in sundry shapes 
and manners offer themselves to us, for they openly speak to those that watch, and do 
offer themselves to our sight, or do inform us by dreams and by oracle of those things 
which we have a great desire to know. Whoever therefore would call any good spirit to 
speak or appear in sight, he must particularly observe two things; one whereof is about 
the disposition of the invocant, the other concerning those things which are outwardly to 
be adhibited to the invocation for the conformity of the spirit to be called. 

It is necessary therefore that the invocant religiously dispose himself for the space of 
many days to such a mystery, and to conserve himself during the time chaste, abstinent, 
and to abstract himself as much as he can from all manner of foreign and secular 
business; likewise he should observe fasting, as much as shall seem convenient to him, 
and let him daily, between sun-rising and setting, being clothed in pure white linen, seven 
times call upon God, and make a deprecation to the angels to be called and invocated, 
according to the rule which we have before taught. Now the number of days of fasting 
and preparation is commonly one month, i. e. the time of a whole lunation. Now, in the 
Cabala, we generally prepare ourselves forty days before. 
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Now concerning the place, it must be chosen clean, pure, close, quiet, free from all 
manner of noise, and not subject to any stranger's sight. This place must first of all be 
exorcised and consecrated; and let there be a table or altar placed therein, covered with a 
clean white linen cloth, and set towards the east: and on each side thereof place two 
consecrated wax-lights burning, the flame thereof ought not to go out all these days. In 
the middle of the altar let there be placed lamens, or the holy paper we have before 
described, covered with fine linen, which is not to be opened until the end of the days of 
consecration. You shall also have in readiness a precious perfume and a pure anointing 
oil.--And let t Item both be kept consecrated. Then set a sensor on the head of the altar, 
wherein you shalt kindle the holy fire, and make a precious perfume every day that you 
pray. 

Now for your habit, you shall have a long garment of white linen, close before and 
behind, which may come down quite over the feet, and gird yourself about the loins with 
a girdle. You shall likewise have a veil made of pure white linen on which must be wrote 
in a gilt lamen, the name Tetragrammaton; all which things are to be consecrated and 
sanctified in order. But you must not go into this holy place till it be first washed and 
covered with a cloth new and clean, and then you may enter, but with your feet naked and 
bare; and when you enter therein you shall sprinkle with holy water, then make a perfume 
upon the altar; and then on thy knees pray before the altar as we have directed. 

Now when the time is expired, on the last day, you shall fast more strictly; and fasting on 
the day following, at the rising of the sun, enter the holy place, using the ceremonies 
before spoken of, first by sprinkling thyself, then, making a perfume, you shall sign the 
cross with holy oil in the forehead, and anoint your eyes, using prayer in all these 
consecrations. Then, open the lamen and pray before the altar upon your knees; and then 
ail invocation may be made as follows: 

 

Footnotes 

92:1 I have given an example of the book of spirits, by which you may see the method in 
which the characters, &c. are placed as above described. See the Plate. 

 

 

 

 

 

 



An INVOCATION of the GOOD SPIRITS. 

IN the name of the blessed and Holy Trinity, I do desire thee, strong, and mighty angels 
(here name the spirits you would have appear) that if it be the divine will of him who is 
called Tetragrammaton, &c. the holy God, the Father, that thou take upon thee some 
shape as best becometh thy celestial nature, and appear to us visibly here in this place, 
and answer our demands, in as far as we shall not transgress the bounds of the divine 
mercy and goodness, by requesting unlawful knowledge; but that thou wilt graciously 
shew us what things are most profitable for us to know and do to the glory and honour of 
his divine Majesty who liveth and reigneth, world without end. Amen. 

Lord thy will be done on earth as it is in heaven--make clean our hearts within us, and 
take not thy holy spirit from us. O Lord, by thy name we have called them, suffer them to 
administer unto us. 

And that all things may work together for thy honour and glory, to whom with thee, the 
Son and blessed Spirit, be ascribed all might, majesty, and dominion world without end. 
Amen. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



The particular Form of the LAMEN.--(For the form of the Lamen see the 
Plate.) 

THE invocation being made, the good angels will appear unto you which you desire, 
which you shall entertain with a chaste communication, and licence them to depart. 

Now the lamen which is used to invoke any good spirit must be made after the following 
manner: either in metal conformable or in new wax mixed with convenient spices and 
colours; or it may be made with pure white paper with convenient colours, and the 
outward form of it may be either square, circular, or triangular, or of the like sort, 
according to the rule of the numbers, in which there must be written the divine names, as 
well general as special. And in the centre of the lamen draw a hexagon or character of six 
corners, in the middle thereof write the name and character of the star, or of the spirit his 
governor, to whom the good spirit that is to be called is subject. And about this character 
let there be placed so many characters of five corners or pentacles as the spirits we would 
call together at once. But if we should call only one, nevertheless there must be made 
four pentagons, wherein the name of the spirit or spirits, with their characters, are to be 
written. Now this lamen ought to be composed when the moon is in her increase, on those 
days and hours which agree to the spirit; and if we take a fortunate planet therewith, it 
will be the better for the producing the effect: which table or lamen being rightly made in 
the manner we have fully described, must be consecrated according to the rules above 
delivered. 

And this is the way of making the general table or lamen for the invocating of all spirits 
whatever; the form whereof you may see in the Plates of pentacles, seals, and lamens. 

Nevertheless, we make special tables congruent to every spirit by the rule which we have 
above spoken concerning holy pentacles. 

We will yet declare unto you another rite more easy to perform this thing: let the man 
who wishes to receive an oracle from a spirit be chaste, pure, and sanctified; then a place 
being chosen pure, clean, and covered every where with clean and white linen, on the 
Lord's-day in the new of the moon, let him enter into that place clothed with white linen; 
let him exorcise the place, bless it, and make a circle therein with a consecrated coal; let 
there be written in the outer part of the circle the names of the angels; in the inner part 
thereof write the mighty names of God; and let be placed within the circle, at the four 
parts of the world, the vessels for the perfumes. Then, being washed and fasting, let him 
enter the place and pray towards the cast this whole Psalm, "Blessed are the undefiled in 
the way," &c. Psalm cxix. Then make a fumigation, and deprecate the angels by the said 
divine names, that they will appear unto you, and reveal or discover that which you so 
earnestly desire; and do this continually for six days, washed and fasting. On the seventh 
day, being washed and fasting, enter the circle, perfume it, and anoint thyself with holy 
oil upon the forehead, eyes, and in the palms of both hands, and upon the feet; then, with 
bended knees, say the Psalm aforesaid, with divine and angelical names. Which being 
said, arise, and walk round the circle from East to West, until thou shalt be wearied with a 
giddiness of thy head and brain, then straitway fall down in the circle, where thou mayest 



rest, and thou wilt be wrapped up in an ecstasy; and a spirit will appear and inform thee 
of all things necessary to be known. We must observe also, that in the circle there ought 
to be four holy candles burning at the four parts of the world, which ought not to want 
light for the space of a week. 

And the manner of fasting is this: to abstain from all things having a life of sense, and 
from those which do proceed from them, let him drink only pure running water; neither is 
there any food or wine to be taken till the going down of the sun. 

Let the perfume and the holy anointing oil be made as is set forth in Exodus, and other 
holy books of the Bible. It is also to be observed, that as often as he enters the circle he 
has upon his forehead a golden lamen, upon which there must be written the name 
Tetragrammaton, in the manner we have before mentioned. 
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Of ORACLES by DREAMS. 

BUT natural things and their own commixtures do likewise belong unto magicians, and 
we often use such to receive oracles from a spirit by a dream; which are either by 
perfumes, unctions, meats, drinks, seals, rings, &c. 

Now those who are desirous to receive oracles in or through a dream, let him make 
himself a ring of the sun or Saturn for this purpose. There are likewise images of dreams, 
which, being put under the head when he goes to sleep, doth effectually give true dreams 
of whatever the mind hath before determined or consulted upon, the practice of which is 
as follows: 

Thou shalt make an image of the sun, the figure whereof must be, a man sleeping upon 
the bosom of an angel, which thou shalt make when Leo ascends, the sun being in the 
ninth house in Aries; thou shalt write upon the figure the name of the effect desired, and 
in the hand of the angel the name of the intelligence of the sun. Let the same image be 
made in Virgo ascending, Mercury being fortunate in Aries in the ninth; or Gemini 
ascending, Mercury being fortunate in the ninth house in Aquarius; and let it be received 
with Saturn with a fortunate aspect, and let the name of the spirit be written upon it. Let 
the same likewise be made in Libra ascending, Venus being received from Mercury in 
Gemini in the ninth house, and write upon it the angel of Venus. Again, you may make 
the same image Aquarius ascending, Saturn fortunately possessing the ninth in his 
exaltation, which is Libra; and let there be written upon it the angel of Saturn. The same 
may be made Cancer ascending, the moon being received by Jupiter and Venus in Pisces, 
and being fortunately placed in the ninth house, and write upon it the spirit of the moon. 

There are likewise made rings of dreams of wonderful efficacy; and there are rings of the 
sun and Saturn; and the constellation of them is when the sun or Saturn ascend in their 
exaltations in the ninth, and when the moon is joined to Saturn in the ninth, and in that 
sign which was the ninth house of the nativity; and write and engrave upon the rings the 
name of the spirit of the sun or Saturn; and by these rules you may know how and by 
what means to constitute more of thyself: but know this, that such images work nothing 
(as they are simply images) unless they are vivified by a spiritual and celestial virtue, and 
chiefly by the ardent desire and firm intent of the soul of the operator. But who can give a 
soul to an image, or make a stone, or metal, or clay, or wood, or wax, or paper to live? 
certainly no man; (for this arcanum doth not enter into an artist of a stiff neck,) he only 
hath it who transcends the progress of angels, and comes to the very architype himself. 

The tables of numbers likewise confer to the receiving of oracles, being duly formed 
under their own constellations. Holy tables and papers likewise serve to this effect, being 
especially composed and consecrated; such as the Almutel of Solomon, and the Table of 
the Revolution of the name Tetragrammaton; and those things which are of this kind, and 
written to produce these effects, out of various figures, numbers, holy Scriptures, and 
pictures, with inscriptions of the divine names of God and names of holy angels; the 
composition whereof is taken out of diverse places of the holy Scriptures, Psalms, and 
versicles, and other certain promises out of the divine revelations and prophecies. 



To the same effect do conduce, likewise, holy prayers and deprecations as well to God as 
to the blessed angels; the deprecations of which prayers are to be composed, as we have 
before shewn, according to some religious similitude, making mention of those things 
which we intend to do; as out of the Old Testament of the dream of Jacob, Joseph, 
Pharaoh, Daniel, and Nebuchadnezzar: if out of the New Testament, of the dream of 
Joseph; of the three wise men, or magi, of John the evangelist sleeping upon the breast of 
our Lord; and whatever of the like kind can be found in religion, miracles, and revelation. 
According to which the deprecation may be composed; if when he goes to sleep it be with 
a firm intention, and then, without doubt, they will afford a wonderful effect. 

Therefore he who is desirous of receiving true oracles by dreams, let him abstain from 
supper, from drink, and be otherwise well disposed, so his brain will be free from 
turbulent vapours; let him also have his bed-chamber fair and clean, exorcised and 
consecrated if he will; then let him perfume the same with some convenient fumigation, 
and let him anoint his temples with some unguent efficacious hereunto, and put a ring of 
dreams upon his finger; then let him take one of the images we have spoken of, or some 
holy table, or paper, and place the same under his head; then, having made a devout 
prayer, let him address himself to sleep, meditating upon that thing which he desires to 
know; so shall he receive a most certain and undoubted oracle by a dream, when the 
moon goes through that sign which was in the ninth house of his nativity, and also when 
she goes through the sign of the ninth of the revolution of his nativity, and when she is in 
the ninth sign from the sign of perfection. 

This is the way whereby we may obtain all sciences and arts whatsoever, whether 
alchemy, magic, or else, suddenly and perfectly with a true illumination of our intellect; 
although all inferior familiar spirits whatsoever conduce to this effect, and sometimes 
also evil spirits sensibly inform us intrinsically and extrinsically. 
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Of the Method of raising EVIL or FAMILIAR SPIRITS by a CIRCLE; likewise 
the Souls and Shadows of the Dead. 

IT is here convenient that we say something about the means used by exorcists to raise up 
what are usually termed evil spirits to the circle, and, the methods of calling up the ghosts 
or souls of those who have died a violent or premature death. 

Now, if any one would call any evil spirit to the circle, he must first consider and know 
his nature, and to which of the planets it agrees, and what offices are distributed unto him 
from the planet. This being known, let there be sought out a place fit and convenient, and 
proper for his invocation, according to the nature of the planet and the quality of the 
offices of the same spirit, as near as it can be done; as if their power be over the sea, 
rivers or floods, then let the place be the sea-shore, and so of the rest. Then chuse a 
convenient time both for the quality of the air (being serene, quiet, clear and fitting for 
the spirits to assume bodies); as also of the quality of and nature of the planet and the 
spirit, as on his day and time in which he rules; he may be fortunate or unfortunate 
sometimes of the day, and sometimes of the night, as the stars and spirits do require. 

These things being judiciously considered, let the circle be made at the place elected, as 
well for the defence of the invocant as the confirmation of the spirit. And in the circle 
write the divine general names, and all those things which do yield defence to us; and, 
with them, those divine names which do rule his planet, and the offices of the spirit 
himself; likewise write therein the names of the good spirits which bear rule in the time 
you do this, and are able to bind and constrain that spirit which we intend to call. And if 
we will further strengthen and fortify our circle, we may add characters and pentacles 
agreeing to the work; then also, if we will, we may either, within or without the circle, 
frame an angular figure with the inscription of such convenient numbers as are congruent 
amongst themselves to our work, which are to be known according to the manner of 
numbers and figures delivered in our first Book. 

Further we are to be provided with lights, perfumes, unguents, and medicines, 
compounded according to the nature of the spirit and planet which agree with the spirit 
by reason of their natural and celestial virtue. 

Then we are to be furnished with holy and consecrated things necessary, not only for the 
defence of the invocant and his companions, but also serving for bonds to bind and 
constrain the spirits; such as holy papers, lamens, pictures, pentacles, swords, scepters, 
garments of convenient colour and matter. 

Then, with all these things provided, let the exorcist and his companions go into the 
circle. In the first place, let him consecrate the circle and every thing he uses; which 
being done in a solemn and firm manner, with convenient gesture and countenance, let 
him begin to pray with a loud voice after the manner following. First, by making an 
oration or prayer to God, and then intreating the good spirits; but we should read some 
prayer, or psalm, or gospel, for our defence in the first place. After those prayers and 
orations are said, let him begin to invocate the spirit which he desireth, with a gentle and 



loving enchantment to all the coasts of the world, with a commemoration of his own 
authority and power. Then rest and look round to see if any spirit does appear; which if 
he delays, then let him repeat his invocation, as above said, until he hath done it three 
times; and if the spirit is obstinate and will not appear, then let the invocator begin to 
conjure him with divine power; but so that all his conjurations and commemorations do 
agree with the nature and office of the spirit, and reiterate the same three times, from 
stronger to stronger, using contumelies, cursings, punishments, suspension from his 
power and office, and the like. 

And after these courses are finished, cease; and if the spirit shall appear, let the invocant 
turn himself towards the spirit, and courteously receive him, and, earnestly entreating 
him, let him ask his name, which write down on your holy paper, and then proceed by 
asking him whatsoever you will; and if in any thing the spirit shall appear to be obstinate, 
ambiguous, or lying, let him be bound by convenient conjurations; and if you doubt any 
thing, make, without the circle with the consecrated sword, the figure of a triangle or 
pentagon, and compel the spirit to enter into it; and if you receive any promise which you 
would have confirmed with an oath, stretch the sword out of the circle, and swear the 
spirit by laying his hand on the sword. Then having obtained of the spirit that which you 
desire, or are otherwise contented, license him to depart with courteous words, giving 
command that he do no hurt; and if he will not depart, compel him by powerful 
conjurations; and if need require expel him by exorcisms and by making contrary 
suffumigations. And when he is departed, go not out of the circle, but make a stay, and 
use some prayer giving thanks to God and the good angels; and also praying for your 
future defence and conservation, which being orderly performed you may depart. 

But if your hopes are frustrated, and no spirit will appear, yet for this you need not 
despair; but leaving the circle after licensing to depart (which must never be omitted 
whether a spirit appears or not 1,) return at other times, doing as before. And if you think 
that you have erred in any thing, then you shall amend by adding or diminishing; for the 
constancy of repetition encreases your authority and power, and strikes a terror into the 
spirits, and compels them to obey. 

And often the spirits do come although they appear not visible (to cause terror to him 
who calls them,) either in the thing which he uses, or else in the operation itself. But this 
kind of licensing is not given simply, but by a kind of dispensation, with suspension, until 
they shall render themselves obedient: also, without a circle, these spirits may be called to 
appear, by the way we have delivered in the consecration of a book. But when we intend 
to execute any effect where an apparition is not needful, then that is to be done, by 
making and forming that which is to be to us an instrument; as whether it be an image, 
ring, character, table, writing, candle, sacrifice, or any thing else; then the name of the 
spirit is to be written therein with his character, according to the exigency of the 
experiment, either by writing it with blood, or otherwise using a perfume agreeable to the 
spirit. Likewise we are often to make orations and prayers to God and the good angels 
before we invocate any evil spirit, conjuring him by divine power. 
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In some former parts of our work we have taught how and by what means the soul is 
joined to the body. 

We will in this place inform thee farther, that those souls do still love their relinquished 
bodies after death, a certain affinity alluring them as it were. Such are the souls of 
noxious men who have violently relinquished their bodies, and souls wanting a due 
burial, which still wander in a liquid and turbulent spirit about their dead carcasses; but 
these souls, by the known means by which they were joined to their bodies, by the like 
vapours, liquors, and savours, are easily drawn into them. 

Hence it is that the souls of the dead are not to be called up without blood or by the 
application of some part of their relict body. 

In the raising therefore of these shadows, we are to perfume with new blood the bones of 
the dead, and with flesh, eggs, milk, honey, and oil, which furnish the soul with a 
medium apt to receive its body. 

It is likewise to be understood, those who are desirous to raise any souls of the dead, 
ought to select those places wherein these kind of souls are most known to be conversant; 
or by some alliance alluring the souls into their forsaken bodies, or by some kind of 
affection in times past impressed in them in their life, drawing the souls to certain places, 
things, or persons; or by the forcible nature of some place fitted and prepared to purge or 
punish these souls: which places for the most part, are to be known by the appearance of 
visions, nightly incursions, and apparitions. 

Therefore the places most fitting for these things are church-yards. And better than them 
are those places devoted to the executions of criminal judgements; and better than these 
are those places where, of late years, there have been so great and so many public 
slaughters of men; and that place is still better than those where some dead carcass that 
came by violent death is not yet expiated, nor was lately buried; for the expiation of those 
places is likewise a holy rite duly to be adhibited to the burial of the bodies, and often 
prohibits the soul returning to its body, and expels the same afar off to the place of 
judgment. 

And from hence it is that the souls of the dead are not easy to be raised up, except it be 
the souls of them whom we know to be evil, or to have perished by a violent death, and 
whose bodies do want the rite of due burial. 

Now although we have spoken concerning such places of this kind, it will not be safe or 
commodious to go unto them; but it is requisite for us to take to whatsoever place is to be 
chosen some principal relict of the body, and therewith make a perfume in due manner, 
and to perform other competent rites. 

It is also to be known, that because the souls are certain spiritual lights, therefore artificial 
lights framed out of certain competent things, compounded according to a true rule, with 
congruent inscriptions of names and seals, do very much avail to the raising up of 



departed souls. But those things which are now spoken of are not always sufficient to 
raise up souls, because of an extra-natural portion of understanding and reason, which is 
above and known only to the heavenly destinies and their powers. 

We should therefore allure the said souls by supernatural and celestial powers duly 
administered, even by those things which do move the very harmony of the soul, as well 
imaginative as rational and intellectual, such as voices, Songs, sounds, enchantments; and 
religious things, as Prayers, conjurations, exorcisms, and other holy rites, which may 
commodiously be administered hereunto. 

END OF PART SECOND. 

 

Footnotes 

101:1 They who neglect licensing the spirits are in very great danger, because instances 
have been known of the operator experiencing sudden death. 
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OF THE 

PARTICULAR COMPOSITION 

OF THE 

MAGICAL CIRCLE; 

OF 

EXORCISMS, BENEDICTIONS, AND THE CONJURATIONS OF EVERY 
DAY IN THE WEEK; 

AND 

THE MANNER OF WORKING DESCRIBED. 

BOOK II. PART III. 

THE following instructions are the principal and sum total of all we have said, only we 
have brought it rather into a closer train of experiment and practice than any of the rest; 
for here you may behold the distinct functions of the spirits; likewise the whole 
perfection of magical ceremonies is here described, syllable by syllable. 

But as the greatest power is attributed to the circles, (for they are certain fortresses,) we 
will now clearly explain, and shew the composition and figure of a circle. 

  



  

The Composition of the CIRCLE.--(For the figure of the Circle see the Plate.) 

The forms of circles are not always one and the same, but are changed according to the 
order of spirits that are to be called, their places, times, days, and hours; for in making a 
circle it ought to be considered in what time of the year, what day, and what hour, what 
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spirits you would call, and to what star or region they belong, and what functions they 
have: therefore, to begin, let there be made three circles of the latitude of nine feet, 
distant one from another about a hand's breadth. First, write in the middle circle the name 
of the hour wherein you do the work; in the second place, write the name of the angel of 
the hour; in the third place, the seal of the angel of the hour; fourthly, the name of the 
angel that rules the day in which you work, and the names of his ministers; in the fifth 
place, the name of the present time; sixthly, the name of the spirits ruling in that part of 
time, and their presidents; seventhly, the name of the head of the sign ruling in the time; 
eighthly, the name of the earth, according to the time of working; ninthly, and for the 
compleating of the middle circle, write the name of the sun and moon, according to the 
said rule of time: for as the times are changed, so are the names: and in the outer circle let 
there be drawn, in the four angles, the names of the great presidential spirits of the air that 
day wherein you would do this work, viz. the name of the king and his three ministers. 
Without the circle, in four angles, let pentagons be made. In the inner circle write four 
divine names, with four crosses interposed: in the middle of the circle, viz. towards the 
east let be written Alpha; towards the west, Omega; and let a cross divide the middle of 
the circle. 

When the circle is thus finished, according to rule, you shall proceed to consecrate and 
bless it, saying, 

In the name of the holy, blessed, and glorious Trinity, proceed we to our work in these 
mysteries to accomplish that which we desire; we therefore, in the names aforesaid, 
consecrate this piece of ground for our defence, so that no spirit whatsoever shall be able 
to break these boundaries, neither be able to cause injury nor detriment to any of us here 
assembled; but that they may be compelled to stand before this circle, and answer truly 
our demands, so far as it pleaseth Him who liveth for ever and ever; and who says, I am 
Alpha and Omega, the Beginning and the End, which is, and which was, and which is to 
come, the Almighty; I am the First and the Last, who am living and was dead; and behold 
I live 



  

for ever and ever; and I have the keys of death and hell. Bless, O Lord! this creature of 
earth wherein we stand; confirm, O God! thy strength in us, so that neither the adversary 
nor any evil thing may cause us to fail, through the merits of Jesus Christ. Amen. 
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It is also to be known that the angels rule the hours in a successive order, according to the 
course of the heavens and the planets to which they are subject; so the same spirit which 
governeth the day rules also the first hour of the day; the second from this governs the 
second hour, and so on throughout; and when seven planets and hours have made their 
revolution it returns again to the first which rules the day. Therefore we shall first speak 
of the names of the hours, viz. 

  

A TABLE shewing the MAGICAL NAMES of the HOURS, both DAY and 
NIGHT. 

  Names of Hours of the Day.   Names of Hours of the 
Night. 

1 Yain 1 Beron 

2 Janor 2 Barol 

3 Nasnia 3 Thami 

4 Salla 4 Athar 

5 Sadedali 5 Methon 

6 Thamur 6 Rana 

7 Ourer 7 Netos 

8 Thamic 8 Tafrac 

9 Neron 9 Sassur 

10 Jayon 10 Agle 

11 Abai 11 Calerva 

12 Natalon. 12 Salam 

  

Of the names of the angels and their seals it shall be spoken in their proper places; but 
here we will shew the names of the times. 



A year therefore is four--fold, and is divided into spring, summer, autumn, and winter; 
the names thereof are these: The spring, Talvi; the summer, Casmaran; autumn, Adarcel; 
winter, Farlas. 

The ANGELS of the SPRING--Caracasa, Core, Amatiel, Commissoros. 
The head of the sign in spring is called Spugliguel. 
The name of the earth in spring, Amadai. 
The names of the sun and moon in spring: sun, Abraym; moon, Agusita. 

The ANGELS of the SUMMER--Gargatel, Tariel, Gaviel. 
The head of the sign of the summer, Tubiel. 
The name of the earth in summer, Festativi. 
The names of the sun and moon in summer: sun, Athemay; moon, Armatus. 

The ANGELS of the AUTUMN--Tarquam, Guabarel. 
The head of the sign of autumn, Torquaret. 
The name of the earth in autumn, Rabinnara. 
The names of the sun and moon in autumn: the sun, Abragini, the moon, Matasignais. 

The ANGELS of the WINTER--Amabael, Cetarari. 
The head of the sign of winter, Attarib. The name of the earth in winter, Geremiah. 
The names of the sun and moon in winter: the sun, Commutoff; the moon, Affaterim. 

These things being known, finish the consecration of the circle by saying, 

"Thou shalt purge me with hysop, O Lord, and I shall be clean: thou shalt wash me and I 
shall be whiter than snow." 

Then sprinkle the same with holy water, and proceed with the benediction of the 
perfumes. 

BENEDICTION of PERFUMES. 

THE God of Abraham, God of Isaac, God of Jacob, bless here the creatures of these 
kinds, that they may fill up the power and virtue of their odours; so that neither the enemy 
nor any false imagination may be able to enter into them; through our Lord Jesus Christ, 
&c. Then sprinkle the same with holy water. 

The EXORCISM of FIRE into which the PERFUMES are to be put. 

I EXORCISE thee, O thou creature of fire, by the only true God Jehovah, Adonai, 
Tetragrammaton, that forthwith thou cast away every phantasm from thee, that it shall do 
no hurt to any one. We beseech thee, O Lord, to bless this creature of fire, and sanctify it, 
so that it may be blessed to set forth the praise and glory of thy holy name, and that no 
hurt may be permitted to come to the exorciser or spectators; through our Lord Jesus 
Christ. Amen. 

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



Of the HABIT of the EXORCIST. 

IT should be made, as we have before described, of fine white linen and clean, and to 
come round the body loose, but close before and behind. 

Of the PENTACLE of SOLOMON.--(For the fig. see the Plate.) 

IT is always necessary to have this pentacle in readiness to bind with, in case the spirits 
should refuse to be obedient, as they can have no power over the exorcist while provided 
with and fortified by the pentacle, the virtue of the holy names therein written presiding 
with wonderful influence over the spirits. 

It should be made in the day and hour of Mercury upon parchment made of a kidskin, or 
virgin, or pure, clean, white paper; and the figures and letters wrote in pure gold; and it 
ought to be consecrated and sprinkled (as before often spoken) with holy water. 

When the vesture is put on, it will be convenient to say the following oration: 

An ORATION when the HABIT or VESTURE is put on. 

ANOOR, Amacor, Amides, Theodonias, Anitor; by the merits of the angels, O Lord! I 
will put on the garment of salvation, that this which I desire I may bring to effect, through 
thee, the most holy Adonai, whose kingdom endureth for ever and ever. Amen. 

The Manner of Working. 

LET the moon be increasing and equal, if it can then be conveniently done; but especially 
let her not be combust, or in Via Combusta, which is between fourteen degrees of Libra 
and fourteen degrees of Scorpio. 

The operator ought to be clean and purified for nine days before he does the work. Let 
him have ready the perfume appropriated to the day wherein he does the work; and he 
must be provided with holy water from a clergyman, or he may make it holy himself, by 
reading over it the consecration of water of baptism; he must have a new vessel of earth, 
with fire, the vesture, and the pentacle; and let all these things be rightly and duly 
consecrated and prepared. Let one of the companions carry the vessel with fire, and the 
perfumes, and let another bear the book, the garment, and pentacle; and let the operator 
himself carry the sword, over which should be said a prayer of consecration: and on the 
middle of the sword on one side let there be engraven Agla ? , and on the other side, ?  
On, ?  Tetragrammaton ? . And the place being fixed upon where the circle is to be 
erected, let him draw the lines we have before taught, and sprinkle the same with holy 
water, consecrating, &c. &c. 

The operator ought therefore to be prepared with fasting, chastity, and abstinence, for the 
space of three days before the day of operation; and on the day that he would do this 
work, being clothed with the fore-mentioned vesture, and furnished with pentacles, 



perfumes, a sword, bible, paper, pen, and consecrated ink, and all things necessary 
hereunto, let him enter the circle, and call the angels from the four parts of the world 
which do rule the seven planets, the seven days of the week, colours, and metals, whose 
names you will see in their places; and, with bended knees, first let him say the 
Paternoster or Lord's Prayer, and then let him invocate the said angels, saying, 

O angeli! supradicti estote adjutores mihi petitioni & in adjutorum mihi, in meis rebus et 
petitionibus. 

Then call the angels from the four parts of the world that rule the air the same day in 
which he makes the experiment; and, having employed especially all the names and 
spirits within the circle, say, 

O vos omnes, adjutore atque contestor per sedem Adonai, per Hagios, Theos, Ischyros, 
Athanatos, Paracletos, Alpha & Omega, & per hæc tria nomina secreta, Agla, On, 
Tetragrammaton, quod hodie debeatis adimplere quod cupio. 

These things being performed, let him read the conjuration assigned for the day; but if 
they shall be pertinacious or refractory, and will not yield themselves obedient, neither to 
the conjuration assigned for the day, nor any of the prayers before made, then use the 
exorcism following: 

A GENERAL EXORCISM of the SPIRITS of the AIR. 

WE being made after the image of God, endued with power from God and made after his 
will, do exorcise you, by the most mighty and powerful name of God, El, strong and 
wonderful, (here name the spirit which is to appear,) and we command you by Him who 
spoke the word and it was done, and by all the names of God, and by the name Adonai, 
El, Elohim, Elohe, Zebaoth, Elion, Eserchie, Jah, Tetragrammaton, Sadai, Lord God Most 
High: we exorcise you, and powerfully command you that you forthwith appear unto us 
here before this circle in a fair human shape, without any deformity or tortuosity; come 
ye all such, because we command you by the name Yaw and Vau, which Adam heard and 
spoke; and by the name of God, Agla, which Lot heard, and was saved with his family; 
and by the name Joth, which Jacob heard from the angel wrestling with him, and was 
delivered from the hand of his brother Esau; and by the name Anaphexeton, which Aaron 
heard and spoke, and was made wise; and by the name Zebaoth, which Moses named, 
and all the rivers were turned into blood; and by the name Eserchie Oriston, which Moses 
named, and all the rivers brought forth frogs, and they ascended into the houses of the 
Egyptians, destroying all things; and by the name Elion, which Moses named, and there 
was great hail, such as had not been since the beginning of the world; and by the name 
Adonai, which Moses named, and there came up locusts, which appeared upon the whole 
land of Egypt, and devoured all which the hail had left; and by the name Schema 
Amathia, which Joshua called upon, and the sun stayed his course; and by the name 
Alpha and Omega, which Daniel named, and destroyed Bel and slew the dragon; and in 
the name Emmanuel, which the three children, Sidrach, Misach, and Abednego, sung in 
the midst of the fiery furnace, and were delivered; and by the name Hagios; and by the 
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seal of Adonai; and by Ischyros, Athanatos, Paracletos; and by these three secret names, 
Agla, On, Tetragrammaton, I do adjure and contest you; and by these names, and by all 
the other names of the living and true God, our Lord Almighty, I exorcise and command 
you, by Him who spoke the word and it was done, to whom all creatures are obedient; 
and by the dreadful judgment of God; and by the uncertain sea of glass, which is before 
the divine Majesty, mighty and powerful; by the four beasts before the throne, having 
eyes before and behind; and by the fire round about his throne; and by the holy angels of 
heaven; by the mighty wisdom of God, we do powerfully exorcise you, that you appear 
here before this circle, to fulfil our will in all things which shall seem good unto us; by 
the seal of Baldachia, and by this name Primeumaton, which Moses named, and the earth 
opened and swallowed up Corah, Dathan, and Abiram: and in the power of that name 
Primeumaton, commanding the whole host of heaven, we curse you, and deprive you of 
your office, joy, and place, and do bind you in the depth of the bottomless pit, there to 
remain until the dreadful day of the last judgment; and we bind you into eternal fire, and 
into the lake of fire and brimstone, unless you forthwith appear before this circle to do 
our will therefore, come ye, by these names, Adonai, Zebaoth, Adonai, Amioram; come 
ye, come ye, come ye, Adonai commandeth; Saday, the most mighty King of Kings, 
whose power no creature is able to resist, be unto you most dreadful, unless ye obey, and 
forthwith affably appear before this circle, let miserable ruin and fire unquenchable 
remain with you; therefore come ye, in the name of Adonai, Zebaoth, Adonai, Amioram; 
come, come, why stay you? hasten! Adonai, Sadai, the King of Kings commands you: El, 
Aty, Titcip, Azia, Hin, Jen, Minosel, Achadan, Vay, Vaah, Ey, Exe, A, El, El, El, A, Hy, 
Hau, Hau, Hau, Vau, Vau, Vau, Vau. 

A PRAYER to GOD, to be said in the four Parts of the WORLD in the 
CIRCLE. 

AMORULE, Taneha, Latisten, Rabur, Teneba, Latisten, Escha, Aladia, Alpha and 
Omega, Leyste, Orision, Adonai; O most merciful heavenly Father! have mercy upon me, 
although a sinner; make appear the arm of thy power in me this day against these 
obstinate spirits, that 1, by thy will, may be made a contemplator of thy divine works, and 
may be illustrated with all wisdom, to the honour and glory of thy holy name. I humbly 
beseech thee, that these spirits which I call by thy judgment may be bound and 
constrained to come and give true and perfect answers to those things which I shall ask of 
them; and that they may do and declare those things unto us, which by me may be 
commanded of them, not hurting any creature, neither injuring or terrifying me or my 
fellows, nor hurting any other creature, and affrighting no man; and let them be obedient 
to those things which are required of them. Then, standing in the middle of the circle, 
stretch out thy hand towards the pentacle, saying, By the pentacle of Solomon I have 
called you; give me a true answer. 

Then follows this ORATION. 

BERALANENSIS, Baldachiensis, Paumachia, and Apologia Sedes, by the most mighty 
kings and powers, and the most powerful princes, genii, Liachidæ, ministers of the 
Tartarean seat, chief prince of the seat of Apologia, in the ninth legion, I invoke you, and 



by invocating, conjure you; and being armed with power from the supreme Majesty, I 
strongly command you, by Him who spoke and it was done, and to whom all creatures 
are obedient; and by this ineffable name, Tetragrammaton Jehovah, which being beard 
the elements are overthrown, the air is shaken, the sea runneth back, the fire is quenched, 
the earth trembles, and all the host of the celestials, and terrestrials, and infernals do 
tremble together, and are troubled and confounded: wherefore, forthwith and without 
delay, do you come from all parts of the world, and make rational answers unto all things 
I shall ask of you; and come ye peaceably, visibly and affably now, without delay, 
manifesting what we desire, being conjured by the name of the living and true God, 
Helioren, and fulfil our commands, and persist unto the end, and according to our 
intentions, visibly and affably speaking unto us with a clear voice, intelligible, and 
without any ambiguity. 

Of the APPEARANCE of the SPIRITS. 

THESE things being duly performed, there will appear infinite visions, apparitions, 
phantasms, &c. beating of drums, and the sound of all kinds of musical instruments; 
which is done by the spirits, that with the terror they might force some of the companions 
out of the circle, because they can effect nothing against the exorcist himself: after this 
you shall see an infinite company of archers, with a great multitude of horrible beasts, 
which will arrange themselves as if they would devour the companions; nevertheless, fear 
nothing. 

Then the exorcist, holding the pentacle in his hand, let him say, Avoid hence these 
iniquities, by virtue of the banner of God. Then will the spirits be compelled to obey the 
exorcist, and the company shall see them no more. 

Then let the exorcist, stretching out his hand with the pentacle, say, Behold the pentacle 
of Solomon, which I have brought into your presence; behold the person of the exorcist in 
the middle of the exorcism, who is armed by God, without fear, and well provided, who 
potently invocateth and calleth you by exorcising; come, therefore, with speed, by the 
virtue of these names; Aye Saraye, Aye Saraye; defer not to come, by the eternal names 
of the living and true God, Eloy, Archima, Rabur, and by the pentacle of Solomon here 
present, which powerfully reigns over you; and by the virtue of the celestial spirits, your 
lords; and by the person of the exorcist, in the middle of the exorcism: being conjured, 
make haste and come, and yield obedience to your master, who is called Octinomos. This 
being performed, immediately there will be hissings in the four parts of the world, and 
then immediately you shall see great motions; which when you see, say, Why stay you? 
Wherefore do you delay? What do you? Prepare yourselves to be obedient to your master 
in the name of the Lord, Bathat or Vachat rushing upon Abrac, Abeor coming upon 
Aberer. 

Then they will immediately come in their proper forms; and when you see them before 
the circle, shew them the pentacle covered with fine linen; uncover it, and say, Behold 
your confusion if you refuse to be obedient; and suddenly they will appear in a peaceable 

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



form, and will say, Ask what you will, for we are prepared to fulfil all your commands, 
for the Lord hath subjected us hereunto. 

Then let the exorcist say, Welcome spirits, or most noble princes, because I have called 
you through Him to whom every knee doth bow, both of things in heaven, and things in 
earth, and things under the earth; in whose hands are all the kingdoms of kings, neither is 
there any able to contradict his Majesty. Wherefore, I bind you, that you remain affable 
and visible before this circle, so long and so constant; neither shall you depart without my 
licence, until you have truly and without any fallacy performed my will, by virtue of his 
power who hath set the sea her bounds, beyond which it cannot pass, nor go beyond the 
law of his providence, viz. of the Most High God, Lord, and King, who hath created all 
things. Amen. 

Then let the exorcist mention what he would have done. 

After which say, In the name of the Father, and of the Son, and of the Holy Ghost, go in 
peace unto your places; peace be between us and you; be ye ready to come when you are 
called. (For the figures of the circle, pentacle, and other instruments, see the Plate.) 

Now, that you may have an idea of the manner of composing the circle, we have given 
the scheme of one for the first hour of the Lord's day, in spring. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Here follow the CONSIDERATIONS and CONJURATIONS for every Day in 
the Week; and first of 

The CONSIDERATIONS, &c. of SUNDAY. 

(For the figure of the seals, planets, signs, names of the angels of the several days, and 
names of the fourth heaven, with the characters and magic book, see the Plate.) 

THE angels of the Lord's day--Michael, Dardiel, Huratapel. 

The angels of the air ruling on the Lord's day, Varcan, king;--his ministers, Tus, Andas, 
Cynabal. 

The wind which the angels of the air are said to rule, is the north wind. 

The angels of the fourth heaven ruling on the Lord's day, which should be called from the 
four parts of the world, are,--east, Samael, Baciel, Abel, 

Gabriel, Vionatraba;--from the west, Anael, Pabel, Ustael, Burchat, Suceratos, 
Capabili;--from the north, Aiel, Ariel, vel Aquiel, Masgabriel, Saphiel, Matuyel,--at the 
south, Haludiel, Machasiel, Charsiel, Uriel, Naromiel. 

The perfume of Sunday is Red Sanders. 

The CONJURATION for SUNDAY. 

I CONJURE and confirm upon you, ye strong and holy angels of God, in the name 
Adonai, Eye, Eye, Eya, which is he who was, and is, and is to come, Eye, Abray; and in 
the name Saday, Cados, Cados, sitting on high upon the cherubim; and by the great name 
of God himself, strong and powerful, who is exalted above all the heavens; Eye, Saraye, 
who created the world, the heavens, the earth, the sea, and all that in them is, in the first 
day, and scaled them with his holy name Phaa; and by the name of the angels who rule in 
the fourth heaven, and serve before the most mighty Salamia, an angel great and 
honourable; and by the name of his star, which is Sol, and by his sign, and by the 
immense name of the living God, and by all the names aforesaid, I conjure thee, Michael, 
O great angel! who art chief ruler of this day; and by the name Adonai, the God of Israel, 
I conjure thee, O Michael! that thou labour for me, and fulfil all my petitions according to 
my will and desire in my cause and business. 

The spirits of the air of the Lord's day are under the north wind; their nature is to procure 
gold, gems, carbuncles, diamonds, and rubies, and to cause one to obtain favour and 
benevolence, to dissolve enmities amongst men, to raise to honours, and to take away 
infirmities. They appear, for the most part, in a large, full and great body, sanguine and 
cross, in a gold colour, with the tincture of blood. Their motion is like the lighting of 
heaven; the sign of their becoming visible is that they move the person to sweat that calls 
them; but their particular forms are as follows; viz. 
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A king, having a scepter, riding on a lion. 

A king crowned; a queen with a scepter. 

A bird; a lion; a cock. 

A yellow garment. 

A scepter. 

CONSIDERATIONS, &c. of MONDAY. 

(For the angel of Monday, his sigil, planet, sign of the planet, and name of the first 
heaven, see the Plate.) 

THE angels of Monday--Gabriel, Michael, Samael. 

The angels of the air ruling Monday, Arcan, king;--his ministers, Bilet, Missabu, 
Abuhaza. The wind which these are subject to is the west wind. 

The angels of the first heaven, ruling on Monday, to be called from the four parts of the 
world. From the east, Gabriel, Madiel, Deamiel, Janak;--from the west, Sachiel, Zaniel, 
Habiel, Bachanæ, Corobael;--from the north, Mael, Uvael, Valnum, Baliel, Balay, 
Humastraw;--from the south,--Curaniel, Dabriel, Darquiel, Hanun, Vetuel. 

The perfume of Monday--Aloes. 

The CONJURATION of MONDAY. 

I CONJURE and confirm upon you, ye strong and good angels, in the name Adonai, 
Adonai, Adonai, Adonai, Eye, Eye, Eye; Cados, Cados, Cados, Achim, Achim, Ja, Ja, 
strong Ja, who appeared in mount Sinai with the glorification of king Adonai, Sadai, 
Zebaoth, Anathay, Ya, Ya, Ya, Maranata, Abim, Jeia, who created the sea, and all lakes 
and waters, in the second day, which are above the heavens and in the earth, and scaled 
the sea in his high name, and gave it its bounds beyond which it cannot pass; and by the 
names of the angels who rule in the first legion, and who serve Orphaniel, a great, 
precious, and honourable angel, and by the name of his star which is Luna, and by all the 
names aforesaid, I conjure thee, Gabriel, who art chief ruler of Monday, the second day, 
that for me thou labour and fulfil, &c. 

The spirits of the air of Monday are subject to the west wind, which is the wind of the 
moon; their nature is to give silver and to convey things from place to place; to make 
horses swift, and to disclose the secrets of persons both present and future. 

 



Their familiar Forms are as follow: 

They appear generally of a great and full stature, soft and phlegmatic, of colour like a 
black, obscure cloud, having a swoln countenance, with eyes red and full of water, a bald 
head, and teeth like a wild boar; their motion is like an exceeding great tempest of the 
sea. For their sign there will appear an exceeding great rain,. and their particular shapes 
are, 

A king, like an archer, riding upon a doe. 

A little boy. 

A woman-hunter with a bow and arrows. 

A cow; a little doe; a goose. 

A green, or silver-coloured garment. 

An arrow; a creature with many feet. 

CONSIDERATIONS of TUESDAY. 

(For the angel of Tuesday, his sigil, planet, sign governing the planet, and name of the 
fifth heaven, see the Plate.) 

THE angels of the air on Tuesday--Samael, Satael, Amabiel. 

The angels of the air ruling on Tuesday, Samax, king; his Ministers, Carmax, Ismoli, 
Paffran. 

The wind to which the said angels are subject is the east wind. 

The angels of the fifth heaven ruling on Tuesday.-At the east, Guel, Damael, Calzas, 
Arragon;--the west, Lama, Astagna, Lobquin, Soneas, Jazel, Isiael, Irel;--the north, 
Rhaumel, Hyniel, Rayel, Seraphiel, Fraciel Maithiel;--the south, Sacriel, Janiel, Galdel, 
Osael, Vianuel, Zaliel. 

The perfume of Tuesday--Pepper. 

 

 

The CONJURATION of TUESDAY. 

I CONJURE and call upon you, ye strong and good angels, in the names Ya, Ya, Ya; He, 
He, He; Va, Hy, Hy, Ha, Ha, Ha; Va, Va, Va; An, An, An; Aia, Aia, Aia; El, Ay, Elibra, 
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Elohim, Elohim; and by the names of the high God, who hath made the sea and dry land, 
and by his word hath made the earth, and produced trees, and hath set his seal upon the 
planets, with his precious, honoured, revered and holy name; and by the name of the 
angels governing in the fifth house, who are subservient to the great angel Acimoy, who 
is strong, powerful, and honoured, and by the name of his star which is called Mars, I call 
upon thee, Samael, by the names above mentioned, thou great angel! who presides over 
the day of Mars, and by the name Adonai, the living and true God, that you assist me in 
accomplishing my labours, &c. (as in the conjuration of Sunday.). 

The spirits of the air on Tuesday are under the east wind; their nature is to bring or cause 
war, mortality, death, combustions, and to give two-thousand soldiers at a time; to bring 
death, infirmity or health. 

Familiar Forms of the SPIRITS of MARS. 

THEY appear in a tall body and choleric, a filthy countenance, of colour brown, swarthy, 
or red, having horns like harts, and griffins claws, and bellowing like wild bulls. Their 
motion is like fire burning: their sign thunder and lightning round about the circle. 

Their particular shapes are, a king armed, riding on a wolf; a man armed. 

A woman with a buckler on her thigh. 

A she-goat; a horse; a stag. 

A red garment; a piece of wool; a cowslip. 

CONSIDERATIONS of WEDNESDAY. 

(For the angel of Wednesday his sigil, &c. &c. see the Plate.) 

THE angels of Wednesday--Raphael, Meil, Seraphiel. 

The angels of the air ruling on Wednesday, Mediat, king; Ministers, Suquinos, Sallales; 
the said angels of the air are subject to the south-west wind. 

The angels of the second heaven, governing Wednesday, that are to be called, &c. At the 
east--Mathlai, Tarmiel, Baraborat--at the west, Jeruscue, Merattron;--at the north, Thiel, 
Rael, Jarihael, Venahel, Velel, Abuiori, Ucirmiel--at the south, Milliel, Nelapa, Calvel, 
vel Laquel. 

The perfume of Wednesday--Mastic. 

 

 



The CONJURATION of WEDNESDAY. 

I CONJURE and call upon you, ye strong and holy angels, good and powerful, in a strong 
name of fear and praise, Ja, Adonay, Elohim, Saday, Saday, Saday; Eie, Eie, Eie; 
Asamie, Asamie; and in the name of Adonay, the God of Israel, who hath made the two 
great lights, and distinguished day from night for the benefit of his creatures; and by the 
names of all the discerning angels, governing openly in the second house before the great 
angel, Tetra, strong and powerful; and by the name of his star which is Mercury; and by 
the name of his seal, which is that of a powerful and honoured God; and I call upon thee, 
Raphael, and by the names above mentioned, thou great angel who presidest over the 
fourth day: and by the holy name which is written in the front of Aaron, created the most 
high priest, and by the names of all the angels who are constant in the grace of Christ, and 
by the name and place of Ammaluim, that you assist me in my labours, &c. &c. 

The spirits of the air, on Wednesday are subject to the south-west wind; their nature is to 
give all sorts of metals, to reveal all earthly things past, present, and to come; to pacify 
judges, to give victory in war, to teach experiments and all sciences decayed, and to 
change bodies mixt of elements, conditionally, out of one thing into another; to give 
health or infirmities, to raise the poor and cast down the rich, to bind or loose spirits, to 
open locks or bolts. 

Such kinds of spirits have the operations of others, but not in their perfect power, but in 
virtue or knowledge. 

Forms of the SPIRITS of MERCURY. 

THE spirits of Mercury appear in a body of a middle stature, cold, liquid and moist, fair 
and of an affable speech in a human shape and form, like a knight armed, of colour clear 
and bright. The motion of them is like silver coloured' clouds: for their sign they cause 
horror and fear to him that calls them. 

Their particular shapes are, a king riding upon a bear. 

A fair youth; a woman holding a distaff. 

A dog, a she-bear, and a magpye. 

A garment of various changeable colours. 

A rod, a little staff. 

CONSIDERATIONS of THURSDAY. 

(For the angel of Thursday, his sigil, &c. see the Plate.) 

THE angels of Thursday--Sachiel, Cassiel, Asasiel. 
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The angels of the air of Thursday, Suth, king; Ministers, Maguth, Gutrix. 

The angels of the air are under the south-wind.--(But because there are no angels of the 
air to be found above the fifth heaven, therefore, on Thursday, say the prayers following 
in the four parts of the world: ) 

At the east--O Deus magne et excelse et honorate, per infinita secula; or, O great and 
most high God, honoured be thy name, world without end. 

At the west--O wise, pure, and just God, of divine clemency, I beseech thee, most holy 
Father, that this day I may perfectly understand and accomplish my petition, work, and 
labour; for the honour and glory of thy holy name, who livest and reignest, world without 
end. Amen. 

At the north--O God, strong, mighty, and wonderfuly from everlasting to everlasting, 
grant that this day I bring to effect that which I desire, through our blessed Lord. Amen. 

At the south--O mighty and most merciful God, hear my prayers and grant my petition. 

The perfume of Thursday--Saffron. 

The CONJURATION of THURSDAY. 

I CO NJ U RE and confirm upon you, ye strong and holy angels, by the names Cados, 
Cados, Cados, Eschercie, Escherei, Eschercie, Hatim, Ya, strong founder of the worlds; 
Cantine, Jaym, Janic, Anic, Calbot, Sabbac, Berisay, Alnaym; and by the name Adonai, 
who created fishes and creeping things in the waters, and birds upon the face of the earth, 
flying towards heaven, in the fifth day; and by the names of the angels serving in the 
sixth host before Pastor, a holy angel, and a great and powerful prince and by the name of 
his star, which is Jupiter, and by the name of his seal, and by the name of Adonai, the 
great God, Creator of all things, and by the name of all the stars, and by their power and 
virtue, and by all the names aforesaid, I conjure thee, Sachiel, a great Angel, who art 
chief ruler of Thursday, that for me thou labour, &c. 

The spirits of the air of Thursday are subject to the south wind; their nature is to procure 
the love of women, to cause men to be merry and joyful, to pacify strifes and contentions, 
to appease, enemies, to heal the diseased, and to disease the whole, and procure losses, or 
restore things lost. 

 

 

 

 



The familiar Forms of the SPIRITS of JUPITER. 

They appear with a body sanguine and choleric, of a middle stature, with a horrible, 
fearful motion, but with a mild countenance, and a gentle speech, and of the colour of 
iron: the motion of them is flashings of lightning, and thunder. For their sign there will 
appear about the circle men who shall seem to be devoured by lions. Their forms are, 

A king, with a sword drawn, riding on a stag. 

A man, wearing a mitre, with long raiment. 

A maid, with a laurel crown, adorned with flowers. 

A bull; a stag; a peacock. 

An azure garment; a sword; a box-tree, 

CONSIDERATIONS of FRIDAY. 

(For the seal planet, and sign governing the planet, and name of the third heaven, see the 
Plate.) 

THE angels of Friday--Anael, Rachiel, Sachiel. 

The angels of the air ruling on Friday, Sarabotes, king; Ministers, Amahiel, Aba, 
Abalidoth, Blaef. The wind which the angels of the air are subject to is the west wind. 

Angels of the third heaven, which are to be called from the four parts of the world, are 

At the east, Setchiel, Chedusilaniel, Corat, Tamuel, Tenaciel;--at the west, Turiel, Coniel, 
Babiel, Kadie, Maltiel, Huphaltiel;--at the north, Peniel, Penael, Penat, Raphael, Ranie, 
Doremiel;--at the south, Porosa, Sachiel, Chermiel, Samael, Santanael, Famiel. 

The perfume of Friday--Pepperwort. 

The CONJURATION of FRIDAY. 

I CONJURE and confirm upon you, ye strong and holy angels, by the names On, Hey, 
Heya, Ja, Je, Saday, Adonai, and in the name Sadai, who created four-footed beasts, and 
creeping things, and man, in the sixth day, and gave to Adam. power over all creatures; 
wherefore blessed be the name of the Creator in his place; and by the name of the angels 
serving in the third host, before Dagiel, a great angel, and a strong and powerful prince, 
and by the name of his star, which is Venus, and by his seal which is holy; and by all the 
names aforesaid, I conjure upon thee, Anael, who art the chief ruler this day, that thou 
labour for me, &c. 
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The spirits of the air on Friday are subject to the west wind: their nature is to give silver, 
to incite men, and incline them to luxury, to cause marriages, to allure men to love 
women, to cause or take away infirmities, and to do all things which have motion. 

Their familiar Shapes. 

They appear with a fair body, of middle stature, with an amiable and pleasant 
countenance, of colour white or green, their upper parts golden; the motion of them is 
like a clear star. For their sign there will appear naked virgins round the circle, which will 
strive to allure the invocator to dalliance with them: but 

Their particular Shapes are, 

A king, with a scepter, riding on a camel. 

A naked girl; a she-goat. 

A camel; a dove. 

A white or green garment. 

Flowers; the herb savine. 

The CONSIDERATIONS of SATURDAY. 

(For seal, &c. &c. see the Plate.) 

THE angels of Saturday--Cassiel, Machatan, Uriel. 

The angels of the air ruling this day, Maymon, king; Ministers, Abumalith, Assaibi, 
Balidet. The wind they are subject to, the south wind. 

The fumigation of Saturday is sulphur. 

There are no angels ruling in the air on Saturday above the fifth heaven, therefore in the 
four corners of the world, in the circle, use those orations which are applied to Thursday. 

The CONJURATION of SATURDAY. 

I CONJURE and confirm upon you, Caphriel, or Cassiel, Machator, and Seraquiel, strong 
and powerful angels; and by the name Adonai, Adonai, Adonai; Eie, Eie, Eie; Acim, 
Acim, Acim; Cados, Cados; Ima, Ima, Ima; Salay, Ja, Sar, Lord and Maker of the World, 
who rested on the seventh day; and by him who of his good pleasure gave the same to be 
observed by the children of Israel throughout their generations, that they should keep and 
sanctify the same, to have thereby a good reward in the world to conic; and by the names 
of the angels serving in the seventh host, before Booel, a great angel, and powerful 



prince; and by the name of his star, which is Saturn; and by his holy seal, and by the 
names before spoken, I conjure upon thee, Caphriel, who art chief ruler of the seventh 
day, which is the Sabbath, that for me thou labour, &c. &c. 

The spirits of the air on Saturday are subject to the south-west wind: the nature of them is 
to sow discords, hatred, evil thoughts and cogitations, to give leave to kill and murder, 
and to lame or maim every member. 

Their familiar Shapes. 

THEY generally appear with a tall, lean, slender body, with an angry countenance, 
having four faces, one on the back of the head, one in the front, and one on each side, 
nosed or beaked, likewise there appears a face on each knee of a black shining colour; 
their motion is the moving of the wind, with a kind of earthquake; their sign is white 
earth, whiter than snow. 

Their particular Shapes are, 

 A king, bearded, riding on a dragon. 

An old man with a beard. 

An old woman leaning on a crutch. 

A hog; a dragon; an owl. 

A black garment; a hook or sickle. 

A juniper tree. 

Those are the figures that these spirits usually assume, which are generally, terrible at the 
first coming on of the visions, but as they have only a limited power, beyond which they 
cannot pass, so the invocator need be under no apprehensions of danger, provided he is 
well fortified with those things we have directed to be used for his defence, and above all, 
to have a firm and constant faith in the mercy, wisdom, and goodness of God. 

END OF THE THIRD PART, AND OF CABALISTICAL AND CEREMONIAL MAGIC. 

Footnotes 

127:1 Those spirits who appear in a kingly form, have a much higher dignity than them 
who take an inferior shape; and those who appear in a human shape, exceed in authority 
and power them that come as animals; and again, these latter surpass in dignity them who 
appear as trees or instruments, and the like: so that you are to judge of the power, 
government, and authority of spirits by their assuming a more noble and dignified 
apparition. 
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THE 

MAGIC AND PHILOSOPHY 

OF 

TRITHEMIUS OF SPANHEIM. 

The Translator's LETTER to a FRIEND of his, a young Student in these occult 
Sciences. 

    MY FRIEND, 

KNOWING thee to be a curious searcher after those sciences which are out of the 
common track of study, (I mean the art of foretelling events, magic, telismans, &c.) I am 
moved spiritually to give thee my thoughts upon them, and by these ideas here written, to 
open to thine eye (spiritual) as much information as it seems necessary for thee to know, 
by. which thou mayest be led by the hand into the delectable field of nature; and to give 
thee such documents as, guided by the supreme wisdom of the Highest, thou mayest 
refresh thy soul with a delicious draught of knowledge; so that after recreating thy spirit 
with the use of those good gifts which may please God to bestow on thee, thou mayest be 
wrapped up into the contemplation of the immense wisdom of that great munificent 
Being who created thee. 

Now, art thou a man, in whose soul the image of Divinity is sealed for eternity, think first 
what is thy desire in the searching after these mysteries! Is it wealth, honour, fame, 
power, might, aggrandizement, and the like? Perhaps thy heart says, All! all these I would 
gladly crave! If so, this is my answer,--seek first to know thyself thoroughly, cleanse thy 
heart from all wicked, vain, and rapacious desires. Thinkest thou, oh man! to attain power 
to gratify thy lusts, to enrich thy coffers, to build houses, to raise thyself to the pinnacle of 
human admiration; if these are thy hopes and desires, thou hast reason to lament thy 
being born: all such desires are immediately from the devil, I mean that Being whose 
engines (i. e. myriads of demons) are continually in the act of placing sensual delights 
and luxuries before the depraved minds and hearts of man, and whose chief business and 
property it is to counteract the benevolent actions and inspirations of those blessed spirits 
who are the instruments of God our Creator. 

Fear God and love thy neighbour; use no deceit, swear not, neither lye; let all thy actions 
be sincere. Here, O man! is the grand seal of all earthly wisdom, the true talisman of 
human happiness. When thou shalt accomplish this, behold nothing will be impossible 
unto thee as far as God permits: then with all speed apply thy mind and heart to attain 
knowledge and wisdom; with all humility throw thy dependence on God alone, the author 
of all things that cannot die. 

To know thyself is to know God, for it is a spiritual gift from God that enables a man to 
know himself. This gift but very few possess, as may be daily seen. How many are there 
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tossed about to and fro' upon the perilous sea of contending passions, and who are more 
light than feathers! how many in this great city who place their chiefest good in 
debauchery and letchery! See their actions, manners, and dispositions; these poor, 
unfortunate, miserable wretches, such is their fatal magical infatuation and ignorance, 
that they think those mad who might even attempt to reason with them on the vanity and 
misery of their situation. To make myself more intelligible, these are what the world calls 
men of fashion, a phrase insignificant enough when we consider that the universal 
fashion of this time is vice, and that so glaring, that it needs no great intellect to discover 
what is daily open to the view of the observer. But to you, my friend, I have addressed 
these lines; therefore let it not be supposed that I am reprehending my friend for vices 
which I cannot suppose him attached to: for I know thou art a young man designed for 
the receiving of instruction, in much higher and more glorious contemplations than those 
sons of earth are capable of, therefore I have presented thee with this translation which 
thou didst desire me to give thee. 

But beware of flattery, self-love, and covetousness, so wilt thou thrive; and be diligent in 
thy occupation, so shall thy body be fed. Idleness is offensive to the Deity, industry shall 
sweeten thy brown bread, and the fruits of it shall warm thine heart, and inspire thy soul 
with gratitude to him that blesses thee with enough: seek for no more, for it will damn 
thee; pray for enough to feed and clothe thy body, but ask no more, lest thou pine away in 
heart-rending poverty, and spend the remainder of thy days in contumely and beggary. 
For know a thing most necessary for thee to know, that if by thy study, by thy art, or any 
other thing, thou couldst command a million of spirits, it should not be lawful for thee to 
wish to gain riches suddenly, for the Wisdom Eternal has put forth the fiat; and it has 
been said by him who never spoke in vain, and who cannot lye, that man shall get bread 
by the sweat of his brow; therefore let us not have in view the enriching of ourselves in 
worldly goods, by supernatural means, or by a greedy desiring of what we ought to look 
upon with eyes of contempt, draw upon us the wrath of God. Rather let us cheerfully rely 
on, and follow in very deed, spirit and truth, these words of the apostle, Seek ye first the 
kingdom of God, and all these things shall be added unto you fear not but that God shall 
make thy household as a flourishing tree, and thy wife shall be as a fruitful vine. 
Farewell, remember my poor counsel, and be happy. From thy true friend, F. B. 

N. B. To enable thee the better to comprehend this Book, I have drawn out the various 
figures, of which mention is made in this work, that thou mayest see the very exact 
method of working; likewise the images of seals, spirits, and various other rare, and 
curious instruments, which are necessary for thee to know and see with the eye; therefore 
in the construction of them thou canst not be liable to error. 

Fig. I. The form of the crystal for invocating spirits, with the plate of pure gold. in which 
the crystal must be fastened, with the divine characters around. 

Fig 2. A magical circle (C D E F), of a simple construction, for the operator to stand or sit 
in when he calleth the spirits. 



Fig. 3. The crystal (A), two silver or other candlesticks (G G,) with the wax tapers 
burning, and tripod or vessel for the oderiferous suffumigation. 

Fig 4. A wand of black ebony with golden characters. The characters are explained. 
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A CAUTION to the inexperienced in this ART, and a Word of Advice to those 
who would be Adepts. 

    BROTHER, 

IT is necessary for me to inform thee, that whatever thy desires are in the pursuit of this 
art, which we call Magic, so wilt thy connexion and answer be. If in the pursuit of 
revenge, it is but proper thou shouldest know that thou wilt, in any of these experiments 
here laid down, draw to thyself a revengeful demon, or an infernal furious spirit, serving 
in the principle of the wrath of God; if worldly riches and aggrandizement, then shalt 
thou have an earthial or fiery spirit, which will delude thee with the riches of the central 
world; if fame, or the blaze of glory, then the spirits of pride will be allotted thee, who 
will gratify thy inordinate desire of vain glory; for all these offices are there spirits 
allotted and will be eager to mix with thy spirit: it will attract thee to his own nature, and 
serve all thy purposes according to the extent of God's permission; and as thy desires are 
and from what principle they proceed, so shalt thou be answered: but if thou desirest to 
know nothing but for the honour and glory of God, and the help of thy neighbour, and, in 
great humility, fill thy heart with the love of God, thou shalt then have a pure spirit which 
will grant (by the Lord's permission) they desires. Therefore seek for that which is good; 
avoid all evil either in thought, word, or action; pray to God to fill thee with wisdom, and 
then thou shalt reap an abundant harvest. There are two ways magically set before thee; 
chuse which thou wilt, thou shalt be sure of thy reward. Farewel. 

F. B. 

London, 1800. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Of the making of the CRYSTAL and the Form of Preparation for a VISION. 

PROCURE of a lapidary good clear pellucid crystal, of the bigness of a small orange, i. c. 
about one inch and a half in diameter; let it be globular or round each way alike; then, 
when you have got this crystal, fair and clear, without any clouds or specks, get a small 
plate of pure gold to encompass the crystal round one half; let this be fitted on an ivory or 
ebony pedestal, as you may see more fully described in the drawing, (see the Plate, fig. I.) 
Let there be engraved a circle (A) round the crystal with these characters around inside 

the circle next the crystal ; afterwards the name 
"Tetragrammaton". On the other side of the plate let there be engraven "Michael, 
Gabriel, Uriel, Raphael;" which are the four principal angels ruling over the Sun, Moon, 
Venus and Mercury; but on the table on which the crystal stands the following names, 
characters, &c. must be drawn in order. 

First, The names of the seven planets and angels ruling them, with their seals or 
characters. The names of the four kings of the four corners of the earth. Let them be all 
written within a double circle, with a triangle on a table; on which place the crystal on its 
pedestal: this being. done, thy table is complete (as in the Fig. D,) and fit for the calling 
of the spirits; after which thou shalt proceed to experiment, thus: 

In what time thou wouldest deal with the spirits by the table and crystal, thou must 
observe the planetary hour; and whatever planet rules in that hour, the angel governing 
the planet thou shalt call in the manner following; but first, say this short prayer: 

"Oh, God! who art the author of all good things, strengthen, I beseech thee, thy poor 
servant, that he may stand fast, without fear, through this dealing and work; enlighten, I 
beseech thee, oh Lord! the dark understanding of thy creature, so that his spiritual eye 
may be opened to see and know thy angelic spirits descending here in this crystal: (Then 
lay thy hand on the crystal saying,) and thou, oh inanimate creature of God, be sanctified 
and consecrated, and blessed to this purpose, that no evil phantasy may appear in thee; or, 
if they do gain ingress into this, creature, they may be constrained to speak intelligibly, 
and truly, and without the least ambiguity, for Christ's sake. Amen. And forasmuch as thy 
servant here standing before thee, oh, Lord! desires neither evil treasures, nor injury to 
his neighbour, nor hurt to any living creature, grant him the power of descrying those 
celestial spirits or intelligences, that may appear in this crystal, and whatever good gifts 
(whether the power of healing infirmities, or of imbibing wisdom, or discovering any evil 
likely to afflict any person or family, or any other good gift thou mayest be pleased to 
bestow on me, enable me, by thy wisdom and mercy, to use whatever I may receive to the 
honour of thy holy name. Grant this for thy son Christ's sake. Amen." 

Then taking your ring and pentacle, put the ring on the little finger of your right hand; 
hang the pentacle round thy neck; (Note, the pentacle may be either wrote on clean virgin 
parchment, or engraven on a square plate of silver and suspended from thy neck to the 
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breast), then take your black ebony wand, with the gilt characters on it and trace the 
circle, (Fig. 7. C D E F,) saying, "In the name of the blessed Trinity, I consecrate this 
piece of ground for our defence; so that no evil spirit may have power to break these 
bounds prescribed here, through Jesus Christ our Lord." Amen. 

Then place the vessel for the perfumes between thy circle and the holy table on which the 
crystal stands, and, having fire therein, cast in thy perfumes, saying, 

"I conjure thee, oh thou creature of fire! by him who created all things both in heaven and 
earth, and in the sea, and in every other place whatever, that forthwith thou cast away 
every phantasm from thee, that no hurt whatsoever shall be done in any thing. Bless, oh 
Lord, this creature of fire, and sanctify it that it may be blessed, and that they may fill tip 
the power and virtue of their odours; so neither the enemy, nor any false imagination, 
may enter into them, through our Lord Jesus Christ. Amen." 

Now, this being done in the order prescribed, take out thy little book, which must be 
made about seven inches long, of pure white virgin vellum or paper, likewise pen and ink 
must be ready to write down the name, character, and office, likewise the seal or image 
of whatever spirit may appear (for this I must tell you that it does not happen that the 
same spirit you call will always appear, for you must try the spirit to know whether he be 
a pure or impure being, and this thou shalt easily know by a firm and undoubted faith in 
God.) 

Now the most pure and simple way of calling the spirits or spirit is by a short oration to 
the spirit himself, which is more effectual and easy to perform than composing a table of 
letters; for all celestial operations, the more pure and unmixed they are, the more they are 
agreable to the celestial spirits: therefore, after the circle is drawn, the book, perfumes, 
rod, &c. in readiness, proceed as follows: 

(After noticing the exact hour of the day, and what angel rules that hour, thou shalt say,) 

"In the name of the blessed and holy Trinity, I do desire thee, thou strong and mighty 
angel  1, Michæl, that if it be the divine will of him who is called Tetragrammaton, &c. 
the Holy God, the Father, that thou take upon thee some shape as best becometh thy 
celestial nature, and appear to us visibly here in this crystal, and answer our demands in 
as far as we shall not transgress the bounds of the divine mercy and goodness, by 
requesting unlawful knowledge; but that thou wilt graciously shew us what things are 
most profitable for us to know and do, to the glory and honour of his divine Majesty, who 
liveth and reigneth, world without end. Amen. 

"Lord, thy will be done on earth, as it is in heaven;--make clean our hearts within us, and 
take not thy Holy Spirit from us. 

"O Lord, by thy name, we have called him, suffer him to administer unto us. And that all 
things may work together for thy honour and glory, to whom with thee, the Son, and 
blessed Spirit, be ascribed all might, majesty and dominion. Amen." 



Note, In these dealings, two should always be present; for often a spirit is manifest to one 
in the crystal when the other cannot perceive him; therefore if any spirit appear, as there 
most likely will, to one or both, say, 

"Oh, Lord! we return thee our hearty and sincere thanks for the hearing of our prayer, and 
we thank thee for having permitted thy spirit to appear unto us which we, by thy mercy, 
will interrogate to our further instruction, through Christ. Amen." 

Interrog. 1. In the name of the holy and undefiled Spirit, the Father, the begotten Son, and 
Holy Ghost, proceeding from both, what is thy true name? 

If the spirit answers, Michael, then proceed. 

Quest. 2. What is thy office? 3. What is thy true sign or character? 4. When are the times 
most agreeable to thy nature to hold conference with us? 

Wilt thou swear by the blood and righteousness of our Lord Jesus Christ, that thou art 
truly Michael? 

(Here let him swear, then write down his seal or character in thy book, and against it, his 
office and times to be called, through God's name; also write down any thing he may 
teach thee, or any responses he may make to thy questions or interrogations, concerning 
life or death, arts or sciences, or any other thing;) and then shalt thou say, "Thou great 
and mighty spirit, inasmuch as thou camest in peace and in the name of the ever blessed 
and righteous Trinity, so in this name thou mayest depart, and return to us when we call 
thee in his name to whom every knee doth bow down. Fare thee well, Michael; peace be 
between us, through our blessed Lord Jesus Christ. Amen." 

Then will the spirit depart; then say, "To God the Father, eternal Spirit, fountain of Light, 
the Son, and Holy Ghost, be all honour and glory, world without end. Amen." 

I shall here set down the Table of the names of Spirits and Planets governing the Hours; 
so thou shalt easily know by inspection, what Spirit and Planet governs every Hour of the 
Day and Night in the Week. 
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Note, The day is divided into twelve equal parts, called Planetary Hours, reckoning from 
sun-rise to sun-set, and, again, from the setting to the rising; and to find the planetary 
hour, you need but to divide the natural hours by twelve, and the quotient gives the length 
of the planetary hours and odd minuets, which shews you how long a spirit bears rule in 
that day. as Michael governs the first and the eighth hour on Sunday, as does the ? . After 
you have the length of the first hour, you have only to look in the Table, as if it be the 
fourth hour, on Sunday, you see in the Table that the ?  and Gabriel rules; and so for the 
rest it being so plain and easy you cannot err. 

THE CONCLUSION OF THE MAGUS. 

 

Footnotes 

137:1 Or any other angel or spirit. 

 

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

��

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�



ADVERTISEMENT. 

THE Author of this Work respectfully informs those who are curious in the studies of Art and Nature, 
especially of Natural and Occult Philosophy, Chemistry, Astrology, &c. &c. that, having been indefatigable 
in his researches into those sublime Sciences, of which he has treated at large in this Book, that he gives 
private instructions and lectures upon any of the above mentioned Sciences; in the course of which he will 
discover many curious and rare experiments. Those who become Students will be initiated into the choicest 
operations of Natural Philosophy, Natural Magic, the Cabala, Chemistry, the Talismanic Art, Hermetic 
Philosophy, Astrology, Physiognomy, &c. &c. Likewise they will acquire the knowledge of the Rites, 
Mysteries, Ceremonies, and Principles of the ancient Philosophers, Magi, Cabalists, Adepts, &c.--The 
purpose of this School (which will consist of no greater number than Twelve Students) being to investigate 
the hidden treasures of Nature; to bring the Mind to a Contemplation of the Eternal Wisdom; to promote 
the discovery of whatever may conduce to the perfection of Man,. the alleviating the miseries and 
calamities of this life, both in respect of ourselves and others; the study of morality and religion here, in 
order to secure to ourselves felicity hereafter; and, finally, the Promulgation of whatever may conduce to 
the general happiness and welfare of mankind.--Those who feel themselves thoroughly disposed to enter 
upon such a course of studies, as is above recited, with the same principles of philanthropy with which the 
Author invites the lovers of Philosophy and wisdom, to incorporate themselves in so select, permanent, and 
desirable a society, may speak with the Author upon the subject, tit any time between the hours of Eleven 
and Two o'clock, at 99 Norton Street, Mary-le-Bonne. 

Letters (post paid) upon any subject treated of in this Book, will be duly answered, with the necessary 
information. 

 


